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Court File No. CV-21-00661928-00CL 
ONTARIO 

SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 
(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

B E T W E E N: 

DODICK LANDAU INC. 
Applicant 

and 

FRANK ZUCCARO, 863704 ONTARIO LIMITED, METROPOLITAN ICE CREAM INC. AND 
ORACCUZ HOLDING LTD. 

Respondents 

APPLICATION UNDER SUBSECTION 249 and 250(1) OF THE BANKRUPTCY AND 
INSOLVENCY ACT, R.S.C. 1985, c. B-3, AS AMENDED AND RULES 14.05(2) AND (3)(g) 

AND 41 OF THE RULES OF CIVIL PROCEDURE, R.R.O. 1990  

NOTICE OF MOTION 
APPROVAL AND VESTING ORDER, APPROVE RECEIVER’S 

ACTIVITES AND FEES, APPROVE DISTRIBUTION) 
(MOTION RETURNABLE ____, 2021) 

DODICK LANDAU INC. in its capacity as Receiver (in such capacity, the “Receiver”) of the assets, 

undertakings and properties of Frank Zuccaro, 863704 Ontario Limited, Metropolitan ice Cream Inc. 

and Oraccuz Holdings Ltd. (the “Debtor”) will make a motion to a Judge presiding over the Commercial 

List on                          , 2021 at                      a.m., or as soon after that time as the motion can be heard 

by Zoom videoconference. due to the Covid-19 pandemic. Please refer to the Conference details attached 

as Schedule “A” hereto in order to attend the hearing and advise if you intend to join the hearing by e-

mailing Wendy Greenspoon-Soer at wgreenspoon@garfinkle.com. 

PROPOSED METHOD OF HEARING: The motion is to be heard by videoconference. 
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THE MOTION IS FOR: 
1. An Order validating service of the Notice of Motion, the Motion Record and the First Report of

the Receiver dated May 18, 2021 (the “Receiver’s First Report”); 

2. An Order approving the transaction contemplated by the Agreement of Purchase and Sale dated

March 5th, 2021 and amended March 29th, 2021 (the “Sale Agreement”) between the Receiver, as vendor, 

and Ashiana Capital Corporation, as Purchaser (the “Purchaser”), and vesting title in and to the 

Purchased Assets in favour of the Purchaser, free and clear of the interest of any other party or interest, 

save and except for the Permitted Encumbrances (the “Approval and Vesting Order”), all in accordance 

with the Sale Agreement; 

3. The Court’s approval of the sealing of the unredacted copy of the Sale Agreement, as well as

the CBRE Reporting Letter, and the Appraisal (as such terms are defined in the Receiver’s First 

Report to Court), which are attached hereto as Confidential Appendices “1”, “2” and “3”, 

respectively, until after the closing of the Sale Transaction. The Receiver is requesting an Order 

sealing these appendices as these documents contain sale information that could taint the market in 

the event the Sale Transaction does not close and the Densley Property is remarketed; 

4. An Order authorizing and directing the Receiver to make the following distributions upon the

closing of the transaction: 

(i) The amount of $1,691,685.77 to Equitable Bank (“Equitable”), subject to nominal 

closing adjustments; 

(ii) The amount of $265,624.80 to Hillmount Capital Inc. (“Hillmount”), subject to 

nominal closing adjustments; 

(iii) The amount of $70,001.67 to Maria Zuccaro for the period to September 24, 2020; 

together with accrued interest; 

(iv) Ongoing Spousal Payments, as defined in the Receiver’s First Report to Court; and 

(v) The amount of $24,000.00 to Maria Zuccaro for the cost order made November 16, 

2020, together with accrued interest. 

2



5. Approving the fees and disbursements of the Receiver for the period from October 28, 2020 to

May 5, 2021; 

6. Approving the fees and disbursements of the Receiver’s legal counsel for the period from

November 17, 2020 to April 26, 2021; 

7. Approving the Receiver’s First Report and the activities of the Receiver set out therein including

the Receiver’s Interim Statement of Receipts and Disbursements, for the period from November 17, 

2020 to April 30, 2020; and 

8. Such further and other relief as counsel may advise and this Honourable Court may deem just.

THE GROUNDS FOR THE MOTION ARE: 

1. The Respondent Frank Zuccaro (“Frank”) is the principal of the Respondent corporations

(hereinafter collectively referred to as the “Zuccaro Respondents”) and the spouse of Maria Zuccaro 

(“Maria”). 

2. Maria commenced an Application in the Ontario Superior Court of Justice at Newmarket in 2019

under Family Court File No.:  CV-19-0058934-0000 for, inter alia, support and equalization (the 

“Matrimonial Proceedings”). 

3. Within the Matrimonial Proceedings, the Honourable Justice P.A. Douglas made an Order on

October 8th, 2020, for the appointment of a Receiver to prevent dissipation of assets and to ensure 

compliance with various Orders for disclosure.  

4. The Receiver was appointed on November 17th, 2020 by further Order of the Honourable Justice

P.A. Douglas pursuant to Section 101 of the Courts of Justice Act (the “Receivership Order”), which 

Receivership Order became effective as of its date. 

5. Among other things, the Receivership Order authorized the Receiver to sell the property known

municipally as 76 Densley Avenue, Toronto, Ontario (the “Densley Property”). 
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PROCESS FOR A SALE OF THE PROPERTY 

6. As detailed in the Receiver’s First Report, the Receiver engaged CBRE Limited, Brokerage (the

“CBRE”) as broker to solicit offers for the purchase of the Densley Property.  As a result of the marketing 

activities undertaken by CBRE, 9 Confidentiality Agreements were signed, 7 offers were received, and 

ultimately a preferred offer was selected.  The accepted offer involved an offer to purchase the Densley 

Property for the highest price (“the Successful Bid”). 

7. The Successful Bid was unconditional and provided for a closing date to be on the 10th business

following the date the Receiver obtained Court Approval and a Vesting Order or such other date as the 

parties mutually agreed to. 

8. The Sale Agreement provided the purchaser with the right at any time prior to closing to assign

the Agreement, which the original purchaser did by Amendment to the Sale Agreement dated March 

29th, 2021. 

THE SALE PROCESS WAS FAIR AND REASONABLE AND RESULTED IN THE 

SALE AGREEMENT 

9. The Receiver believes that the Successful Bid represents the highest and best offer for the

Densley Property based on all proposals received in the Sales Process.  Therefore, the Receiver accepted 

the terms of the Successful Bid in the Sale Agreement, subject to Court Approval. 

10. The Receiver believes that the sale price set out in the Sale Agreement is fair and commercially

reasonable in the circumstances.  It is a requirement of the Sale Agreement that the Approval and Vesting 

Order be obtained before closing. 

DISTRIBUTION OF THE PURCHASE PRICE 

11. The Receiver proposes to distribute the net sale proceeds following the closing of the transaction

in accordance with the respective priorities of the mortgages registered on the title to the Densley 

Property, as set out in the Receiver’s First Report.   

4



12. As at June 11, 2021, the amount owing under the first ranking charge over the Densley Property

being the charge to the Equitable bank will be $1,691,685.77, before nominal closing adjustments. 

13. The Receivership Order authorized the Receiver to borrow monies not exceeding $400,000.00

to fund the exercise of its powers and duties and the Receiver entered into a Term Sheet with Hillmount 

Capital Inc. for the purpose of same.  As of June 11, 2021, the amount outstanding to Hillmount for funds 

borrowed, inclusive of fees will be $265,624.80 for which Receiver’s Certificates have been issued. 

14. Prior orders made in the matrimonial proceedings require payments by the Respondents to Maria

Zuccaro. The Receiver proposes to distribute the sum of $70,001.67 from the net proceeds following the 

closing for the amounts owing to Maria Zuccaro for the period to September 24, 2020. In addition, the 

Receiver proposes to distribute to Maria Zuccaro the Ongoing Spousal Payments, as described in the 

Receiver’s First Report to Court and $24,000.00 for an outstanding cost order made in the matrimonial 

proceedings on November 16, 2020. 

FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS ARE REASONABLE IN THE CIRCUMSTANCES 

15. The fees and disbursements of the Receiver and its counsel are reasonable and proper in all of

the circumstances. 

16. As set out in the Rules 2.03 and 3.02 of the Rules of Civil Procedure, R.R.O. 1990, Reg. 194.

17. Such further and other grounds as counsel may advise and this Honourable Court may deem just.

THE FOLLOWING DOCUMENTARY EVIDENCE will be used at the hearing of this 

Application: 
1. The First Report of the Receiver dated May 18, 2021;

2. The Fee Affidavit of Rahn Dodick, sworn May 18, 2021;

3. The Fee Affidavit of Alexander Hora, sworn May 18, 2021; and
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4. Such further and other documentary evidence as counsel may advise and this Honourable Court

permits. 

May 19, 2021 GARFINKLE BIDERMAN LLP 
Barristers & Solicitors 
1 Adelaide Street East, Suite 801 
Toronto, Ontario 
M5C 2V9 

WENDY GREENSPOON-SOER 
(LSUC#: 34698L) 
Tel: 416-869-1234 
Fax: 416-869-0547 

Lawyers for the Applicant Receiver, 
DODICK LANDAU INC.  
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ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

DODICK LANDAU INC. 

Court File No. 

Applicant 

FRANK ZUCCARO, 863704 ONT ARIO LIMITED, METROPOLITAN ICE 
CREAM INC. AND ORACCRUZ HOLDINGS LTD. 

Respondents 

APPLICATION UNDER SUBSECTION 249 and 250(1) OF THE BANKRUPTCY AND 
INSOLVENCY ACT, R.S.C. 1985, c. B-3, AS AMENDED AND RULES 14.05(2) AND (3)(g) 

AND 41 OF THE RULES OF CIVIL PROCEDURE, R.R.O. 1990 

FIRST REPORT TO COURT OF DODICK LANDAU INC. 
AS RECEIVER OF FRANK ZUCCARO, 863704 ONT ARIO LIMITED, 

METRO POLIT AN ICE CREAM INC. AND ORACCRUZ HOLDINGS LTD. 

May 18, 2021 

INTRODUCTION 

I. On November 17, 2020, Dodick Landau Inc. was Court-appoi_nted receiver (the 

"Receiver") of the assets, undertakings and properties of Frank Zuccaro, 863704 Ontario 

Limited ("863 Ontario"), Metropolitan Ice Cream Inc. and Oraccruz Holdings Ltd. 

including all proceeds thereof ("Property") under section I 0 I of the Courts of Justice Act 

(Ontario) by Order ("Receivership Order") of Justice P.A. Douglas in the Ontario 

Superior Court of Justice at Newmarket family Court file No. FC-19-0058934-0000 

("Matrimonial Proceeding"). Attached as Appendix "A" is a copy of the Receivership 

Order. 

2. Frank Zuccaro is the principal of the Respondent corporations and the spouse of Maria 

Zuccaro, the applicant in the Matrimonial Proceeding. In the Matrimonial Proceeding there 

are three additional individual respondents who are the adult children of Frank and Maria 

CV-21-00661928-00CL 
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Zuccaro. Maria Zuccaro commenced the Matrimonial Proceeding in family Court in 2019 

for support and equalization as part of her, and Frank Zuccaro's, divorce proceeding. Frank 

Zuccaro breached orders made in the Matrimonial Proceeding which resulted in the family 

Court appointing the Receiver to, among other things, take possession of, and exercise 

control over, the Property and all receipts and disbursements arising out of, or from, the 

Property under the control of Frank Zuccaro. 

3. The Court further ordered that the real properties owned by 863 Ontario and located at 76 

Densley Avenue Toronto, Ontario ("Densley Property"), and 3815 King Road, King City, 

Ontario ("King Property"), may immediately be listed for sale. 

4. Following receipt of the Receivership Order, Maria Zuccaro, and her children, requested 

the Receiver to only take possession and sell the Densley Property and not to take 

possession of the King Property as Frank Zuccaro continues to reside there. However, 

recently, Ms. Zuccaro and her children requested that the Receiver take possession of, and 

commence a sale process for, the King Property. Other than obtaining an appraisal of the 

King Property and insuring it, the Receiver, consistent with the direction provided by Maria 

Zuccaro, has to date not taken possession of the King Property nor commenced a process 

to sell the King Property. The Receiver intends in the near future to make a separate Court 

application to seek advice and directions with regards to the possession and sale of the 

King Property. 

PURPOSE OF THE FIRST REPORT 

5. The purpose of this first report of the Receiver (the "First Report") is as follows: 

a. to provide background information on the receivership; 

b. to obtain the Court's approval of the Densley Property sale transaction (the "Sale 

Transaction") contemplated by the agreement of purchase and sale (the "Densley 

APS") between the Receiver and Ashiana Capital Corporation ("Purchaser") dated 

March 5, 2021, and amended March 29, 2021, a redacted copy of which is attached 

hereto as Appendix "8" (which is redacted only in respect of the purchase price and 
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deposit amount thereunder) and an unredacted copy of which is attached hereto as 

Confidential Appendix "1 "; 

c. to obtain the Court's approval for the vesting in the Purchaser of all of 863 Ontario's 

right, title and interest in and to the Densely Property free and clear of any claims and 

permitted encumbrances; 

d. to obtain the Court's approval of the sealing of the unredacted copy of the Densley 

APS, as well as the CBRE Reporting Letter, and the Appraisal (as such terms are 

defined below), which are attached hereto as Confidential Appendix "2" and "3", 

respectively, until after the closing of the Sale Transaction. The Receiver is requesting 

an Order sealing these appendices as these documents contain sale information that 

could taint the market in the event the Sale Transaction does not close and the Densley 

Property is remarketed; 

e. to obtain the Court's approval of this First Report and the activities described herein, 

including the Receiver's Interim Statement of Receipts and Disbursements, for the 

period from November 17, 2020 to April 30, 2020 (the "R&D"); 

f. to obtain the Court's approval of the Receiver fees and disbursements, including the 

fees and disbursements of its legal counsel, for the period from October 28, 2020 to 

April 30, 2021; and 

g. to obtain the Court's approval of the distribution of the proceeds from the Sale 

Transaction ("Densley Sale Proceeds"). pending closing of the Sale Transaction, as 

more specifically detailed herein. 
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DISCLAIMER 

6. In preparing this Report, the Receiver has relied upon certain unaudited, draft and/or 

internal financial information, the Respondent's books and records, and information from 

Maria Zuccaro, as well as, Guiseppe, Vito Antonio and Filomena Zuccaro and other third­

party sources, (collectively, the "Information"). Except as described in this Report: 

a. the Receiver has not audited, reviewed or otherwise attempted to verify the accuracy 

or completeness of the Infonnation in a manner that would wholly or partially comply 

with Generally Accepted Assurance Standards pursuant to the Canadian Institute of 

Chartered Accountants Handbook and, accordingly, the Receiver expresses no opinion 

or other form of assurance in respect of the Information; 

b. some of the information referred to in this First Report consists of forecasts and 

projections. An examination or review of the financial forecast and projections, as 

outlined in the Canadian Institute of Chartered Accountants handbook, has not been 

performed; and 

c. the Receiver has prepared this First Report in its capacity as a Receiver and has made 

a copy of this Report available on the Receiver's website at www.dodick.ca for 

purposes of this motion. Parties using this First Report, other than for the purpose of 

this motion, are cautioned that it may not be appropriate for their purposes. 

7. Capitalized terms not defined in the First Report are as defined in the Receivership Order. 

All references in this First Report to dollars are in Canadian currency. 

BACKGROUND 

Overview 

8. 863 Ontario is a real estate holding company that owns the Densely and King Properties. 

Frank Zuccaro is the sole director and officer of 863 Ontario. 

9. Within the Matrimonial Proceeding various Orders were made by the Court as against 

Frank Zuccaro and the corporations under his control, including for various payments 
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(discussed further herein), which were breached. As a result, Justice P.A. Douglas made 

an Order on October 8, 2020 that a Receiver would be appointed to ensure compliance by 

Frank Zuccaro, and the corporate Respondents, (the "October 2020 Order") and on 

November 17, 2020 the Receivership Order was granted. Attached as Appendix "C" is a 

copy of the October 2020 Order. 

I 0. The Receivership Order authorized the Receiver to borrow monies not exceeding $400,000 

to fund the exercise of its powers and duties. To date, the Receiver has borrowed $260,000 

("Hillmount Loan"), from Hillmount Capital Inc. ("Hillmount"). Hillmount's advances 

are secured by the Receiver's Borrowings Charge, over all of the assets, undertakings and 

properties of the Respondents pursuant to section 21 of the Receivership Order. However, 

the Hillmount Loan is subordinate to the pre-existing mortgage on the Densley Property 

held by Equitable Bank and described in further detail below. 

DENSLEY PROPERTY SALES PROCESS 

11. In December 2020, the Receiver invited proposals from three commercial real estate 

brokers for the marketing and sale of the Densley Property. In January 2021, the Receiver 

engaged CBRE Limited ("CBRE"), a reputable national commercial real estate brokerage 

company, to market and sell the Densley Property. 

12. The listing and marketing of the Densley Property commenced on January 29, 2021 with a 

list price of $5.5 million. Subsequently, once it was confirmed that there were sufficient 

interested parties in the Densley Property, CBRE established an offer submission date of 

March 2, 2021 and advised prospective interested parties that offers will not be accepted 

earlier. This provided the time for all prospective interested parties to view the Densley 

Property, and carry out their due diligence, before deciding whether to submit an offer. 

Attached as Appendix "D" is a copy ofCBRE's marketing brochure. 

13. CBRE marketed the Densley Property through multiple channels including email 

campaigns, advertising promotions, LinkedIN networks and signage summarized in 

CBRE's reporting letter dated March 30, 2021 ("CBRE Reporting Letter") and sealed as 

Confidential Appendix 2. 
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14. CBRE received multiple offers for the Densley Property on the March 2, 2021 offer 

submission date. With the agreement of the Receiver, CBRE contacted the top three 

offerors and asked them to improve their offers and re-submit their improved offers by 

March 5, 2021, the second-round offer submission date. 

15. On March 5, 2021, CBRE received three improved offers. CBRE, in consultation with the 

Receiver, entered into discussions with the top offeror with a view to further improving the 

offer for acceptance and execution by the Receiver. The Receiver executed the Densley 

APS on March 5, 2021. The purchaser was pennitted to assign the agreement to a 

corporation to be named prior to closing of the Sale Transaction. On March 29, 2021, the 

purchaser assigned the agreement to Ashiana Capital Corporation, which the Receiver 

understands is a corporation related to the assignor. A summary of final offers is included 

in the CBRE Reporting Letter attached hereto as Confidential Appendix .. 2". 

Densley APS 

16. The Densley APS provides that closing of the Sale Transaction shall be on the 101h business 

day following the date of Approval and Vesting Order being granted by the Court. 

17. A general summary of the key terms and conditions of the Densley APS is set out below. 

For further infonnation, interested parties are directed to the specific tenns of the Densley 

APS, a redacted version is attached hereto as Appendix "B". 

a. The purchase price for the Densley Property is as set out in the unredacted copy of the 

Densley APS, which is attached as Confidential Appendix "I". The purchase price will 

be satisfied by way of cash proceeds. 

b. A deposit of approximately 7% of the purchase price is being held by CBRE pursuant 

to the tenns of the Densley APS. 

c. The Densley APS contains common conditions for transactions of this nature, 

including obtaining the Approval and Vesting Order. There are no due diligence or 

financing conditions in the Densley APS. 
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18. The Densley Property Appraisal and the executed Densley APS were provided to Maria 

Zuccaro, and her children, upon their execution of a Non-Disclosure and Confidentiality 

Agreement (the "NDA"). The same infonnation has been offered to Frank Zuccaro but, 

after several attempts were made to make contact with him through his legal counsel which 

included providing him with a copy of the NDA, no signed NDA was returned. 

DISTRIBUTIONS 

Equitable a11d Hillmou11t Payouts 

19. At the commencement of the· receivership, 863 Ontario owed Equitable Bank 

("Equitable") approximately $I. 7 million. Equitable holds a first priority mortgage 

registered on title to the Densley Property and was granted by 863 Ontario a General 

Security Agreement against all of its properties, assets and undertakings. The Receiver 

brought the Equitable mortgage into good standing following its appointment and has been 

making the monthly installments in the nonnal course. 

20. The Receiver is in receipt of draft payout statements from Equitable and Hillmount, which 

are attached as Appendices "E" and "F", respectively. The actual final amounts to be 

paid out to Equitable and Hillmount will depend on the final closing date, however, the 

Receiver does not expect the final payouts to be materially different from the amounts in 

the draft payout statements appended to this report. The Densley Sale Proceeds are 

sufficient to satisfy the claims of Equitable and Hillmount as set out in their payout 

statements. The Receiver proposes to distribute from the sale proceeds funds to satisfy the 

amounts owing to Equitable and Hillmount in full in accordance with their final payout 

statements. 

Unpaid Spousal Payments 

21. As part of the Matrimonial Proceeding, on March 11, 2020 an order was issued ("March 

2020 Order") which, among other things, ordered Frank Zuccaro to make spousal 

payments to Maria Zuccaro, an interim disbursement payment, as well as payments for his 

portion of the carrying costs of the matrimonial home. On August 5, 2020 ("August 2020 
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Order") a further order was granted which, among other things, ordered Frank Zuccaro to 

pay all carrying expenses related to the property at 11547 County Road 10, Clearview, 

Ontario (the "Cottage Property"). Both the matrimonial home and the Cottage Property, 

are jointly owned by Maria and Frank Zuccaro. The March and August 2020 Orders are 

attached as Appendices "G" and "H", respectively. 

22. Frank Zuccaro failed to comply with certain of the ordered payments in each of the March 

2020 and August 2020 Orders. In addition, on November 16, 2020 an endorsement was 

made by Justice Douglas of the Family Court which ordered that Frank Zuccaro pay 

$24,000 of costs to Maria Zuccaro plus interest at a rate of 2% per annum. The Receiver 

summarized these outstanding spousal payments ("Unpaid Spousal Payments") which 

summary is attached as Appendix "I" and total $96,671.03. The Receiver proposes to 

make a distribution from the Densley Sale Proceeds to Maria Zuccaro in accordance with 

the Unpaid Spousal Payments, plus accrued interest thereon. 

011goi11g Spousal Pay111e11ts 

23. The March and August 2020 Orders include, among other things, ongoing payment 

obligations to Maria Zuccaro by Frank Zuccaro equal to $3,000 per month for spousal 

support, payments for Frank Zuccaro's share of the ongoing carrying costs of the 

matrimonial home and l 00% of the ongoing carrying costs of the Cottage Property 

(collectively, "Ongoing Spousal Payments"). The Receiver proposes to continue to make 

these payments on behalf of Frank Zuccaro from the net remaining Densley Sale Proceeds 

for the period beginning September 24, 2020, until such time as a further order is made by 

the Court directing the Receiver to distribute the remaining Densley Sale Proceeds, or until 

there are insufficient funds in the Receivership to continue to make such payments to be 

determined by the Receiver in its sole discretion. 

24. Accordingly, below is a summary of the distributions the Receiver proposes to make from 

the Densley Sale Proceeds upon closing of the Sale Transaction (collectively referred to as 

the "Interim Distribution") 

a. payment to Equitable on account of its first mortgage in the amount of approximately 

$I. 7 million; 
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b. payment to Hillmount in repayment of the Receiver's Borrowings in the amount of 

approximately $265,000; 

c. payment to Maria Zuccaro on the account of the total Unpaid Spousal Payments for 

the period to September 24, 2020 in the amount of $70,001.67 plus interest; 

d. payment to Maria Zuccaro on account of the November 2020 cost award in the amount 

of $24,000; and 

e. ongoing Spousal Payments in accordance with the March and August 2020 Orders, as 

described above. 

25. The remaining Densley Sale Proceeds, after payment of the distributions described above, 

will be held by the Receiver to fund the ongoing operating costs of the Receivership 

proceeding and will be distributed only upon receipt of further order of the Court. 

INTERIM STATEMENT OF RECEIPTS AND DISBURSEMENTS 

26. Attached as Appendix "J" is the Receiver's interim statement of receipts and 

disbursements ("R&D") for 863 Ontario which, for the period of November 17, 2020 to 

May 5, 2021 indicates actual receipts over disbursements of $63,638. 70. The other 

Respondents either had zero, or nominal, receipts over disbursements, and for this reason 

are not included in the R&D. 

27. The Hillmount Loan totaled approximately $260,000, before adjustments for financing 

costs, which, together with rent collected from the tenants of the Densley Property totalling 

approximately $151,500, were used to fund the Receivership's assets' carrying costs and 

the costs of the receivership proceeding to date. 

PROFESSIONAL FEES 

28. The Receiver is seeking an Order from this Court to pass the accounts of the Receiver and 

to approve the fees and disbursements of the Receiver and its legal counsel. 

29. For the period October 28, 2020 to May 5, 2021, the Receiver's accounts amount to 

$139 ,622.05 in fees, plus disbursements of $8,031.63 and $19, 194.98 in HST for a total 
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amount of $166,748.65. A copy of the accounts rendered in these proceedings by the 

Receiver in respect of such period, together with a summary of the personnel, hours and 

hourly rates of the Receiver during the same period, supported by the Affidavit of Rahn 

Dodick sworn May•, 2021, is attached hereto as Appendix "K". 

30. The aggregate fees of Garfinkle Biderman LLP ("GB"), the Receiver's legal counsel, for 

the period November 17, 2020 to April 26, 2021, are $30,895.00, plus disbursements of 

$736.10 and HST in the amount of $4,111.01 for a total of $35,742.11. Copies of GB's 

statements of account are attached as an exhibit to the Affidavit of .Alexander Hora sworn 

May •, 2021, attached hereto as Appendix "L". 

RECEIVER'S CONCLUSIONS AND RECOMMENDATIONS 

31. The Receiver is of the view that CBRE, in consultation with the Receiver, canvassed the 

market for interested purchasers and provided sufficient opportunity for all potentia11y 

interested persons to view the Densley Property and to submit an offer, if interested. The 

Receiver is not aware of any circumstances in which potentially interested persons were 

not treated fairly or not afforded substantially equal information and opportunity by CBRE. 

32. The Densley APS represents the highest and best offer received by CBRE. 

33. The Appraisal, which is attached hereto as Confidential Appendix "3", notes that the 

purchase price in the Densley APS is higher than the appraised value. 

34. The Receiver consulted with CBRE, its legal counsel, and Maria Zuccaro's legal counsel 

on the results of the sale process. 

35. In view of the foregoing, the Receiver respectfully recommends that this Court grant the 

Receiver's request for an order for the following: 

a. approving the First Report and the activities described herein; 

b. approving the interim R&D; 

c. approving the sale of the Densley Property to the Purchaser and vesting the Densley 

Property in the Purchaser free and clear of all claims; 
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d. sealing the unredacted copy of the Densley APS, which is attached hereto as 

Confidential Appendix "I", the CBRE Reporting Letter, which is attached hereto as 

Confidential Appendix "2" and the Densley Appraisal which is attached hereto as 

Confidential Appendix 3; 

e. approving the fees and disbursements of the Receiver and its legal counsel, as 

described herein; and 

f. approving and directing the Receiver to complete the distributions, as described herein. 

All of which is respectfully submitted this J 81
h day of May, 2021. 

DODICK LANDAU INC., solely in its capacity as 
Receiver of Frank Zuccaro, 863704 Ontario Limited, 
Metropolitan Ice Cream Inc. and Oraccruz Holdings Ltd. 
and not in its personal or corporate capacity. 

Per: 

Rahn Dodick, CPA, CA, CIRP, LIT 
President 
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Superior Court of Justice, Family Court 

Court Fie Number I Numlt0 de dossier du greffe 

FC-19·58934-00 
(Name of court I Nom du tribunal) 

at I au 50 Eagle Street West, Newmarket, Ontario L3Y 6B1 
(Municipality I Munlclpatitfl) 

Endorsement Sheet I 
Page d'/nscrlptlon 

Date Applicant(s) I Requerant(e)(s) : ....;.M;.;..;;a;;....ri_a_Z_u_cca~ro.;;__ ________ 0 Present I Comparait 
November 17, 

2020 Counsel I Avocat(e} : R. Avery Zeidman (avery@zeldmanlaw.com) O Present I Comparait 

FLR-A 90 l01/Q9\ 

Frank Zuccaro (R1) 
863704 Ontario Limited (R2) 
Metropolitan Ice Cream Inc. (R3) 
Oraccuz Holding ltd. (R4) 
Giuseppe Zuccaro (RS) 
Vito Antonio Zuccaro (R6) 

Respondent(s) / lntimll(e)(s) : Alomena Zuccaro (R7) 
Frank Mendicino (fmendlcfno@csllp.ca) for R1, 
R2,R3,R4 

Counsel I Avocat(e} : R. Avery Zeidman for R5, R6, R7 

0 Order to go in accordance with minutes of settlement or consent filed. I 

D Duty Counsel I 
Avocat de service 

D Present I ComparaTt 

D Present I Comparatt 
D Duty Counsel I 

Avocat de service 

Ordonnance confonntJment au proces·verbal de /'audience de transaction ou le consentement 
c/6pose. 

I have before me A's 148 motion for appointment of a receiver as contemplated by para. 5 of my 
endorsement dated Oct. 8/20. 

I authorized determination of this issue by 148 If necessary. It appears R 1, R2, R3 and R4 have 
not responded to A's entreaties to resolve the issue. 

A takes the posiUon that these Rs are not entitled lo participate in this motion by virtue of my 
order staying their claims. It is not necessary for me to rule on this issue (which may be 
arguable), given these Rs have been served with the 148, they have had sufficient time to 
respond, and they have not done so. I therefore proceed on the basis that R1, R2, R3 and R4 
do not oppose the relief soughl. 

For these reasons, 

ORDERS TO GO: 

1. Per Schedule A to the 148 dated November 10, 2020. 
2. This order is operative and enforceable upon release or this endorsement under my 

electronic signature without any need for a signed or entered fonnal typed order. Approval 
is dispensed with. The parties shall submit a fonnal order for signing and entry upon 
resumplion of regular court services. 

Mr. Justice P.A. Douglas 

Pace 1 of/ do 1 
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Superior Court of Justice 
(Name of Coutt} 

Schedule "A11 

ONTARIO Court File Number 
FC-19-0058934-0000 

at 50 Eagle Street West, Newmarket, Ontario, LJY 6Bl 
(Coutt otra address} 

CONSENT 

licant s 
;;..:i::;.c.;:==~---- ----------·--·· ··-···· - ··---
Full legal name & addteSS for service- st1Bel & number, municipality, Lawyer's name & eddtflss - slteef & number, municipatlly, postal code, 
postal code, lelephone & fax numbers and e-mall address (if any). telephone & lu numbers and e-mail address (ii any). 

1Marla Zuccaro R. Avery Zeidman 
:c10 Lawyer Avery Zeidman Professional Corporation I Barristers & Solicitors 

,565 Edgeley Blvd. 
Concord, Ontario L4K 4G4 
Tel: 905-669-7577 ext. 222 
Fax:905-669-S525 
ave a.izcidmanlaw.com ·-------·-·-----......... ---"""""'_.. .................................... 

Res ondent(!)__ ______ . -·---
Full legal name & oddtess for sstvlce- street & number, munlclpalily, 
postal code, telephone & fa'X numbel'I and e-mail address (i~ any}. 

Frank Zuccaro 
c/o lawyer 

jCo-Respondents Cc/o lawyer) 

I 
~63704 Ontario Limited 

Metropolitan Ice Cream Inc. 

Oraccuz Holding Ltd. 

I 

!Added Respondents (c/o Mr. Zeidman) 
I 
! 

Giuseppe Zuccaro 

Vito Antonio Zuccaro 

filomena Zuccaro 

I 

I !reeled Party: 
roodick Landau Inc. 
I 

j4646 Dufferin St. Unit #6 
'.North York, ON M3H 584 
Tel: (416) 736-4357 

Lawyer's name & address - street & number, municipality, postal code, 
telephone & la'X numbers and e-mail address {if any). 

Frank A. Mendicino 
Capo Sgro LLP 
Barrister(s) and Solicitor(s) 
7050 Weston Road, Suite 400 
Woodbridge, Ontario L4L 8G7 
Tel: 905-850..7000 
Fax:90S.8SQ..70SO 

1fmendicino@csllp.cu 
l 

I 
IR. Avery Zeidman 
Avery Zeidman Professional Corporation 
Barristers & Solicitors 
565 Edgeley Blvd. 
Concord, Ontario L4K 4G4 
Tel: 905-669-7577 ext. 222 
Fax: 905-669-5525 
laverv@zcidmanlaw .corn 

I 
I Fax: 416-649-7725 

rahn.dodick dodick.ca 
____ l._i -----····---·-····-----

___ 1 

-.OWOllCEmlllo.ccm 
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CONSENT (page 2) Court File Number .J:C:! 9-0058934-000Q 

The parties hereto, by their respective solicitors. consent to an Order attached as Schedule "A" and no party to 

or affected by these proceedings is under any disability. 

Dated this 1 Qlh day of November. 2020. 

d'0 
Maria Zuccaro, · ccaro, Vito Antonio 
Zuccaro, and Zuccaro, au by their Lawyer 
R. Avery Zeidman 

12· 
., osed receiver, per R. 
per authorization 
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ONTARIO Court FUe Number 
Superior Court of Justice FC-19-0058934-0000 

(Name of Coutf} 

SEAL at SO Eagle Street West, Newmarket, Ontario, LJY 681 Form 25: Order (General) 
{Coutt office address} [!] Temporary 

Appllcant(s) D Final 
{FuU logal name & eddre$s fer sotVlco: stroot, number, Lawyer's nama & address: street, numbor, munlclps/ily, j 
munlc/pallty, postal code tetaphone & lax numbetS & e-maB postal coda, tofaphone & 1811 numbotS & o-maU addtoss {ii 
addross (II any). any). I 
Maria Zuccaro R. Avery Zeidman ! 
c/o Lawyer A very Zeidman Professional Corporation • 

Barristers &. Solicitors 

The Honourable 
J • PAD -~st1ce . . oug_!s .•. Resoondentfsl 

565 Edgeley Blvd. 
Concord, Ontario L4K 4G4 
Tel: 905-669-7577 ext. 222 
Fax:905-669-5S2S 
av<?nofa•zeidmanlaw.com 

Judge (Print or type name) Full legal namo a address for servlco: street, number. Lawyor's name & eddmss: street, number, municipality, ,~ 
N b 

2020 
munlclpahly, posla/ code telephone & fax numbers & e-mail postal coda, lalephone & lax number.t & e-mail addmss (i 

OVem er t BddlOSS {ii any}, eny}, I 

Date of Mier Frank Zuccaro Frank A. Mendicino 
c/o lawyer Capo Sgro LLP 

Barrister(s) and Solicitor(s) : 
Co-Resgondents (c£o la:!'.Icr} 7050 Weston Road, Suite 400 ! 

Woodbridge, Ontario L4L 8G7 ' 

863704 Ontario Limited Tel: 905-850-7000 
Fax: 905-850-7050 

Metropolitan Ice Cream Inc. fmcndicino@csllp.ca 

Oraccuz Holding Ltd. I 

Added Respondents (c/o Mr. Zeidman> 

Giuseppe Zuccaro R. Avery Zeidman 
I 

A very Zeidman Professional Corporation : 
: 

Vito Antonio Zuccaro Barristers & Solicitors 
565 Edgeley Blvd. : 

Filomena Zuccaro Concord, Ontario L4K 4G4 
Tel: 905-669-7577 ext. 222 
Fax: 905-669-5525 
aven .. rii•zeidmanlaw .com ---·· 

The court heard a motion made by (name of person or persons) 

Maria Zuccaro, for an Order pursuant to section JOI of the Courts of Ju.flice Acl, R.S.O. 1990, c. C.43, as 
amended (the "CJA") appointing Dodick Landau Inc. as receiver and manager (in such capacities, the 
"Receiver'') without security, of all of the assets, undertakings and properties of Frank Zuccaro, 863704 Ontario 
Limited, Metropolitan lee Cream Inc. and Oraccuz Holding Inc. (collectively the "Debtor") was heard this day at 
SO Eagle Street West, Newmarket, Ontario. 

The following persons were in court (names of parties and lawyers In court) 

nla motion in writing only 

The court received evidence and heard submissions on behalf of (name or names) 

R. Avery Zeidman, on behalf of the Applicant and added Respondents 
Frank A. Mendicino, on behalf of lhe Respondent and Co-Respondents 

FLR 25 (September 1, 2005) -.DIVORCEINIG.c:om 
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THIS COURT ORDERS THAT: 

SERVICE 

I. THIS COURT ORDERS that the time for service of the 148 Motion Fonn and the Motion is hereby 

abridged and validated so that this motion is properly returnable today and hereby dispenses with further service 

thereof. 

APPOINTMENT 

2. THIS COURT ORDERS that pursuant to section 101 of the CJA, Dodick Landau Inc. is hereby appointed 

Receiver, without security, of all of the assets, undertakings and properties of the Debtor including all proceeds 

thereof (the "Property"). 

RECEIVER'S POWERS 

3. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver is hereby empowered and authorized, but not obligated, to act 

at once in respect of the Property and, without in any way limiting the generality of the foregoing, the Receiver 

is hereby expressly empowered and authorized to do any of the following where the Receiver considers it 

necessary or desirable: 

(a) to take possession of and exercise control over the Property and any and all proceeds, receipts and 

disbursements arising out of or from the Property; 

(b) to receive, preserve, and protect the Property, or any part or parts thereof, including, but not limited 

to, the changing of locks and security codes, the relocating of Property to safeguard it, the engaging of 

independent security personnel, the taking of physical inventories and the placement or such insurance 

coverage as may be necessary or desirable; 

(c) to manage, operate, and carry on the business of the Debtor, including the powers to enter into any 

agreements, incur any obligations in the ordinary course of business, cease to carry on all or any part or 

the business, or cease to perform any contracts of the Debtor; 

(d) to engage consultants, appraisers, agents, experts, auditors, accountants, managers, counsel and 

such other persons from time to time and on whatever basis, including on a temporary basis, to assist with 

the exercise of the Receiver's powers and duties, including without limitation those conferred by this 

Order; 

(e) to purchase or lease such machinery, equipment, inventories, supplies, premises or other assets lo 

continue the business of the Debtor or any part or parts thereof; 

(f) lo receive and collect all monies and accounts now owed or hereafter owing to the Debtor and to 
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exercise all remedies of the Debtor in collecting such monies, including, without limitation, to enforce 

any security held by the Debtor; 

(g) to settle, extend or compromise any indebtedness owing to the Debtor; 

(h) to execute, assign, issue and endorse documents of whatever nature in respect of any of the 

Property, whether in the Receiver's name or in the name and on behalf of the Debtor, for any purpose 

pursuant to this Order, 

(i) to initiate, prosecute and continue the prosecution of any and all proceedings and to defend all 

proceedings now pending or hereafter instituted with respect to the Debtor, the Property or the Receiver, 

and to settle or compromise any such proceedings. The authority hereby conveyed shall extend to such 

appeals or applications for judicial review in respect of any order or judgment pronounced in any such 

proceeding; 

(j) to market any or all of the Property. including advertising and soliciting offers in respect of the 

Property or any part or parts thereof and negotiating such terms and conditions of sale as the Receiver in 

its discretion may deem appropriate; 

(k) to sell, convey. transfer, lease or assign the Property or any part or parts thereof out of the ordinary 

course of business, and in each such case notice under subsection 63(4) of the Ontario Personal Property 

Security Act, [or section 31 of the Ontario Mortgages Act, as the case may be,] shall not be required. and 

in each case the Ontario Bulk Sales Act shall not apply. 

(I) lo apply for any vesting order or other orders necessary to convey the Property or any part or parts 

thereof lo a purchaser or purchasers 1hereof, free and clear of any liens or encumbrances affecting such 

Property; 

(m) to report to, meet with and discuss with such affected Persons (as defined below) as the Receiver 

deems appropriate on all matters relating to the Property and the receivership, and to share infonnation, 

subject to such tenns as to confidentiality as the Receiver deems advisable; 

(n) to register a copy of this Order and any other Orders in respect of the Property against title to any 

of the Property; 

( o) to apply for any pennits, licences, approvals or pennissions as may be required by any 

governmental authority and any renewals thereof for and on behalf of and, if thought desirable by the 

Receiver, in the name of the Debtor; 

(p) to enter into agreements with any trustee in bankruptcy appointed in respect of the Debtor, 

including, without limiting the generality of the foregoing, the ability to enter into occupation agreements 
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for any property owned or leased by the Debtor; 

(q) to exercise any shareholder, partnership, joint venture or other rights which the Debtor may have; 

(r) to take any steps reasonably incidental to the exercise of these powers or the perfonnance of any 

statutory obligations; and 

(s) to take steps to give effect to Orders of this Court, including without limitation this Order, the 

Order of the Honourable Justice Douglas dated March 11, 2020, the order of the Honourable Justice 

Douglas dated June 29, 2020, and the Order of the Honourable Justice Douglas dated October 8, 2020: 

and in each case where the Receiver takes any such actions or steps, it shall be exclusively authorized and 

empowered to do so, to the exclusion of all other Persons (as defined below), including the Debtor, and without 

interference from any other Person. 

DUTY TO PROVIDE ACCESS AND CO-OPERATION TO THE RECEIVER 

4. THIS COURT ORDERS that (i) the Debtor, (ii) all ofits current and fonner directors, officers, employees, 

agents, accountants, legal counsel and shareholders, and all other persons acting on its instructions or behalf, and 

(iii) all other individuals, finns, corporations, governmental bodies or agencies, or other entities having notice of 

this Order (all of the foregoing, collectively, being "Persons" and each being a "Person") shall forthwith advise 

the Receiver or the existence of any Property in such Person's possession or control, shall grant immediate and 

continued access to the Property to the Receiver, and shall deliver all such Property to the Receiver upon the 

Receiver's request. 

S. THIS COURT ORDERS that all Persons shall forthwith advise the Receiver of the existence of any books, 

documents, securities, contracts, orders, corporate and accounting records, and any other papers, records and 

infonnation of any kind related to the business or affairs of the Debtor, and any computer programs, computer 

tapes, computer disks, or other data storage media containing any such information (the foregoing, collectively, 

the "Records") in that Person's possession or control, and shall provide to the Receiver or permit the Receiver to 

make, retain and take away copies thereof and grant to the Receiver unfettered access to and use of accounting. 

computer, software and physical facilities relating thereto, provided however that nothing in this paragraph 5 or 

in paragraph 6 of this Order shall require the delivery of Records, or the granting of access to Records, which 

may not be disclosed or provided to the Receiver due to the privilege attaching to solicitor-client communication 

or due to statutory provisions prohibiting such disclosure. 

6. THIS COURT ORDERS that if any Records are stored or othe1Wise contained on a computer or other 

electronic sy~tem of infonnation storage, whelher by independent service provider or otherwise, all Persons in 

possession or control of such Records shall forthwith give unfettered access to the Receiver for the purpose of 
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allowing the Receiver to recover and fully copy all of the intbnnation contained therein whether by way of 

printing the infonnation onto paper or making copies of computer disks or such other manner of retrieving and 

copying the information as the Receiver in its discretion deems expedient, and shall not alter, erase or destroy 

any Records without the prior written consent of the Receiver. Further, for the purposes of this paragraph, all 

Persons shall provide the Receiver with all such assistance in gaining immediate access to the information in the 

Records as the Receiver may in its discretion require including providing the Receiver with instructions on the 

use of any computer or other system and providing the Receiver with any and all access codes, account names 

and account numbers that may be required to gain access to the information. 

7. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver shall provide each of the relevant landlords with notice of the 

Receiver's intention to remove any fixtures from any leased premises at least seven (7) days prior to the date of 

the intended removal. The relevant landlord shall be entitled to have a representative present in the leased 

premises to observe such removal and, if the landlord disputes the Receiver's entitlement to remove any such 

fixture under the provisions of the lease, such fixture shall remain on the premises and shall be dealt with as 

agreed between any applicable secured creditors, such landlord and the Receiver, or by further Order of this Court 

upon application by the Receiver on at least two (2) days notice to such landlord and any such secured creditors. 

NO PROCEEDINGS AGAINST THE RECEIVER 

8. THIS COURT ORDERS that no proceeding or enforcement process in any court or tribunal (each, a 

"Proceeding"), shall be commenced or continued against the Receiver except with the written consent of the 

Receiver or with leave of this Court save and except for this application proceeding (for which leave to continue 

is granted). 

NO PROCEEDINGS AGAINST THE DEBTOR OR THE PROPERTY 

9. THIS COURT ORDERS that no Proceeding against or in respect of the Debtor or the Property save and 

except for this application proceeding (for which leave to continue is granted) shall be commenced or continued 

except with the written consent of the Receiver or with leave of this Court and any and all Proceedings currently 

under way against or in respect of the Debtor or the Property are hereby stayed and suspended pending further 

Order of this Court. 

NO EXERCISE OF RIGHTS OR REMEDIES 

10. THIS COURT ORDERS that all rights and remedies against the Debtor, the Receiver, or affecting the 

Property, are hereby stayed and suspended except with the written consent of the Receiver or leave of this Court, 

provided however that this stay and suspension does not apply in respect of any "eligible financial contract" as 

defined in the BIA, and further provided that nothing in this paragraph shall (i) empower the Receiver or the 

Debtor to cany on any business which the Debtor is not lawfully entitled to cany on, (ii) exempt the Receiver or 
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the Debtor from compliance with statutory or regulatory provisions relating to health, safety or the environment, 

(iii) prevent the filing of any registration to preserve or perfect a security interest, or (iv) prevent the registration 

of a claim for lien. 

NO INTERFERENCE WITH THE RECEIVER 

11. THIS COURT ORDERS that no Person shall discontinue, fail to honour, alter, interfere with, repudiate, 

tenninate or cease to perform any right, renewal right, contract, agreement, licence or permit in favour of or held 

by the Debtor, without written consent of the Receiver or leave of this Court. 

CONTINUATION OF SERVICES 

12. THIS COURT ORDERS that all Persons having oral or written agreements with the Debtor or statutory 

or regulatory mandates for the supply of goods and/or services, including without limitation, all computer 

software, communication and other data services, centralized banking services, payroll services, insurance, 

transportation services, utility or other services to the Debtor are hereby restrained until further Order of this 

Court from discontinuing, altering, interfering with or terminating the supply of such goods or services as may 

be required by the Receiver, and that the Receiver shall be entitled to the continued use of the Debtor's current 

telephone numbers, facsimile numbers, internet addresses and domain names, provided in each case that the 

normal prices or charges for all such goods or services received af\er the date of this Order are paid by the Receiver 

in accordance with nonnal payment practices of the Debtor or such other practices as may be agreed upon by the 

supplier or service provider and the Receiver, or as may be ordered by this Court. 

RECEIVER TO HOLD FUNDS 

13. THIS COURT ORDERS that all funds, monies, cheques, instruments, and other fonns of payments 

received or collected by the Receiver from and after the making of this Order from any source whatsoever. 

including without limitation the sale of all or any of the Property and the collection of any accounts receivable in 

whole or in part, whether in existence on the date of this Order or hereafter coming into existence, shall be 

deposited into one or more new accounts to be opened by the Receiver (the "Post Receivership Accounts") and 

the monies standing to the credit of such Post Receivership Accounts from time to time, net of any disbursements 

provided for herein, shall be held by the Receiver to be paid in accordance with the tenns of this Order or any 

further Order of this Court. 

EMPLOYEES 

14. THIS COURT ORDERS that all employees of the Debtor shall remain the employees of the Debtor until 

such time as the Receiver, on the Debtor's behalf, may terminate the employment of such employees. The 

Receiver shall not be liable for any employee-related liabilities, including any successor employer liabilities as 
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provided for in section 14.06( 1.2) of the BIA, other than such amounts as the Receiver may specifically agree in 

writing to pay, or in respect of its obligations under sections 81.4(5) or 81.6(3) of the BIA or under the Wage 

Earner Protection Program Act. 

PIPED A 

15. THIS COURT ORDERS that, pursuant to clause 7(3)(c) of the Canada Personal lnfonnation Protection 

and Electronic Documents Act, the Receiver shall disclose personal information of identifiable individuals to 

prospective purchasers or bidders for the Property and to their advisors, but only to the extent desirable or required 

to negotiate and attempt to complete one or more sales of the Property (each, a "Sale"). Each prospective 

purchaser or bidder to whom such personal infonnation is disclosed shall maintain and protect the privacy of such 

infonnation and limit the use of such information to its evaluation of the Sale, and if it does not complete a Sale, 

shall return all such information to the Receiver, or in the alternative destroy aJJ such information. The purchaser 

of any Property shall be entitled to continue to use the personal information provided to it, and related to the 

Property purchased, in a manner which is in all material respects identical to the prior use of such infonnation by 

the Debtor, and shall return all other personal information to the Receiver, or ensure that all other personal 

infonnation is destroyed. 

LIMITATION ON ENVIRONMENTAL LIABILITIES 

16. THIS COURT ORDERS that nothing herein contained shall require the Receiver to occupy or to take 

control, care, charge, possession or management (separately and/or collectively, "Possession") of any of the 

Property that might be environmentally contaminated, might be a pollutant or a contaminant, or might cause or 

contribute to a spill, discharge, release or deposit of a substance contrary to any federal, provincial or other law 

respecting the protection, conservation, enhancement, remediation or rehabilitation of the environment or relating 

to the disposal of waste or other contamination including, without limitation, the Canadian Environmental 

Protection Act, the Ontario Environmental Protection Act, the Ontario Water Resources Act, or the Ontario 

Occupational Health and Safety Act and regulations thereunder (the "Environmental Legislation"), provided 

however that nothing herein shall exempt the Receiver from any duty to report or make disclosure imposed by 

applicable Environmental Legislation. The Receiver shall not, as a result of this Order or anything done in 

pursuance of the Receiver's duties and powers under this Order, be deemed to be in Possession of any of the 

Property within the meaning of any Environmental Legislation, unless it is actually in possession. 

LIMITATION ON THE RECEIVER'S LIABILITY 

17. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver shall incur no liability or obligation as a result of its 

appointment or the carrying out the provisions of this Order, save and except for any gross negligence or wilful 

misconduct on its part, or in respect of its obligations under sections 81.4(5) or 81.6(3) of the BIA or under the 
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Wage Earner Protection Program Act. Nothing in this Order shall derogate from the protections afforded the 

Receiver by section 14.06 of the BIA or by any other applicable legislation. 

RECEIVER'S ACCOUNTS 

18. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver and counsel to the Receiver shall be paid their reasonable fees 

and disbursements, in each case at their standard rates and charges unless otherwise ordered by the Court on the 

passing of accounts, and that the Receiver and counsel to the Receiver shall be entitled to and are hereby granted 

a charge (the "Receiver's Charge") on the Property, as security for such fees and disbursements, both before and 

after the making of this Order in respect of these proceedings, and that the Receiver's Charge shall fonn a first 

charge on the Property in priority to all security interests, trusts, liens, charges and encumbrances, statutory or 

otherwise, in favour of any Person, but subject to sections 14.06(7), 81.4(4), and 81.6(2) of the BIA. 

19. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver and its legal counsel shall pass its accounts from time to time. 

and for this purpose the accounts of the Receiver and its legal counsel are hereby referred to a judge of the 

Commercial List of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice. 

20. THIS COURT ORDERS that prior to the passing of its accountst the Receiver shall be at liberty from 

time to time to apply reasonable amounts, out of the monies in its hands, against its fees and disbursements. 

including legal fees and disbursements, incurred at the standard rates and charges of the Receiver or its counsel. 

and such amounts shall constitute advances against its remuneration and disbursements when and as approved by 

this Court. 

FUNDING OF THE RECEIVERSHIP 

21. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver be at liberty and it is hereby empowered to borrow by way of 

a revolving credit or otherwise, such monies from time to time as it may consider necessary or desirable, provided 

that the outstanding principal amount does not exceed $400,000.00 (or such greater amount as this Court may by 

further Order authorize) at any time, al such rate or rates of interest as it deems advisable for such period or 

periods of time as it may arrange, for the purpose of funding the exercise of the powers and duties conferred upon 

the Receiver by this Order, including interim expenditures. The whole of the Property shall be and is hereby 

charged by way of a fixed and specific charge (the "Receiver's Borrowings Charge") as security for the payment 

of the monies borrowed, together with interest and charges thereon. 

22. THIS COURT ORDERS that neither the Receiver's Borrowings Charge nor any other security granted by 

the Receiver in connection with its borrowings under this Order shall be enforced without leave of this Court. 

23. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver is at liberty and authorized to issue certificates substantially in 

the form annexed as Schedule "A" hereto (the "Receiver's Certificates") for any amount borrowed by it pursuant 
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to this Order. 

24. THIS COURT ORDERS that the monies from time to time borrowed by the Receiver pursuant to this 

Order or any further order of this Court and any and all Receiver's Certificates evidencing the same or any part 

thereof shall rank on a pari passu basis, unless otherwise agreed to by the holders of any prior issued Receiver's 

Certificates. 

SERVICE AND NOTICE 

25. THIS COURT ORDERS that the protocol for this Court regarding service of documents as outlined in the 

Notices to Public and Profession in effect (the .. Protocol") is approved and adopted by reference herein and, in 

this proceeding, the service of documents made in accordance with the Protocol shall be valid and eff ectivc 

service. 

26. THIS COURT ORDERS that if the service or distribution of documents in accordance with the Protocol 

is not practicable, the Receiver is at liberty to serve or distribute this Order, any other materials and orders in 

these proceedings, any notices or other correspondence, by forwarding true copies thereof by prepaid ordinary 

mail, courier, personal delivery or facsimile transmission to the Debtor's creditors or other interested parties at 

their respective addresses as last shown on the records of the Debtor and that any such service or distribution by 

courier, personal delivery or facsimile transmission shall be deemed to be received on the next business day 

following the date of forwarding thereof, or if sent by ordinary mail, on the third business day after mailing. 

GENERAL 

27. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver may from time to time apply to this Court for advice and 

directions in the discharge of its powers and duties hereunder. 

28. THIS COURT ORDERS that nothing in this Order shall prevent the Receiver from acting as a trustee in 

bankruptcy of the Debtor. 

29. THIS COURT HEREBY REQUESTS the aid and recognition of any court, tribunal, regulatory or 

administrative body having jurisdiction in Canada or in the United States to give effect to this Order and to assist 

the Receiver and its agents in carrying out the tenns of this Order. All courts, tribunals, regulatory and 

administrative bodies are hereby respectfully requested to make such orders and to provide such assistance to the 

Receiver, as an officer of this Court, as may be necessary or desirable to give effect to this Order or to assist the 

Receiver and its agents in carrying out the terms of this Order. 

30. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver be at liberty and is hereby authorized and empowered to apply 

to any court, tribunal, regulatory or administrative body, wherever located, for the recognition of this Order and 

for assistance in carrying out the terms of this Order, and that the Receiver is authorized and empowered to act 
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as a representative in respect of the within proceedings for the purpose of having these proceedings recognized 

in a jurisdiction outside Canada. 

31. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Applicant shall have her costs of this motion, up to and including entry 

and service of this Order, on a substantial indemnity basis to be paid by the Receiver from the Debtor's estate 

with such priority and at such time as this Court may detennine. 

32. THIS COURT ORDERS that any interested party may apply to this Court to vary or amend this Order on 

not less than seven (7) days• notice to the Receiver and to any other party likely to be affected by the order sought 

or upon such other notice, if any, as this Court may order. 

33. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Land Registry Office for the Land Titles Division of York (No. 64) shall 

register this Order against title to the lands and premises known municipally as: 

a) 381 S King Road, King City, Ontario and legally described as PT LOTS, CON 6, KING, PT ROAL 

BTN LTS 5 & 6 CON 6 KING AS IN R586423; KING (THE "KING PROPERTY"); 

b) 207 Saint Francis Avenue, Woodbridge, Ontario and legally described as LOT 185, PLAN 

6SM371S, VAUGHAN. SIT RT UNTIL THE LATER OF 5 YRS FROM 2004/01112 OR UNTIL 

PL 65M3715 HAS BEEN ASSUMED BY THE CITY OF VAUGHAN, AS IN YR414025 (THE 

"MATRIMONIAL HOME"); 

34. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Land Registry Office for the Land Titles Division of Simcoe (No. 51) 

shall register this Order against title to the lands and premises known municipally as 11547 Count Road 10. 

Clearview, Ontario and legally described as PART OF THE SOUTH HALF OF LOT 13, CONCESSION 8, 

TOWNSHIP OF SUNNlDALE, COUNTY OF SIMCOE, BEING PART l ON REFERENCE PLAN SIT-2097 

(THE "COTI AGE PROPERYn). 

35. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Land Registry Office for the Land Titles Division of Metropolitan 

Toronto (No. 80) shall register this Order against title to the lands and premises known municipally as 76 Densley 

A venue, Toronto, Ontario and legally described as LT 4 PL 4325 NORTH YORK; TORONTO (N YORK), CITY 

OF TORONTO (the "DENSLEY PROPERTY"). 

36. THIS COURT ORDERS that the MATRIMONIAL HOME shall not be sold, transferred or encumbered 

without the Applicant's consent. 

37. THIS COURT ORDERS that the DENSLEY PROPERTY and/or the KING PROPERTY may 

immediately be listed for sale to fund the receivership and obligations thereof. 
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Put a line through any blank space left on this page. 

Date of signature Signature of judge or clerk of the court 
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CERTIFICATE NO.----­

AMOUNT$.~-----~-

Court Fiie Number FC-19-0058934-0000 

SCHEDULE II A" 

RECEIVER CERTIFICATE 

1. THIS IS TO CERTIFY that Dodick Landau Inc., the receiver (the "Receiver") of the assets, undertakings 

and properties of Frank Zuccaro, 863704 Ontario Limited, Metropolitan Ice Cream Inc. and Oraccuz Holding Inc. 

including all proceeds thereof (collectively, the "Property") appointed by Order of the Ontario Superior Court of 

Justice (the "Court") dated the_ day of November, 2020 (the "Order") made in an application having Court 

file number FC-19-0058934-0000, has received as such Receiver from the holder of this certificate {the "Lender") 

the principal sum of$ _____ , being part of the total principal sum of$ _____ which the Receiver 

is authorized to borrow under and pursuant to the Order. 

2. The principal sum evidenced by this certificate is payable on demand by the Lender with interest thereon 

calculated and compounded [daily][monthly not in advance on the day of each month] after the date 

hereof at a notional rate per annum equal to the rate of ___ per cent above the prime commercial lending rate 

of Bank of from time lo time. 

3. Such principal sum with interest thereon is, by the terms of the Order, together with the principal sums 

and interest thereon of all other certificates issued by the Receiver pursuant to the Order or to any further order 

oflhe Court, a charge upon the whole of the Property, but subject to the priority of the charges set out in the Order 

and in the Bankruptcy and /11solvency Act, and the right or the Receiver to indemnify itself out of such Property 

in respect of its remuneration and expenses. 

4. All sums payable in respect of principal and interest under this certificate are payable at the main office 

of the Lender at Toronto, Ontario. 

S. Until all liability in respect of this certificate has been terminated, no certificates creating charges ranking 

or purporting to rank in priority to this certificate shall be issued by the Receiver to any person other than the 

holder of this certificate without the prior written consent of the holder of this certificate. 

6. The charge securing this certificate shall operate so as to pennit the Receiver to deal with the Property as 

authorized by the Order and as authorized by any further or other order of the Court. 

7. The Receiver does not undertake, and it is not under any personal liability, to pay any sum in respect of 

which it may issue certificates under the terms of the Order. 
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DATED the __ day of Novembert 2020. 

Court Fiie Number FC-19-0058934-0000 

Dodick Landau Inc., solely in its capacity 
as Receiver of the Property, and not in its 

personal capacity 

Per: 

Name: 
Title: 
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AGREEMENT OF PURCHASE AND SALE 
(FOR USE IN THE PROVINCE OF ONTARIO) 

PURCHASER. SHARMA CAPITAL ltN1rE.o W1TH RJGHT To Ass1GN , C1grees to r.urchase lru·n 

VENDOR. __ .;;;o..;;o""'o.;..;1c"'-K;...;LA=.;.;.N='D..;...A=u...;.IN"'"c= • ...;;.A..;..c;;..;TI..;..~.;..;G;;...As'-"""...;;c'""o'""u;.;.;R..;..T...;..A.;;;..P .... P""'o""'1N;..;.T=eo~R=e=ce='v...;..e=R..;;..;..cA~N.;;;.o~M=A=N_..A""G""'e"""R .... A ... ~=o ..... N ..... o .... ~ ____ 1N ..... ' 1 ..... rs ......... P ..... e ..... Rs .... o .... N_A_1_o_R 

"""C....,0.._R ... PO ........ R._A_TE ....... C_A_P_A_C_ITV ______________ ___________________ • tile followll'g 

REAL PROPERTY: 

Address 76 Densley Ave_n.i.10 ___ fronltng on the North •rni•'? of OeMlc·y AvenLJo 

1nthP ____ ~C~i~t'-"'o~f~T~o~ro.:;.;..:.nt~o'--------------------------------------
and l!Jving a t·ontnge or ns pe· S::.hedute ·a n ore or less by a depth of as p-:ir Sche,Jule B" more or less and lecahy 

d~scr bej as T 4 PL 4325 NQ~TH YORK. TORON ro (N YORK!. CITY OF TOROr-. TQ__\lhe •0 ropcrty"). 

PURCHASE PRICE, ___ , ___ Dollnrs (CONS _ _. •••• LJ 

Havmg inspected the premises or plan~. hereby offer to purchase through, 

CBRt United, Real Estate Brokerage 

AND CBRE L 011;ec1 Rer;' f'.st;:ite ArokP.·;:ir.p 

OErOSIT: 

The Purchaser submits (Up O.cBfCCr>t. l"lCI') 

{Listing Brol<er) 

<Co-operating Bro .er 

~·'i$ 1~r> 
11~go1iable cheque payable t , _-3/ 'BRE L1m1ted Real Estate Brokerage (the ~First Deposit) to be reld 1n 

t•ust µerding co:np et1on or o:her tennim1llon of th s Ag·eemcnt and to be credited lowara tno Purc11<1sc Pr·cc on 

complot1on. PurchD~ ... r agrtes I? i;ay tht: balance <i'> follow~ 

Balance of purclYSC! pnce lo be paid by MW bank draft or cert f1c:1 cheque on the Comµlct on Dato 

IT IS UNDERSTCOD AND AGREED THAI SCHEDULE 'A" Al I ACHED HERETO SHALL BE READ WITH AND FORM A 

PART OF THIS AGHl:l::MENT OF PURCHfl.SE & SALE AND TO BE INITIALLED FOR PURPOSES OF IDENTIFICATION 

SCHEDULE(S) _____ ·;_, ________ J\TIACHED H::f• 10FOR'.1(!l!PARJ OF- T ISAGREr:"'!:Nl 

CHATTELS INCLUOEO _N .... A_.._ __ 

~ IXfURESEXCLUOED~S~oo"-"'S~xh~OO'"'""'u~l~-·~A---------------------------------~ 

3 RE"lTAL ITEMS Tho lolowino <iqwpmonl 1:1 1ui1ted .mu 1101lntluJ.:tJ,1 th•• Pu1\;h<11:;e Prtce lr1~ t-'ur1; 1a5r:r .igrees .o assumt: Ute rt'' t:11 coo·raU(!i) 

,fa suir.at!e io111ater . .rflll!.lUank...1awl .. annu.LLs.,.y..,,,,,.1,."'n .... 1 --------------------------------

4 IRREVOCABILITY Thl5 Offer ~·ia: btHrrevoca!>I• tJy Pu•ctia«11' 11n1tl 5 00 pm ClO t:1,1 .l ~II d;ay of Mor!Cl1 • 2021 lrllr 
,.., 1 ne. "rot acccplt<I, lh!:> Offer sha! ~ "t:'I and vod M~ 'M ::epos t sha ro returned to u o PurchasN n fell \•.,thoot 1~1ercst 

, .. 

5 C0\1PLETION DATE This Agrlcrrcn! Shi!!I be cornpletP.d by no later t•1a11 U CO p Ill. on llt! See Schedule "A" Urion c.omp1(' ' ,If" fl 

7 

8 

, r,<1nl possession of the prcpeny sial be given to th~ Purchaser u11e!.S olhElMlS!t prov~cd lo n llus Ar;rnorrent 

NOTICES J1:1xklr tien:lJy llpi;ocr.:.s ll':l) LM ng Ur.>!lc es A'J'!f t lo< tic curµJSu of g .111y lllill rt:ee . ng no::ccs pursua11 b th,. A)reement 11 ltie ~-;;jler 1 g 
;'!rn~ • , '''I"·" ,., ltl •• ·•Iii'""" cf th> Puret\:.l r 1 u, trn"l::m;ti:>n :!>0 l'u-ctwu.r t:•·•el>} •PP0111I:. I "' C~J oJ ""' 8•0<t:: t "{l!!nl IU' It!• 1iuµose t: '.J ·1~ 
md n·...e \ m9 1101ic 1 m:;.;<1 to tt'•" Agtc<ll'l"lll AA\ no11•e rclat.1Q lioMo or IHJ\I Cf:d '.:i1 lww n ,;·.:ill hi' 11 "' 111•1 Thi~ r111!1r, :my coo 1lur 011or, nctto or 
• ccoptancc thc:·•·ot o· <in1 no r.c sh~ll be dMrncd c ~un ar.u l!..'Ce11ild, whJn hM1d 11rl1:,te•M to tho ::iddr·' .. $ Im ,nrw·t> prm1ded hcmfll or \' roro n far:~ molo 
nulf l>O• is pro JI I 1tuuo1n wl on l•on::.mitte.1 11 uc;ron~Jll/ 1•111 ,,. I.rt •,,fll e r uu .l~r 

~A'XIJO :11; 2=1 :<tr; Forde Of'/ .!n t to Vern! r:,x .o of~tOf't:rchlSC'} 

!'re 
u., 

39



DocuSign Envelope ID: 5850921C·A6A1-4C3B·/\82A-FG4C46252B8B 

property, and Vendor agrees to execute and deliver such further aU1horiZalions in this regard as Purchaser ma:{ reasonably require, 
!!. FUTURE USE: Vendor and Purchaser agree that there i'> nc ropr~sentiltion or warranty fJf uny kind ltl:ll lhe ruturo intended uso of the property tJy Purcha!i!lr is 

or will be law!ul excop! as may be specif.>Cally i:rovkled ror in this Agr1:ement. 

10. TITLE: Providod that the titlo to the property is good and free from all registered restrictions, ch<Ug~s. liens, and 6ncurnbrances eii:.cept as otherwise spcc1f1cally 
provided in this Agreement and save and e.-:cept lor (a} any regislored resL-ici!ons or covenants that run w.th the land providing that such me complied with: 
(b) any regislerod municipal agreements an(l rc9is1ercd rigrccmonts with publicty regulated u!il;!1:J5 pro·1i:Jng such havo boon r.omplied with. or security has 
~en posted to ensure compliance and con1pl111Jon, as e•1idenced by a lottE:r from 1111:1 1e!;:\li'lnt mun:;;;p;il1ly or r11gulated utility; (c} any minor easemt?nt:; fer the 
supply or domestic utility or telephone seivices to the property or adjacent propurties: and (d) any uasumor:ts fm drainage. storm or sanitary suweri;, publtc 
utility lint'!., telophono lines, coble television fines or other :icrviccs whicli do not materially ufltlct tho pr t::Jc11t usu of thu p1opert¥. Ir wrthin the spetificd hmcl; 
referred to in paragraph 6 any valid objection to litlo or to any outstanding work order or deficiency noticn, or to !he facl lhe said present use may not lawfully ho: 
conti11uod, or !hat the principal bi1ilding may not bo insured against rislc of fire is rnacto in wrrtlng to Vendor and which Vendor is unable or unwilling lo remove. 
remedy or satisfy and which Purchaser will not waive. !his Agreement notwithstanding any lnlermadiale acts or negotiations in respect of such objections, shall 
oo al an end and all moriles paid shall be returned without Interest or deduction and Vendor, Listing Broker rind Co-operating Broker iitmll not be liable for imy 
costs or damages. Save as to any valid objection so mado by such day and except fc:ir any objection going to the root of the tll111, Purchaser shall be 
conclusively deemed to have accepted Vendor's lltle to the property. 

1 t. DOCUMENTS AND DISCHARGE: Purchaser shall not call for lhc production o! any titla deed, abstr;i:;t, i:urJ1Jy or other evidence of liUc to lho proport)' 
except such as are in the possession or control or Vendor. If requested by Purchaser. Vendor will deliver any sketch or survey of the properly within Vancl0t'r. 
control to Purchaser as soon as J)OSSllllO ana prior to the Re<julsition Dale. If a dischaf9f: of any Chargi:/Mortgage held by a ccrporalion incorporated pursuant 
lo thl! Loan Companies Act (Canada), Chartered Bank. Trust Company, Credit Unlcin, Caisse Populairc or Insurance Company and which is not to be assumed 
by Purchaser on completion, is not available in regislrnblc form en complc!ioo, Purchaser agra.>s to a~c;;! Vendor's lawyer's perseni!l undertaking to obtain. 
out of the do~.in9 funds, a d:scharge in registrable form and to register same on lit!e wrtttin a reasonab!e period of time after completion, provided !hat on or 
before completion Vendor shall provide to Purchaser a mortgage statement prepared b}· the mortgagee selling out the balance required to obtain the disciwrgc. 
together wrth a direction CY.cruled by Vend0t dirn1.1ing payment to lhe mongagee of the amount n,>quircd to obtuin the discharge out of the balance due on 
completion. 

i·• INSPECTION: Purchaser aclmowiedges having had the opportunity to inspect the property prier to submitting this Offer and undersbnds lhat upon 
acceptance or this Offer there shall be binding agreement of purchase and sale bct.vcen Purchmmr and Vendor. 

13, INSURANCE: All buildings on the property and :in other things being purchased shu!I be and remain until completion at the risk of Vendor. PervJ1n!J 
completion, Vendor shaH hold all insurance policies. if any, and the proceeds thereof in trust for tho parties as their interests may appear and in tile event or 
t>ubstantial dam.1ge, Purchaser may either termina!e this Agreement and have all monies paid returned without interest or deduction or else take the proceeds 
of any insurance and compkite the purchase. No insurance shall be transferred on r.omp!ellon. II Vonclor is taking back a Charge/Mortgage, or Purchaser i$ 
a$sumlng o Charge/Mortgage. Purchaser shalf supply vendor with reasonatlle evidence of adequate insurance to protect Vender's or other mortgageo's intorest 
011 completion. · 

14. PLANNING ACT: This Agreement shall be offoctive lo cronte nn interest in tho property only ii Vendor cornp!ius with tho subdivision control provisions or lhc 
Planning Act by completion and Vendor covenants to proceed diligently al his oxpenso to obtain nny necessary consent by completion. 

15. DOCUMENT PREPARATION: The Transfer/Deed shall, save for the Land Translcr Tax Alf;dav;t, bo prcparod in registrable form at tho eJ(pense ol Vendor, 
and 11ny Charge!Mortgage lo be given back by tho Purchasor to Vendor at the expense of tt:o Purchaser. If requei.:ed by Purchaser, Vendor co·1cnan1s Illa! lhti 
TransforlDocd to be de!iverod on completion shall r.ontaln tho siateinents contemplated by St.'Clion 50 (22) of tho Planning Act, R.S.O. 1990. 

16. RESIDENCY: (a} Subject to (b) below, the Vendor represents and warrants thal the Vendor is not and on completion will not be n non-residc..nl under tho non· 
residency provisions of the Income Tax Act which representation and warranty shall survive and not merge upon the compW!ion of this transaction and the 
Vendor shall deliver to the Purchaser a statutosy declaration that Vendor is not Ulen a non-resident of Canada; (b) provided that if the Vendor is a non.rr,!tidcnt 
under tile no.n-residcncy pT0\1sionS of the Income Tax Act., lhe Purchaser shall be credaed towards the Purchase Price with the amount. if an>-. nccosr.ary for 
Purchaser to pay to the Minister or National Revenue to satisfy Purchaser's liability in respect of tax payable by Vendor under the norwesiduncy provisions of 
the lnCQ!lo Tax Act by reason of this sale. Purchaser stmll not claim such credit i1 Vendor delivers on oompletion the prescfiood certificate. 

17. ADJUSTMENT: Any rents. mortgage interest, really taxeG including local improvement rates and unmeterod public or private uti~t,, charge-s aml unmetered 
cost of lut1I, ;:is applicable, shall be apportioned ond n!lowed to lhe day or completion, th'! day of completion itf>elf lo be apportioned to Purchaser. 

18 TIME LIMITS: Time shall in an respects be or the essence hereof provided that lhe time for doing or completing or any matter provided for herein may !Je 
eJr.tended or abridge<! by an agreement in wnbng signed by Vendor and Purchaser er by their respe:;live lawyers who may be specifically authOrized 111 that 
rl)<Jard. 

19. TENDER: Any tunder of documents or money horcunder may he made upon Vendor or Pure/laser er their rnspecove l<JWyers on .the day set for r.cmplotion. 
Money shall be te1ldered wilh funds drawn Oil 11 lawyer's !rust account In the form of 11 bank draft. cortifiad c:hequo or wire lra11$for using the Lmgo V11luo 
Transfer System. 

20. FAMILY LAW ACT: Vendor warrants that sPousal consent is not necessary to this transaction uncl11r tht! provir~ons of thu Family Law Act, R.S.O. 1990 unless 
Vendor's spouse lms executed the consent hereinafter providad. 

21. UFFI: V&ndor represents and warrants lo Purchaser Iha! during the time Vcnaor has owned the property, Vendor has not caused any building on Iha property 
to be rnsulalml with insulation containing urea form;i!dehydo, :md that to the best of Vendor's kn()Y;l<XJg,1 no building on the property contabs or h3s cvur 
contain<Xl insulation that contains urea fomlaldehyde. ll1is warmnl}' sh.'lll su:vive and not m•Jrgt.: on lliu o.1mp!otion of this transaction. am! if the bui!ding is part 
of a multiple unit building; this warranty shall only apply to that part of 1hc building which is the sut:ject ol lhis transaction. 

22. CONSUMER REPORTS: Tho Purchaser is hereby notified that a consun:er report cont.ming CN<lit and.'or personal inlcrrnmion may be referred 10 in 
connection with U1i5 transaclioo. 

23. AGENCY: II is understood that the brokers invo!vud in thu trans<1clion represent the parties n:> set 001 in II;;, Ccnfirmat;on of Re;>resentatiOll below. 
24. AGREEMENT IN WRmNG: If there is conf.ict bulween any provision written or typed in this Agreument (inc:ud1ng any Schedule attached hereto) and ony 

provision In the printed portiOn hereof, the written or typed provision shall supelSede the printed provision to lhe extent of such conflict. This Agreement 
induding any Schedule attached hereto, shall constilute the entire Agreement between Purchaser and Vendor. There is no representation, warranty, collateral 
agreement or coml1tlon, which affects this Agreement other than as expressed herein. This Agreument shall be mad with ail changes or gender or number 
required by the conte.d. 

25. CLOSING ARRANGEMENTS: Where each or the Vendor and Purchaser retain a lawyer to complete the Agreement of Purchase and Sele of thn pro!l(lrty, 
and where tho tr<1nsaction will.be completed by electronic registration pursuant to Part Ill of tho Land Regis1re1tion Reform Act, R.S.O. 1990, Chupter L4 and 
the Electronic Rogislration Acl, S.O. 1991. Chapler 44, and any amendments lherelo, the Vendor and Purchaser acknowledge and agree that tho exchange 
of closing funds. non·regislrabie documents and olher ilums (tho 'Requisllo Deliveries") Md tho reloaso thereof lo the Vendor and Purchaser will (a) no: 
occur at the same limo as the registration of tho tr<insfer/dcod (and any other documents intondud lo be ruoi:stmed in connection with the completion ol 1111s 
trarts3ction) and (tJ) be subject to conditions whereby tho lnwyc1(s) receiving any of !he Requislle Deliverre!> will be required to hold SillTle ln trust and not 
mlt:as" same except in accordancQ with the terms oJ a document registration agreement belwoon me said la"')'en;. The Vendor and Purchaser Irrevocably 
instruci !he r.aid lawyers lo be bound by the document regislration agreement Which is recommended from hme to time by the Law Society of Upper Canada. 
Unless otherwise agroed to by the lawyers. such exchange of the Requisite Detiv~ries wi!I occur in tho applicable Land Titles Ollico or such other location 
agreeable lo both l:wr;ers. 

26. SUCCESSORS AND ASSIGNS: The heirs, executors, administrators. successors and assigM cf the undersigned are bound by the terms herein 

INlfllll.S UF F'UHCHASEH: ~ 1NiTlt.LS OF VENOOR. @ 
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Mississauga 5th 
DATED ATC...--'--------------"'"' _x ______ dayo! .. x'-----------· 2021. 

March 

SIGNED. SEALED AND DELIVERED in lhe presence of: 

(Witness) 

(Witness) 

IN WITNESS whereof I have hereunto set my hand: 

~-·.Mdby: . • 

x~A-(~C 

(Purchaser) 

Date X 3/S/2021 

I, tho U"doraigned Vandot, agroo to ltltl nbove Aynum1t11ll of Purchaw & Snlo. I hurtiby irrevocably instruc1 my lawyer to pay diredly lo ttie LiSling Brokor and any sub-agents 
tho unpaid balance of the commi$Sion as outlined in the existir19 MLS agrooment togelt.er with applicable Goods an<l Services Tax (and any other taxes as may hereafter be 
applicable). fmm the proceeds of the sale. -1ti..... 
OATEOAT Tacci:r=-,..\-o this S ooyof L:(Cl!J-.vh, , 2021. 

. . 
SIGNED. SEALED'AND DELIVERED In the presence of: .IN WITNESS \vheroof I havo horounto sot my hand: , . ~ 

~cJ.c;. ~ ~<:: • o.d1 t"\CJ P'f . . · . ~ or 
O-.f>,eo1r...~ RQ .. cJ2..ivcu- a..A~ ~O"\ l" t ~ p<?A~01"'\ 
<'.¢• f"'~··-LJ., Doto ~cJ, S 'Zo?_' 

(Witness) (Vendor) ~ ~ / 
?V-~ ,,- 2--·' 

(Witness) (Vendor) 
Date ---------

SPOUSAL CONSENT: .The Undersigned Spouse of the Vendor hereby coosents to llt0 disposition evideneed horoln pumuant lo the pro11islons of the Family Lnw Ad. R.S.O. 
199(), and hereby agrees with the Purchaser Iha! he/she wi!I execute all necossnry or incidenlal documoms to give lull fotco and effect to tho sale ovidonced herein. 

Daie 
(Seal) ~---------------

CONFIRMATION OF ACCEPTANCE: Notwithstanding anything contained herein to tho conlrary, I c:onflrm.lhls Agroomont with all changes 

both typed and written was finally executed by all parties at~ a.m~is ~day of /1 CcA. Ch , 2021. 

pir·.~~-· 
(Slgllllturo Of Vandor or Purchllsor) 

CONFIRMATION OF REPRESENTATION 

I hereby ncl<nowtedge arid confinn tho Listing Broker represents the Interests ot the 
Vendor tn 1111s 1rarnuic11~n. · 

HwNi of Li.>till!l Br0>-er. . CBRE Limilod. Roal Estate Brokerage 
(416)494--0600 (416)494-&;35 
TefN~ FAA NO. 

I herobY acknowlooge and COllfirm the Co-operating Broker ropr1111~n1s the interests 
of lhe Purchaser In lhls 1tansaci1on. 

Nan--c :! Co-Opt.~ll!mg a.-.~ •. r; 
(4161674-7900 
Te!No. 

CBRE limited. Real Estate Brokerage 
(416) 674-6575 
f/\XNO. 

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT 
I acknm'lledge receipt of my :signed cop)' of this accepted Agfeenent of Purc:hase 
and Salo and I mithorize Ille Agent to tcrward a copy to mY lawyer. 

-----------------~ome (Winder) 

___________________ 0.1110 

(V<lndor) 

Addrtts!l ror Service: 

,,__..,.... ___________ Tel.No . ._c __ .._ ________ _ 

Vendor's LSV.)'<?r 

Addru:lll: 

Toi.No. FAX NO. 

f OH OFFICI: ui;t ONLY 

I acknowledge receipt of my signed copy ol lhis acceplcd Agreement of Purchaso 
and Sale and I authorize 111., /lgenl to fo:ward a copy lo my lnwyor. 

01110 
~(P~u-n:h..,....ase __ tj,.... ............ --------------

..,,,.._,. ...... ----------------0~0 (Purelulsor) 

Ad<lress for Service. 

=-....,....-.,....,------------Toi.No. 
Purchaser's Lawyer 

Address: 

Tel.No. FAX NO.: 

COMMISSION TRUST AGREEMENT 
To. C1>o;>em1:"9 llrokP: :!.hO'Mi an Int- fo,.,9o'n9 ll!)1Nlmen1 c• Purcr.1SC and Sn!e: 
t:i o:iw,;..:.detabcn fQr tho Co-QOl!'ratmq Htckcr procurtrr:Q too for«Jtl3\g AQ'eemenl of Pmdi.;av.a ahd S..i.t. t h'.:l\lby d<.<!.utt mo• DU moo.•c~ tte,:r,.c.d v rt.-<»i-Mb!e by""' tll OOl'trM?dc-• _,.-~, U1u Tf.t.h~n.>tl U$ 

CCt"i\t"f't1;::L1t'.!'d m lh6 MLS Ru~M and Rego~11,ton!) of my R9JI Es~ Board ~Ube ~(P.iv::tte ar1d hC:d &l tru~. TIW ;i-'l!~-n-t:onl "ir:,\t; m.,..,•~utrJ a C".'.1n:...,to~s4ctl Tru\.I ;~•(1~!.'l~.1 ~~s. ;jl}•tu:-«: ·:'l the MLS 
Ro..,,: and stv<• !"<• ~t.iul ti> nnd !Jto""'ned by th• ~:J.S R:i;.,., ~"9 10 Ccmor......,cn Trwt. 

INITIALS OF PURCHASER: ~ INrTIAl.S OF'VENOOR; © 
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SCHEDULE "A" 

To be read with and form a part of this Agreement to Purchase and Sale between: 

SHARMA CAPITAL LIMITED WITH RIGHT TO ASSIGN (BUYER) AND 
DODICK LANDAU INC. ACTING AS COURT APPOINTED RECEIVER AND MANAGER AND NOT IN ITS 
PERSONAL OR CORPORATE CAPACITY (SELLER) 

1. BALANCE OF PURCHASE PRICE 

The Buyer agrees to pay the balance of the Purchase Price on closing with funds drawn on the trust account 
of an Ontario lawyer in good !>landing in the form of a certified cheque or wire transfer using the Large 

Value Transfer System. 

2, FURTHER DEPOSIT 

ln-the~entthat-thtsAgreemen~o~PuF£hase-aAG-s.He-+s-subjeG-te-aR'j-eoodit-ion5--iA-f.cwew:-of..tAe-R~ 

I 
is mutually-understood-and-agreedtllat-the-Swer shall pav-aseconddepos1t-io the amount-of r-"' ,-z. 

Canadian-DoJ!Ns-oywayokertmed cheque l.lj;? [G2J or wir<> '"'"'"'" lo bo>-held by t!NHJ"i"l!-B•okef'~n-tru<t,ponding completion o•- te<minatlon of-this 
;1 C'\ \ Aer~~nd-to--he-c.r4i><l~ted--t-oward-the-P\Jrchase -Price on completion. Such-~ccond-def)(>Sit;~ 

~II deli•1ered-t-O-the-L-isting-Broker. immediately. upon· -fem~~~s per this 

Agreement· of-flurehase-aA&-Sale-. 

3. DEPOSIT DIRECTION 

I he Buyer and Seller hereby direct the Listing Broker holding the deposit and any further deposits in this 

transaction to place same into an interest bearing account or term deposit in a chartered bank, with any 
accrued interest to be paid to the Buyer immediately upon completion or other termination of this 
agreement, provided the deposit is held for a minimum of 30 days. 

4. COMPLETION DATE ANO VESTING ORDER 

/ ~. The Receiver and the Buyer acknowledge that this Agreement is subject to Court approval and to the 

I A._, issuance of a Vesting Order. The Seller shall use ils cornrner~:l~~ea.:~nable efforts to obtain a Vesting ~ .acceptance of tb1s re {Tien! . 
1 ~- der as soon as reasonably possible following ~wer-Of S~ ' GA$;*-aflyT The closing date of this 

Agreement shall be on the 5f0/husiness day following the date the Seller obtains Court approval and a _.,.. 
'-l~S::m ... yesting Order hwt-no.s.eoAer--than~B..!.t.t·(W~O) days <inct-no-ltll-t:t-t.J.!~~-M,;_:.11'.!Y.zti'em-watveF-ef.all-BuyeH (~L/? 

•· ~Rdlt4&ns-set..fie.re»l, or su_ch other date as the parties hereto shall mutually a9r~e to. ·-
It ;s mutually a!:)ret!d thnt the c.los1ng date sh;.111 not l.»J sourrnr than 3:') day:; from Um acce;itance o, this :igreemer.t and not i.:;tor thc.u1 

rJ""Vll~~__,o..._. days from the: acccpt.inr.11 of this fl!)m1!·n~nl 
The Seller shall advise rh1° f1.1ye_r_ •Jf tht:. ..i~rl~t'. Oc1.~\'JJ:iJ~_hJL~1.1.ar1 io '·<'c:k thr• VPt;:inn fodt>r, nrior to r.,. 

'-~...m;...., r~!~t;_!iri..£ thr. Vcsting_Ordcr fro1'1 the (our:. . I E d' /1 
1 he Buyer shall advise the Soller no :a1ur ll1iln 30 <Jays from the dnle nt 3c.ceptancc of U11s agree·ncnt 11 the Buyer intends to ass:c:n ...:::::.:;__~ / 
and the 1>ame of tilt: ,1:.signt:e m orlltr I hat me App,1ca:1on ror Vt:stJng ()rcler CiJil be made in t!1u name ct 111<! rniended trnnsfnee 

SELLER DELIVERIES 

Buyer and Seller acknowledge and agree that the Ouyer shall be pro11ided access to all due diligence 
materials provided by the Seller through the agent's data room (Sharefile) upon execution of this 
Agreement. The B1.1ycr ~cccpts end acknowledges that tht!51! mdlt!ridb drt! thl:! Seller'!> Deliveries and as 
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Page 2 of Schedule "A" 

To be read with and fo;m a part of this Agreement to Purchase and Sale between: 

SHARMA CAPITAL LJMITED WITH RIGHT TO ASSIGN (BUYER) AND 
D_ODICK LANDAU INC. ACTING AS COURT APPOINTED RECEIVER AND MANAGER AND NOT IN ITS 
PERSONAL OR CORPORATE CAPACITY (SELLER) . 

such, will not receive any further documents upon closing. CBRE limited does not represent, warrant, or 
guarantee.the accuracy, correctness, and completeness of the information. 

6. LEGAL ADVICE 

The parties to this Agreement acknowledge that CBRE Limited is acting as the Listing and the Co-operating 
Broker, and has recommend~ that any legal advice or tax advice sought be obtained through the parties' 
own legal counsel and accountant(s). The parties further acknowledge that no information provided by 
CBRE limited, if any, is to be construed as expert legal or tax advice. Further, the parties to this transaction 
hereby acknowledge that the Listing Broker and Co-operating Broker are the same firm, such that there 
has been; and is dual agency, the Seller and the Buyer having previously consented to suchdual agency and 
waiving any conflict of interest or duty of confidentiality. 

7. ASSIGNMENT 

It is agreed that the Buyer shall have the right at any time prior to closing to assign this Agreement to a 
corporation or corporations, and/or persons, and when·such assignment shall have been made and written 
notic~ thereof shall hav~ been. giv~n to the Seller or its Solicitors, the assignee shall assume all the Buyer's 
rights: and obligations hereunder to the same extent and in the same manner as if such assignee had 
executed this Agreement of Purchase and Sale as Buyer, and thereupon all of the obligations oft.he Buyer 
hereunder shall cease and terminate. 

8 •. CHAmLS AND FIXTURES 

The purchase price includes all existing electric. light. fixtures, heating equipment, air conditioning 
equipment,.anci appurtenances thereto and all other chattels, fixtures and equipment, which may be the 
property of the seller and used in connection with the operation of the Property. 

9. AGENCY DISCLOSURE 

The Seller and .the Buyer acknowledge that CBRE Limited is acting as the Agent of the Seller and the Buyer 
on the. proposed transaction between the two principles above noted. The Buyer'~>Agent shall be 
comp~nsated by the Seller, through the Listing Brokerage (CBRE Limited) as perthe MLS Agreement. 

10. NO AGREEMENTS/LEASES 

Following the acceptance of this Agreement of Purchase and Sale, no agreement to lease, lease 
amendment or other commitment or agreement relevant to the operation, maintenance and management 
of the Property shall be made or renewed. by the Seller, withoutthe priqr written consent of.tfle Buyer, 
such consent not to be unreasonablywlthheld or delayed. 

11. TRANSFER OF WARRANTIES/GUARANTEES 
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Page 3 of Schedule "A" 
To be read with and form a part of this Agreement to Purchase and Sale between: 

SHARMA CAPITAL LIMITED WITH RIGHT TO ASSIGN {BUYER) AND . 

DODICK LANDAU INC. ACTING AS COURT APPOINTED RECEIVER AND MANAGER AND NOT IN ITS 
PERSONAL OR CORPORATE CAPACITY (SELLER} 

The S_eUer CO\fenants and agrees to transfer to the Buyer on closing all warranties and guaranties, if any, 
which.are transferable in its possession, covering heating systems, eleetrical systems, air·conditiOning 
systems, roof repairs, asphalt, and plumbing systems now in the premises. 

12. AS IS, WHERE IS 

The Buyer acknowledges and agrees with and to the Seller (it being acknowledged that the Seller is relying 
on such acknowledgements and agreements in entering into this Agreement) as follows: 

a) Except for the obligations of the Seller as expressly set out in this Agreement, the Property is being 
sold by the Seller, and is being purchased by the Buyer, strictly on an "as is" basis, wi.thout any 
representation, warranty or covenant by the Seller or any other Person concerning the property, 
the Seller's or the Debtor's right, title or interest in or to the property or the chattels or fixtures, 
or the uses or applications of the property or the chattels or fixtures, whether express or implied, 

statutory or collateral, arising by operation of law or otherwise, including express or implied 
warranties of merchantability, fitness for a particular purpose, the .existence or non-existence of 
Hazardous Materials, c9mpllance with any or an Environmental° laws, title, description, quantity, 
c.ondition or quality, and that.any and all conditions and warranties expressed or implied by the 
Land Registration Reform Act (Ontario) or the Sale of Goods Act (Ontario) do not apply to the sale 

of the Subject Assets and are hereby waived by the Buyer. 

b) Except as expressly set out in this Agreement, no representations or warranties of any nature or 
kind have been made or will be made by the Seller, or anyone acting on behalf of the Seller, 

whether before or.after execution of this Agreement or the Closing Date, to orfor the benefit of 
the Buyer with respect to the Property, including· without limitation, any representation or 
warranty relating to any of the following matters: physical condition (which includes environmental 
condition and soil condition), quantity, quality, fitness for purpose, zoning, compliance with 
Applicable Laws, lawful use, availability of lawful access to or from the Property. 

c) Without limiting the foregoing, but except as expressly set out in this Agreement, no 
representations or warranties have been made or will be made by the Seller, or anyone acting on 

behalf of the Seller, to or for the benefit of the Buyer as to the future development of the Property, 
the suitability or status of any proposed development of the Property, the nature, timing or cost 
of any development proposal, the availability of any approvals or the nature or cost of any 
obligations and liabilities which will be or may be incurred by the Buyer in connection with any 
construction undertaken by it. 

d} The Buyer is relying solely on its own due diligence, title searches, and other searches, Inspections 
and investigations in purch<!sing the Property. 
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Page 4 of Schedule "A" 

To be.read with and form a part of this Agreement to Purchase and Sale between: 

SHARMA CAPITAL LIMITED WITH RIGHT TO ASSIGN (BUYER) AND 
DODICK LANDAU INC. ACTING AS COURT APPOINTED RECEIVER AND MANAGER AND NOT IN ITS 
PERSONAL OR CORPORATE CAPACITY (SELLER) 

.e) The Buyer acknowledges that any documents, materials and information provided by or on behalf 
of the Seller to the Buyer with respect to the Property, whether before or after the Acceptance 
Date have been provided to the Buyer solely to assist the Buyer in undertaking its own due 
diligence, and the Seller has not made and is not making any.representations or warranties, implied 
or otherwise, to or for the benefit of the Buyer as to the accuracy or completeness of any such 
documents, materials or information. The Buyer acknowledges that it has not ·and will not rely 
upon any such documents, materials or information in any manner, whether as a substitute for or 
supplementary to its own due diligence, searches, Inspections and evaluations. The Seller shall not 
be liable for: any inaccuracy, incompleteness or subsequent changes to any such documents, 
materials or information. 

f} The Seller shall not be required to produce any abstract of title, deed or documents or copies 
thereof or any evidence as to title. 

g) The transfer of title to the Subject Assets may be subject to certain work orders; municipal 
requirements, including building or zoning by-laws and regulations, easements for hydro, gas, 
telephone affecting the Subject Assets, and like services to the Property, and restrictions and 
covenants which run with the land, including but not limited to the Permitted Encumbrances. 
Without limiting the foregoing, the Vendor shall not be responsible for rectification of any matters 
disclosed by any Governmental Authority. 

The provisions of this Section shall not merge on, but shall survive, Closing. 

19. RIGHT TO ENTER 

Upon acceptance of the Agreement, the Seller agrees to allow the Buyer, its agents, engineers, _surveyors, 
consultants to enter upon the property at reasonable times and from time to time for the purposes of 
conducting environmental assessments, soil tests, surveys, checking elevations and conducting such other 
tests and examinations and/or performing s.uch work as may be required by the Buyer, provided that the 
property shall forthwith. be restored by the Buyer, at his sole expense, to the physical condition existing 
prior to such tests or examinations being made, and provided the Buyer provides the Seller with 48 hours 
prior notice. 

20. EXISTING TENANTS & ESTOPPEL CERTIFICATES 

The B~yer herein agrees to assume and take possession of the property subject to all the current tenancies 
in .the said property on the date of closing. Any rental deposits (i.e. last month's deposit) held by the 
Landlord (Seller). and any prepaid monthly rents to the Landlord (Seller) shall be credited to the Buyer as 
an adjustment on closing~ The Seller will provide estoppel certificates for each tenant up to Ten (10) 
business days prior to the Closing Date in the form acceptable to the Buyer executed by the tenants 
confirming among other things the basic terms of the lease and that the lease is in good standing. If an 
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Pcige 5 of Schedule "A" 

To be read with and form a part of this Agreement to Purchase and Sale between: 

SHARMA CAPITAL LIMITED WITH RIGHT TO ASSIGN (BUYER) AND 
DODI CK LANDAU INC. ~CTING AS COURT APPOINTED RECEIVER AND MANAGER AND NOT IN ITS 
PERSONAL OR CORPORATE CAPACITY (SELLER) 

estoppel certificate is not available, the Seller will execute a statutory declaration within the time period 
set out herein. 

21. CONFIDENTIALITY 

The Buyer and the Seller agree that the terms of this Agreement of Purchase and Sale shall remain in 
confidence and shall not be disclosed to any other party without the consent of the other party hereto. 

22. RECEIVER'S CAPACITY 

The Buyer acknowledges and agrees that in all matters pertaining to the sale, this Agreement, including in 
its execution, the Seller has acted and is acting solely in its capacity as receiver and manager of the property 
pursuant to an Order of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice dated November 17, 2020 and not in its 
personal, corporate, or any other capacity and the Seller and its agents, officers, directors, employees and 
representatives will have no personal or corporate liability under or as a result of this Agreement, or 

othen.vise in connection herewith. 

23. TERMINATJON 

This Agreement may be terminated at any time prior to Closing as follows: 

(a) immediately if Vesting Order is not granted by the Court by the Closing date, or such other 
date on which the parties may agree, 

(b) subject to any approvals required from the Court, If any, by mutual written consent of the 
Seller and the Buyer; 

(c) by notice from the Seller to the Buyer or from the Buyer to the Seller, following the 
issuance of an Order or any other action by a Governmental Authority to restrain, enjoin 
or otherwise prohibit the transfer of the property as contemplated hereby. 

24. 8U¥•R'& <Qfl!Dll!QNSSEU,SR'S RSPR .. ENTA>IONS ~·9 G:i'.:. 
TAis AgreemeAt ef Purel'lase aAel Sale sl=tall be conditioAa! far ten (lQ) calendar days (tAe "ConeiitioAal ~ 
Perioe") from tf:le eate of A"ll::ihml aceef)ttinee, UflOR tl:ie Buyer satisP;ing itself, in its sole, aeselute anfi 
~JAfotterei:l discretion. as to the f.ellewing (the "B1:1yer's Gondition;''}: 

1) Tf:le B1:1yer is satisfied with the enviroAR1eF1tal conelitioA of the Prnpert·;. 

If .the 81:1yer has net advised ~he Seller in writing, on. or before S:OO J3.m. on the ex13iry of the CoAditional I~ 
PerioEI, tl=!at the B1:11•cr's CenelitioAs l:iave ecen satisfied or wai•,.ied, this Agreement sl:lall be at an end, ~ 
wherc1:1pon all det*Jsits si'lall ae f:orH1with retumed to the 3u'\'CF, wltl=lout Eleduetion therefrorA and 'NitH --;z:t::? 

----~-, ,----- d 
lnmGLs1I k::L~,I 
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Page 6 of Schedule "A" 
:To be·read with and farm a part. ofthls..Agreement to Purchase and Sale between: 

SHARMA CAPITAL LIMITED WITH RIGHT TO ASSIGN {BUYER) AND 
DODICK LANDAU INC. ACTING AS COURT APPOINTED RECEIVER AND MANAGER AND NOT IN ITS 
PERSONAL OR CORPORATE CAPACITY (SEUER) 

~fie iAterost aecrued thereoA, and the Bu'fer shall have AO ft:irtf:ier e91igation ~meter tl=lis ,l\greement. The 
Buyer's Conditions are for tl'le sole benefit of tl=ie Bu•1·er anel may be 'Naived by tl'le Buyer at its sole option 
on or before tf:ie el(piry of tl:ie Conditional P~ 

+l:ie-SelleF shall eonfirm that there are no beneficial owners. tru~.t agreen-~ef-e~ld ~· 
•lll•r owoors~i~ aore•m••t<j!rior te •l••i••· ~ f2--rJ ~ 
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~~A Ontario Real Estate 
~ Association 

Amendment to ::::: TREB 

Form 570 
Agreement of Purchase and Sale - Commercial COHMUCIAI. NtlWORK 

for u~a in Iha Province of Ontorio 

BETWEEN: Sharma Capital Limited With Right To Assign 
BUYER: ...................................................................................................................................................................................................... . 

AND Dodfck Landau Inc. Acting As Court Appointed Receiver And Manager And Not In Its Personal Or Corporate Capacity 
SELLER: .........•...................................................................................•...................................................................................•........................ 

RE: Agreement of Purchase and Sole· Commercial (Agreement) ~tween the Seller and Buyer, doted the .~tl:l .. day of ......•.... M.~.~~-~········· ... 20.~~ ... 

concerning the property known as ................... ..!.~.P.;~-~-~~.'(~Y.~~.Y.~, .. T.Q~QNI9. .............................................................................. . 
.. .. . .. . .. .. . ...... .. ........ ... . . . . . .. . . . . .. .. . . .. . .. .. . . ... . . .. . . .. .. .. . . . .. . . . . . . . .. . .. . .. .. .. .. . . . . . .. ........... .. . . o~ more particularly described in the aforementioned Agremnent 

The Buyer and Seller herein agree to the following amendment(s} to the aforementioned Agreement: 

DELETE: 

PURCHASER: Sharma ~apital Limited With Right To Assign 

INSERT: 

PURCHASER: Ashiana Capital Corporation 

(---ro-=--"' INmALS OF BUVER(S): ~ INITIALS OF SELLER(S): ~ 

Form 570 Revised 2020 Pago 1 of 2 
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IRREVOCABIUTY: This Offer to Amend the Agreement sholl be irrevocable by .............................. ~~Y~L ........................... until .•.... ~.:.Q9 ......... . . 
I Seller/Buyer) (a.m_/p.m.I 

)( 

on the .. ~9 ... day of ....... ..... M.a.r~~ ...................... 20.~t., ofter which time, ii not accepted. this Offer to Amend the Agreement shall be null and void. 

For the purposes of this Amendment to Agreemenr, vBuyer" includes purcho~r and ""Seller" includes vendor. 
Time shall in all respects be of the essence hereof provided that the time for doing or completing of any matter provided for herein may be e•ffmdod or 

abridged by on agreement in writing signed by Seller and Buyer or by their respective $Olicitors who ore hereby expre!.Sly appointed in this regard. 

All other Terms and Conditions in the aforementioned Agreement to remain the same. 

SIGNED, SEALED AND DELIVERED in the presence of: IN WITNESS whereof I hove hereunto set my hand and seal: 

IWrtncss) 

r/~ru;·by.········:········ .............................. . 
~ig~i~"9"6rii~;,·;f·················· .. 

3/29/2021 
i~i;,y-•••••••••••ooO.••••••••••••••••••• 

{W,·,~~~·sy ........... • ......... ' ............................................ . 
iiki(er/Sellor/A.~ihorizcd Signing Olfice~ jOote) 

I, lhe Undersigned, agree lo the above Offer lo Amend the Agreement. 

SIGNED, SEALED AND DELIVERED in the presence of: IN WITNESS whereof I hove hereunto sel my hand and seal: 

w.,;;~~~r············ ..................................................... . .~ ... ~.~·····~············· •...... 3../..~ .. J./..~.9..~~ ... 1 
(8uyc1/Soller/Authorizcd Signing Officer} (Seol) (Dote) 

{W;1~~~~r .................................................................. . i~·11.;1..;.~ih;;;i~~J·5;9~i~90iii~;,"rj'''''················ ,!, i~i~j .................................. . 

ihe undersigned spouse of the Seller hereby consents lo the omendment(s) hereinbofore sot oul. 

........................................................................ • rseotJ io~·,~) · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · {Wilneu) !Spou~eJ 

CONFIRMATION OF ACCEPTANCE: Notwithstanding anything contained herein to the contrary, I confirm this Agreement with all changes both lyped 

and written was finally accepted by oil parties ot ............ J.: ... 5.Jo ........... this ... ,-Z~r..~ay of ........ /.~~.b ..................... 20.~.1. .. 
(o.m.~ ..•. --- r--...... . 

. __...-·C--· G L---· . 
.... ~ ....................................................................................... . 
(Signof\Jre of Seiler or Bu-1erl 

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT 
I acknowledge receipt of my signed copy of this accepted Amendment lo 
Agreement and I aurhorize rhe Brokerage IO forward a copy lo my lawyer. 

{s~(~.~~-· .............................. (J:,42.':J./?:P.?-.J 
i~i1~;f ... . . .. . . . . .. . . . . .. . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . ... .. .. ... . . .. .. . .... (o~i~j" .................. . 

Address for Service ........................................................................... . 

..... ·················································· rr~·,:·N~.·;································· 

Seller's Lawyer .................................................................................. . 

Address .................................................................................. . 

Email ............................................................................... . 

(tCl:'N~.f · ................ ,. .................. . 

I acknowledge receipt of my signed copy of this accepted Amendment to 

C
~~ I authorize the Brokerage to forward a copy lo my lawyer. 

3/29/2021 ~ ......................................................................... . 
~ll<C2'CI (Dote) 

iii~~;,· .................................................. ·······..... "(~i.;j ... ................... . 

Address for Service ........................................................................... . 

······ .............. ···································· (i~i.''NO .. j ............. ····················· 
Buyer's Lawyer .................................................................................. . 

Address .......................................................................................... .. 

Email 

. ............................................ . 
(Fox. No.) 

IB Tho trademorlu REAl.TORll>, REALTORS®, MLS®. Mul:iple lisfiog Scrv:c.,.~ a:id ouocialed logw are a .. c.ed or con~cl!Dd by 
Th~ Canadian Roel Es""" Association !CREA) and i.deniify the reel o .. ':>le prol.,nicnab who are mombco a! CREA and <he 

...., ,... c;uc!oty ol •<W1tes !hey prCYide. Used ur.dm &,,..,.., 
';· 2021. Onlat;O Real Es-ore ASIOCIOl""1 r·01teA·1. All righh re.crvetl. r;,;, lo:m wen d"""bpxl by OREA Fer l~o ""' m>d Nproduc11cn 
oy its mumbcn end lr(cniee1 en'y. /Vty other uic or rcpoaudion is pohibi'ed except wi1h i;rior wr.tten ronwnt of O~E~ Do ro• cl'<'r 
·.,.hen pr•nfog 01 reprodutll'IQ If>: stcndcrd pr.,.wr porlion. O!tfA beO!l no habiliry ICE your use of it.1\ form Form 570 Revim 2020 Pago 2 of 2 
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Superior Court of Justice, Family Cou~---­
(Name of court I Nom du tribunal) 

Court File Number I Numero de dossier du greffe 

FC-19-58934-00 

Endorsement Sheet I 
Page d'inscrlption at I au_§~ Eagl! .... ~!r.!~_t W!~t, Ne~~~!~!~! .... Q.!:l.~~.~~-_l:~Y 6~! ..... - .... 

(Municipality I Munlcipalite) 

Date 
Octobers, 

2020 

FLR·A 90 (01/09) 

Applicant(s) I Requerant(e)(s): Maria Zu~-~~.!<? __ _ 

Counsel I Avocat(e) : R. Avery Zeidman (avery@zeldmanlaw.com) 

Frank Zuccaro (R1) 
863704 Ontario Limited (R2) 
Metropolitan Ice Cream Inc. (R3) 
Oraccuz Holding Ltd. (R4) 
Giuseppe Zucarro (RS) 
Vito Antonio Zuccaro (R6) 

D Present I Comparait 

D Present I Comparait 
D Duty Counsel I 

Avocat de service 

Respondent(s) I lntime(e)(s) : .... ~llomena Zuccar.~J~?L ......... ________ ,, ___ .. __ D Present I Comparait 
D. Foggia, agent for Frank Mendicino 
(fmendiclno@csllp.ca), for R1, R2, R3, R4 

Counsel I Avocat(e): ... ~: .... ~Y..! .. 'Y . .Zeidman for~.~ .. ! .... ~~ ... ~.!___ .. _,, ............. __ _ 

D Order to go in accordance with minutes of settlement or consent filed. I 

D Present I Comparait 
D Duty Counsel I 

Avocat de service 

Ordonnance conformement au proces-verbal de /'audience de transaction ou le consentement 
depose. 

Overview 

This is AW's NM dated Sept.25/20 for: 
1. A declaration that R1, R2, R3 and R4 breached the orders dated March 11/20, June 29/20 

and August 5/20; 
2. Relief for any such breaches purusuant to Rules 1(8) and 1(8.1), including dismissal of R1's 

claims: 
3. An order that R1's motion to change the March 11/20 order, scheduled for Dec.9/20, be 

dismissed; 
4. In the alternative to the relief sought above, pursuant to s.101 of the CJA, or s.248(3)(b) of 

the OBCA, appointment of a receiver/manager in respect of R2, R3 and R4 and the Zuccaro 
Family Trust; and 

5. Further to, or in the alternative to the relief set out in para. 4, oppression remedies pursuant 
to s.248(3) of the OBCA. 

This matter was addressed today by way of Zoom conference. R1 sought an adjournment due 
to Mr. Mendicino having been called to trial, noting R1 has a motion scheduled for December 
9/20 to change the March 11/20 order which is part of the foundation of A's motion. I denied this 
request. In this regard I note there is no evidence R1 has complied with my order of June 29/20, 
despite my having given him his requested amount of time to comply. He has been given 
sufficient time to respond and indeed he has filed an affidavit sworn Oct.2/20 in response to the 
motion. I am also concerned about prejudice to A's position with further delays. 

Over AW's objections, and despite apparent failures to comply with orders of the court, I allowed 
counsel to make submissions on behalf of R1 and the corporate respondents, given the 
potentially serious consequences of the orders sought 

Background 

The parties separated in or about Spring, 2019 after 50 years of marriage. They have 3 adult 
children, all of whom have been added as co-respondents by R1. 
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R1 is the sole owner of the shares in 863704 Ontario Limited (R2). 

R2 owns a residential property, a commercial/industrial property and 10% of R3. 
R3 is owned 90% by R4 and, as indicated, 10% by R2. 

R4 is owned by R1. 

AW alleges R1 withdrew $317,000 from the parties' LOC prior to commencement of these 
proceedings. She says a further $469,000 was "siphoned" from his corporations in the two 
years prior to separation. 

On March 11/20 AW and R1 consented to an order that included the following terms : 
1. R1 to pay SS of $3,000/mo commencing March 15/20, pending return to court on July 8/20; 
2. Parties to equally bear the mortgage, property tax and home insurance costs of the MH 

pending return to court; 
3. R1 to deliver specified disclosure within 30 days, attached to an affidavit including an 

explanation of best efforts to comply and reasonable estimate of when outstanding 
disclosure would be provided; 

4. R1 to pay interim disbursements of $50,000 to AW within 30 days; 
5. R1, R2, R3 and R4 were ordered not to dissipate assets except in the ordinary course of 

business, other than payments in respect of SS, MH carrying costs and interim 
disbursements. These respondents were to deliver monthly financial reports to evidence 
compliance with the non-dissipation order. 

The pandemic then intervened. The July 8/20 date was vacated. 

AW brought an urgent motion with leave on June 29/20. An order issued, including the 
following: 
1. Within 30 days, R1 to bring himself into full compliance with his obligations under the March 

11/20 order regarding SS, payments re the MH and interim disbursements; 
2. R1 was permitted to incur debt to comply with para. 1; 
3. Within 60 days, R1 to bring himself into compliance with his disclosure obligations under the 

March 11/20 order on a best efforts basis including an affidavit describing his efforts to 
comply and an explanation as to why compliance is not possible. 

4. The SS, MH contributions, non-dissipation and interim disbursements obligations were 
continued. 

On August 5/20 the court ordered on consent that : 
1. R1 pay all carrying costs of the parties' cottage property; 
2. R1 to provide proof of such payments having been made; 
3. R1 to bring all delinquent cottage carrying costs up to date by July 22120. 

Breaches 

AW alleges breaches as follows : 
1. SS unpaid for August and September/20 contrary to the March and June orders above. 

$6000 outstanding. 
2. Home mortgage payments unpaid since prior to March, contrary to March and June orders. 

$8346.41 outstanding. 
3. Home property tax payments unpaid since prior to March, contrary to March and June orders. 

$3251.11 outstanding. 
4. Interim disbursements unpaid since deadlines of April 13 and July 29/20. $50,000 

outstanding. 
5. Cottage property payments unpaid contrary to August order above. $2404.15 outstanding. 
6. Disclosure outstanding (per EX "xx301") contrary to March and June ordered deadlines of 

April 13 and August 29 respectively; 
7. Financial reports outstanding. None provided contrary to March and June orders to prove 

non-dissipation of assets. 

Total funds alleged outstanding amount to $70.001.67 as of September 24/20. 

In addition to the foregoing, AW alleges R3 has recently "stopped operating" and that R1 has 
"absconded" with all the inventory and equipment. 
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R1 deposes he has paid all the expenses for the cottage pursuant to the August order. On this 
contradictory evidence I cannot make the factual finding necessary to support AW's request in 
this regard. 

R1 does not appear in his Oct.2/20 affidavit to assert that he is in compliance, in whole or in part, 
with the balance of his payment obligations as outlined above. In the absence of evidence to 
directly contradict AW's detailed allegations in this regard, I find R1 has breached his obligations 
to make the payments outlined immediately above in paras. 1 through 4. 

As for R1's disclosure obligations, again he has not responded in a comprehensive way. He 
deposes: "I have delivered substantially all disclosure requested under my control and that I 
was able to obtain from other sources as set out in my June 23/20 affidavit." 

After R1 swore his June 23/20 affidavit, a further order was imposed upon him, as set out above. 
He has not given any detailed evidence of his compliance, lack of compliance, or best efforts to 
comply. I find he is in breach of the March and June orders in respect of his disclosure 
obligations. 

The March and June orders also imposed an obligation upon R1, R2, R3 and R4 to provide 
monthly financial reports to assist in monitoring compliance with the non-dissipation order. AW 
says she has received none. R1 offers little evidence in this regard. Apart from perhaps 1 letter 
from his lawyer which might qualify, I find these respondents have breached their ordered 
obligations in this regard. 

As to the apparent shuttering of R3, R1 describes in his affidavit the downturn in his financial 
circumstances occasioned by the pandemic. He also ascribes responsibitily to his three 
children, all of whom were earlier involved in the business. The March 11/20 order was made 
mere days before the pandemic triggered a shutdown of businesses across the country. The 
economic impact has been enormous and widespread. There may or may not be merit to R1's 
assertions that the pandemic interfered with his ability to continue his business successfully. On 
the incomplete and imperfect evidence available on this motion I am not prepared to find a 
violation of the non-dissipation order in this regard. 

Also, as R1 says the inventory and equipment has not been dissipated but remains in storage, 
again breach of the non-dissipation order cannot be made out. 

Remedy for Breaches 

AW relies upon Rules 1 (8) and 1 (8.1) of the Family Law Rules. I will not repeat the content of 
those rules here. Suffice to say that AW's requested relief (being dismissal of the respondents' 
claims unless breaches are rectified within 30 days, R1 is not entitled to any further order and 
the respondents are not entitled to disclosure until the breaches are rectified) all falls within the 
broad ambit of Rule 1 (8). 

In considering this issue, the court should follow a three-step process: 
1. Determine whether a triggering event has taken place; that is, a failure to obey an order in a 

case or a related case: 
2. Then, determine whether it is appropriate to exercise the court's discretion in favour of the 

non-complying party by not sanctioning that party under Rule 1 (8). This discretion will only 
be granted in exceptional circumstances and ought to take into account all relevant history 
including the conduct of the non-complying party; 

3. Should the court determine that it will not exercise its discretion in favour of the non­
complying party it is left with a very broad discretion as to the appropriate remedy (see 
Ferguson v. Charlton, 2008 ONCJ (Ont.C.J.) at para.64). 

I have found breaches of the orders as indicated above. Rule 1(8) is thus triggered (see Hughes 
v. Hughes, [2007] O.J. No. 1282 (Ont.S.C.J.) at para. 17). Step 1 above is satisfied. 

Regarding Step 2, I consider the following : 
1. R1 is in breach of both disclosure and payment orders. 
2. Much of the outstanding disclosure is relevant to consideration of R1's income 
3. R1 asserts he does not have the income necessary to satisfy the payment orders, but he has 
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not brought himself into compliance with his obligation to produce the required disclosure. 
By doing so, in effect he urges AW and the court to take him at his word. I decline to do so. 
Instead, I draw an inference that if R1 complied with his disclosure obligations, such 
disclosure would not support his contention that he has no resources from which to satisfy 
the payment orders. 

4. Almost 9 months have passed since the March 11/20 order was made. The affected 
respondents have had ample time to bring themselves into compliance. 

5. While the history of this litigation is largely unhelpful to R1, I am cognizant of his efforts to 
bring his motion to change the March 11/20 order earlier than Dec. 9/20, and even to have it 
heard together with this motion. Unfortunately, due to procedural restrictions, it was not 
possible to hear the motions together. 

6. It is trite to observe, yet again, that the failure to provide disclosure is the most serious 
problem encountered in family law leading to increased costs and delays. It is also trite to 
observe, yet again, that orders of the court are not suggestions, and compliance is not 
optional. 

7. None of the orders made was appealed. Each is presumed correct. Each was fashioned 
with R1 's input, if not his consent. 

Judicial response to a party's failure to respect the court process and court orders should be 
strong and decisive (see Levely v. Levely, 2013 ONSC 1026 (Ont.S.C.J.) at para. 13). 

When I balance the foregoing considerations, I conclude that this is not a case where the parties 
in breach are entitled to avoid sanction from the court for their breaches. 

This brings me to Step 3. It is clear that s.1 (8) confers broad discretion upon the court to fashion 
the appropriate remedy. 

Dismissal of the breaching respondents' pleadings is too severe in my view given the 
outstanding motion to change the March 11/20 order. 

The circumstances described herein support the more measured approach of staying the 
breaching respondents' participation in these proceedings until they have brought themselves 
into compliance with their obligations. AW is entitled to no less. The repute of the administration 
of justice requires no less. It is my fervent hope that this order will provide the breaching 
respondents the motivation apparently needed to treat this proceeding and the orders made with 
an appropriate degree of respect and attention. 

AW has asked for an order dismissing R1's motion scheduled for Dec. 9/20. I decline to do so. 
That motion will however be stayed until such time as full compliance with the orders is 
achieved. 

Oppression Remedy and/or Receiver 

Rule 26(4)(c) of the Family Law Rules permits the appointment of a receiver under s.101 of the 
CJA in enforcement of a non-payment order. Thus, such an order would relate solely to the 
orders for disclosure, non-dissipation of assets and production of financial reports. 

Section 101 of the CJA permits appointment of a receiver, or receiver and manager, where it 
appears just or convenient to do so. The test is well-known and set out in RJR-MacDonald Inc. 
V. Canada (Attorney General), [1994) 1S.C.R.311. The test requires: 
1. A prims facie case demonstrating there is a serious issue to be tried, as opposed to a 

frivolous or vexatious action: 
2. That the party will suffer irreparable harm or damage that cannot be either quantified or 

compensated for if the receiver-manager in not appointed: and, 
3. That the balance of convenience favours the appointment of a receiver-manager. 

I readily find that item 1 of the test above is met. There is nothing apparently frivolous or 
vexatious regarding AW's claims. 

Regarding item 2 of the test above, AW says R1 took more than $300,000 from the parties' joint 
LOC and almost $500,000 from R3 prior to separation. While this may be, there would have 
been no apparent legal impediment to R1 doing so, subject to his obligation to account for the 
monies removed from R3 in tax filings. Further. any harm so occasioned would have arisen 
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before the valuation date and thus before her rights crystallized (subject to possible arguments 
in favour of unequal division of net family properties). AW says the parties' 3 children were 
wrongfully terminated from their roles at R3. There has been no finding to this effect, nor is one 
possible on the evidence before me. There has been no finding that R3's account has been 
depleted by "tens of thousands of dollars" since the non·dissipation order, keeping in mind that 
payments in the ordinary course of business were permitted. AW again references the 
shuttering of R3, and while the business appeared to be doing well in 2019, many businesses 
are struggling in the pandemic economy. R3's inventory and equipment, according to R1, is 
intact in storage. 

What does concern me regarding item 2 is the potential for harm done with the absence of 
ordered disclosure from the breaching respondents. Without the monthly financial reports, AW 
is unable to monitor compliance with the non·dissipation order. R1 has demonstrated a 
readiness to take dramatic steps regarding operation of R3 at least, without reporting to AW, 
contrary to the March and June orders. This conduct satisfies me that item 2 of the test is met. 

As for item 3 of the test, I am satisfied that the balance of convenience favours the appointment 
of a receiver.manager. Given the conduct of the breaching respondents, I conclude this may be 
the only mechanism to ensure compliance with the court's orders. The only possible prejudice 
to the breaching respondents is the cost, but such is triggered by their own failure to comply. 

Given my conclusion regarding an order under s.101 CJA via rule 26(4)(c), the requested order 
under s.248(3) OBCA is not required. 

Conclusion 

For the foregoing reasons, 

ORDERS TO GO: 

1. R1 is found to have breached the orders of March 11/20 and June 29/20 in respect of his 
failure to pay SS, mortgage, property tax, and interim disbursements as ordered. 

2. R1 is found to have breached the orders of March 11/20 and June 29/20 in respect of his 
failure to provide disclosure as ordered. 

3. R1, R2, R3 and R4 are found lo have breached the orders of March 11 /20 and June 29/20 in 
respect of their failure to provide monthly financial reports. 

4. On a temporary basis, any claims of R1, R2, R3 and R4 are stayed pending full compliance 
by these respondents with their obligations under the orders of March 11 /20 and June 29/20. 
Until full compliance by these respondents with their obligations under the March 11 and 
June 29/20 orders, these respondents shall not be entitled to bring motions except a motion 
to determine whether the stay should be lifted. 

5. A receiver/manager shall be forthwith appointed to ensure compliance by R1, R2, R3 and R4 
with their obligations regarding non·dissipation and production of financial reports as 
ordered March 11 and June 29/20. If the parties are unable to agree they shall submit their 
respective nominees to me by way of 148 and I will then decide. R1. R2, R3 and R4 shall 
be jointly and severally responsible for the cost of the receiver/manager. The 
receiver/manager's services may be terminated by agreement in writing or further order of 
the court. 

6. Balance of AW's motion is dismissed. 
7. If unable to agree on costs, written submissions may be provided through my assistant at 

Barrie (limited to 3 pages, excluding offers and bills of costs) as follows : 
a. AW by October 23/20 
b. R1, R2, R3 and R4 by November 6/20 
c. AW in reply by November 13/20. 
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8. This order is operative and enforceable upon release of this endorsement under my 
electronic signature without any need for a signed or entered formal typed order. Approval 
is dispensed with. The parties shall submit a formal order for signing and entry upon 
resumption of regular court services. 

Mr. Justice P.A. Douglas 
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FOR SALE 
76 DENSLEY AVENUE 
TORONTO, ONTARIO 

25,000 SQ. FT. MULTI-TENANT INDUSTRIAL BUILDING 

MULTI-TENANT 
INDUSTRIAL BUILDING 

Pat Viele* 
Executive Vice President 
+ 1 416 495 6258 
pot.viele@cbre.com 
·soles Representative. ··Broker 

THREE STREET FRONTAGES: 
EXCELLENT ACCESS & VISIBILITY 

Frank Protomanni** 
Senior Vice President 
+1 416495 6299 
frank.protomanni@cbre.com 

BUILT-IN FREEZER AND COOLER 
SPACE AVAILABLE 

Allison Gilks 
Sales Representative 
+ 1 4 1 6 4 9 5 6310 
a llison .gilks@c bre .com 

SOUGHT-AFTER LOCATION: 
KEELE/ LAWRENCE 

Alex Protomanni* 
Sales Associate 
+1 416495 6284 
alex.protomanni@cbre.com 
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PROPERTY DETAILS 

Address 

Location 

Lot Size 

Lot Dimensions 

Total Building Size 

Unit Breakdown 

Net Operating Income (NOi) 

Zoning 

Official Plan Designation 

Age Built 

Power 

Clear Height 

Sprinklers 

Shipping 

Asking Price 

Property Taxes 

76 Densley Avenue, North York, ON 

Keele Street I Lawrence Avenue West 

40, l l 7 sq. ft. (0.921 oc.) 

200 ft. x 209 ft. (approx.) 

25,000 sq. ft. 

Unit l : (District Ventures Kitchen) 20,788 sq. ft. 
Unit 2: (The Arepo Republic) 756 sq. ft. 
Unit 3: (Cucino Mauro) 600 sq . ft. 
Unit 4: (Owner Occupied) 2,856 sq. ft. 

5209 ,222 (estimated & adjusted as of Apr. 2021) 

El.O&M2 

Employment Areas & Core Employment 

1954 + later additions 

800 amps I 575 volts 

12 ft. 

Yes 

2 drive in doors 
2 double man doors 
3 truck level doors 

$5,500,000 ($220 per sq. ft.) 

$81,4 11 .38 (annual 2020) 
....... .................... ............. .. ..... .......... ...... . 

Legal Description 

Environmental Status 

All information to be confirmed by Buyer 

LT 4 PL 4325 NORTH YORK; TORONTO 
(N YORK) , CITY OF TORONTO 

Assume clean - Phase I & II completed 

-

, ~ 

FREEZER/ COOLER 

FOR SALE I 76 DENSLEY AVENUE CBRE 
' ' . 
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TENANT PROFILE 

TENANT UNIT SIZE LEASE RATE LEASE EXPIRY 

Distrid Ventures Kitchen 20,788 sq. ft. $6.75 per sq. ft. net/year 
Mor. 31, 2025 
(2 x 5-yeor ext.) 

The Arepo Republic 756 sq. ft. $1 ,600 net/month 
Jon. 14, 2023 
(1 x 5-yeor ex1.) 

Cucino Mauro 600 sq. fl. $2,000 gross/month 
Jon. 14,2022 
(1x2-yeorext.) 

Owner-Occupied 2,856 sq. ft. Vacant 

DOCUMENTATION 

Phase I Environmental; 525 Environmental (Dec. 24, 2020) 

Phase II Environmental; G2S Environmental (Sept. 21, 2019) 

Physical Building Condition Assessment; RJC Engineers (Jon. 26, 2021) 

Floor Pion 

Detailed Rent Rol l 

Leases 

FOR SALE I 76 DENSLEY AVENUE CBRE 
. . . . 
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INTERIOR PHOTOS 

FOR SALE I 76 DENSLEY AVENUE CBRE 
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MULTI-TENANT INDUSTRIAL INVESTOR/USER OPPORTUNITY 
CBRE LIMITED I 2005 Sheppard Avenue East. Suite 800 I Toronto. ON I M2J 5B4 I www.cbre.ca 
This d iscloimer sholl opp ly to CBRE Limited, Rea l Estate Brokerage, ond to oll other divisions of tho Corporation; to include all employees ond independent controctors ('CBRE'). All rofcrcnccs to CBRE Limited herein sholl be deemed to include 
CBRE, Inc. The informotion sc1 out herein, including, without lim itotion, ony projections, imoges, opinions, ossumptions o nd estimotes obtoincd from third porties (the "lnformotion") hos not been verified by CBRE, o nd CBRE docs not represent, 
worront or guorontee the occurocy, correclness ond completeness of the lnformotion. CBRE does nol occept or ossume ony responsibility or liobility, direct or consequentiol, for the lnformotion o r the recipient's reliance upon the lnformotion. The 
recipient of the lnformotion should toke such steps os the recioient moy deem necenory 10 verify the lnformotion prior to plocing ony relionce upon the lnformotion. The lnformotion moy chonge ond ony proper1y described in the lnformotion moy 
be withdrown from the morket ot ony time without notice or obligotion to the recipient from CBRE. CBRE ond the CBRE logo o re the service morks ol CBRE Limited ond/or its olfilioted or relo•ed companies in other countries. All other mor'.ts 
disployed on this documem ore rhe prooer1y of their respective owners. All Rights Reserved . 

FOR SALE I 76 DENSLEY AVENUE CBRE 
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J Equitable Bank 

Date 

Lawyer: 

Mortgage No.: 
Mortgagor: 
Co-Applicant: 
Secured Property: 
Malling Address: 
Maturity Date: 
Property Type: 
Fire Insurance Required: 
Conventlonalllnsured: 
Tax Component: 

Principal Balance as at April 5, 2021 

April 28, 2021 

Rahn Dodick 

339978 
863704 Ontario Lid 
Francesco Zucarro 
76 Densley Ave, Toronto ON 
26 Milford Ave, Toronto ON 
January 5, 2022 
BES 
Yes 
Conventional 
Yes 

Mo1tgagelnterest Raio 

Accrued Interest at 5.89% from Aprll 5, 2021 to April 28, 2021 
Late Payment Interest 
Pre-payment Charge 
Returned Payment Fees 
Insurance Administration Fees 
Credit on Account (If Applicable) 
Property Management Fees (II Applicable) 
Property Management Holdback (Please obtain holdback from Property Manager on file) 
Tax Account Balance 
Statement Fee 
Annual Account Maintenance Fees 
Discharge Administration Fee 

!TOTAL 

Per Diem on Principal Balance: 

•Plus any and all legal fees incurred 

Sincerely, 
Michael A. 
Equltablo Bank 

E.&O.E. 

$ 263.90 

Equitable Bank Tower 30 St. Clair Avenue West, Suite 700, Toronto, Ontario M4V 3Al 
Customer Service • Toll Free 1·888-334-3313 • Toll Free Fax 1-866-407-5859 

equitablebank.ca 

.I.ml 
Mort a a 

5.89% 

$ 1,635, 178.82 
$ 6,079.84 
$ 
$ 60,604.57 
$ 
$ 600.00 
s 
s 
$ 
$ (11,272.46) 
$ 100.00 
$ 
$ 395.00 

Is 1,6s1.sas.n I 
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HILLMOUNT 
CAPITAL 

Dodick Landau Inc. in Its capacity as Court-appointed Receiver of Frank Zuccaro, 

863704 Ontario Limited, Metropolitan Ice Cream Inc and Oraccuz Holding Inc. 

Loan Payout Statement as at June 11. 2021 

3815 King Road, King City, ON 

207 Saint Francis Avenue, Woodbridge, ON 

11547 County Road 10, Clearview, ON 

76 Densley Avenue, Toronto, ON 

Please be advised that the balance outstanding under the above mentioned loan is as follows: 

Principal Balance as at June 11, 2021 

Interest - May 1- 31, 2021 

Interest· June 1- 11, 2021 

Interest in Lieu of Notice (waived - notice provided May 6, 2021) 

Wire Fee 

Lender legal Fees 

Loan Discharge and Administration Fee (4 properties) 

Total Owing - payable in certified funds .... 

Per diem interest - Hillmount Capital Inc. $ 

•• Certified funds required 

This Payout Statement Is valid until June 11, 2021. 

Daily interest is due to and including day of receipt of funds by this office. 

$ 
$ 
$ 
$ 
$ 
$ 
$ 
$ 

63.75 

If funds are not received before 12:00 noon they MUST include per diem to the next business day. 

FRIDAY DEADLINE: If not received before 12:00 noon MUST include per diem to the next business day. 

DATED: May 11, 2021 

E. & O •• E. 

Total 

260,000.00 

1,939.17 

701.29 

90.00 

2,294.35 

600.00 

265,624.80 

89 Tycos Drive. Suite 208, Toronto. ON M6B 1W3 • 416.849.0322 • hillmount.ca FSRA LIC. 10453 & 11925 
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The Honourable 

l~!!.~.~ .. QQ~&!~ ................... . 
Judge (Print or type name) 

March 11, 2020 
···············-oate ·a10"1er·············· 

.. 

ONTARIO 
Superior Court of Justice 

Court File Number 
FC-19-0058934-0000 

Form 25: Order (General) 
[!] Temporary 

D Final 
(Full legal name & address for service: stree~ number, Lawyer's name & address: street, number. municipality, 
municipality, postal code telephone & fax numbers & e-mail postal code, telephone & fax numbers & e-mail address (if 
address (if any). any). 
Maria Zuccaro R. Avery Zeidman 
c/o Lawyer Avery Zeidman Professional Corporation 

Barristers & Solicitors 
565 Edgeley Blvd. 
Concord, Ontario L4K 4G4 
Tel: 905-669-7577 ext. 222 
Fax: 905-669-5525 

Resoondentls) 
Full legal name & address for setV/ce: street, number. Lawyer's name & address: street, number. municipality, 
municipality, postal code telephone & fax numbers & e-mail postal code, telephone & fax numbers & e-mail address (if 

.. address (if any). any). 

Frank Zuccaro Frank A. Mendicino 
c/o lawyer Capo Sgro LLP 

Barrister(s) and Solicitor(s) 
Co-Resgondents {c/o la!!l'.er} 7050 Weston Road, Suite 400 

Woodbridge, Ontario L4L 8G7 
863704 Ontario Limited Tel: 905-850-7000 

Fax: 905-850-7050 
Metropolitan Ice Cream Inc. 

Oraccuz Holding Ltd. 

Added Respondents (c/o Mr. Zeidman) 
R. Avery Zeidman 

Giuseppe Zuccaro A very Zeidman Professioqal Corporation 
Barristers & Solicitors 

Vito Antonio Zuccaro 565 Edgeley Blvd. 
Concord, Ontario IAK 4G4 

!Filomena Zuccaro Tel: 905-669-7577 ext. 222 
Fax: 905-669-5525 
averv~zeidmanlaw .com 

> The court heard a mciJ!II made by (name of person or persons) 

Maria Zuccaro 

The following persons were in court (names of parties and lawyers in court) 

The applicant and added respondents represented by R. A very Zeidman 
The respondent and co-respondents represented by Frank A. Mendicino 

The court received evidence and heard submissions on behalf of (name or names) 

R. A very Zeidman, on behalf of the Applicant 
Frank A. Mendicino, on behalf of the Respondent and Co-Respondents 

THIS COURT ORDERS ON A WITHOUT PREJUDICE BASIS THAT: 

FLR 25 (September 1, 2005) www.DIVORCEmale.com 
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Form 25: Order (general) (page 2) Court File Number FC-19-0058934-0000 

1. Commencing March 15, 2020, the Respondent Husband shall pay spousal support to the Applicant Wife 
in the amount of $3,000.00 a month pending return of this matter to court. 

2. Commencing immediately, the parties shall equally bear the mortgage, property tax and home insurance 
costs of the matrimonial home pending return of this matter to court. 

3. Commencing immediately, the Applicant Wife shall· be entitled to continue to reside in the matrimonial 
home at 207 St. Francis Avenue, Woodbridge, Ontario, without attendance by the Respondent Husband 
exc~pt upon the Applicant Wife's written consent or Court Order. 

4. The Respondent shall deliver to the Applicant at his sole expense the outstanding disclosure outlined in 
Schedule "A" attached to the Applicant's Notice of Motion and attached hereto within 30 days attached 
to an affidavit as exhibits, or swear therein an explanation of best efforts taken to do so and a reasonable 
estimate of when the disclosure will be delivered. 

5. The Respondent shall pay to the Applicant interim disbursements in the amount of $50,000.00. 

6.· Certificates of Pending Litigation shall be issued against the lands and premises known municipally as: 

a. 3815 King Road, King City, Ontario and legally described as PT LOT LT 5, CON 6, KING, PT 
RDAL B1N LTS 5 & 6 CON 6 KING AS IN R586423; KING (hereinafter the "King Property"); 

b. 76 Densley Avenue, Toronto, Ontario and legally described as LT 4 PL 4325 NORTH YORK; 
TORONTO (N YORK), CITY OF TORONTO (hereinafter the "Densley Property")' 

7. The Respondent and Co-Respondent corporations shall not dissipate any of their assets, owned directory 
or indirectly, save and except in the ordinary course of business, other than the payment in respect of 
spousal support, Matrimonial Home carrying costs and interim disbursements. The Respondent and Co­
Respondent corporations shall deliver to the Applicant or her lawyer financial reports and any other 
reasonable disclosure monthly on the first of each month while such non-dissipation order is in effect to 
evidence their compliance therewith. 

8. Costs of today reserved. 

9. All tenns herein shall expire upon return of this matter to court unless renewed (except paragraph 5 re 
interim disbursements). 

10. The Order for interim disbursements shall be accounted for in resolution of the issue of equalization, or as 
the parties otherwise agree. 

11. The interim Disbursement shall be paid within 30 days. 

12. Motion adjourned to July 8, 2020 at 9:30 a.m. before me, peremptory upon Respondent Husband One 
Hour. 

13. A Support Deduction Order shall issue. 

14. Unless the Support Order and Support Deduction Order is withdrawn from the Office of the Director of 
the Family Responsibility Office, it shall be enforced by the Director, and amounts owing under the Support 
Order shall be paid to the Director, who shall pay them to the party to whom they are owed. 
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Form 25: Order (general) (page 3) Court File Number FC-19-0058934-0000 

15. If the parties agree to opt out of the Family Responsibility Office at any time, they are both required to file 
with the Office of the Director of the Family Responsibility Office a separate written request consenting to 
the withdrawal of the Support Order and the Support Deduction Order. 

16. All payments are to be made payable to the Family Responsibility Office, Ministry of Community and 
Social Services, P.O. Box 2204, Station "P", Toronto, Ontario, MSS 3E9. 

17. This Order bear post-judgment interest at the rate of3% per annum effective from the date of this Order. 
Where there is a default in payment, the payment in default shall bear interest only from the date of default. 

Put a line through any blank space left on this page. 
~ :;z;;;:::; 
~it\- I 4, 2.e/U v 

M81 cl I t1 2020 --1vJ. LMJY1~-" -
Date of signature 

M. WORTZMAN 
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Schedule "A " to Notice of Motion 
Zuccaro v. Zuccaro 

1. Tax Returns and NOAs. Income tax returns with all source documents and documents 
attached therewith, including but not limited to all T4 forms from all employers, TS 
forms, T3 slips, RR.SP contributions forms, receipts for donations, and all schedules for 
three years prior to separation and onwards, and all notices of assessment and/or 
reassessment for the same years (save and except for notices of assessment for 2016 
through 2017 which were provided and save and except for the income tax returns for 
those same years which were provided but without the attachments we now request]. 

2. Compensation. 
a. Three most recent paystubs and year-end paystubs for three years prior to 

separation and onwards 
b. Because you allege you became unemployed in 2017: 

i. a complete copy of your Record of Employment, or other evidence of 
termination, and 

u. a statement of any benefits or income you are still entitled to receive from 
your former employer despite or as a result of the termination. 

c. An income assessment by a certified business valuator and/or forensic accountant 
of your income for the three years prior to separation and onwards together with 
an accounting for personal benefits and/or expenses for you incurred in such 
corporations during those times; 

d. A tracing of all monies taken by you or any entity under your control from any 
corporation beneficially owned by you, including but not limited to those named 
as respondents in this proceeding 

3. All documents required by Family Law Rule 13(3.3) 

4. Assets and Debts Statements: 

a. Assets. All statements, transactions records, and cancelled cheques for any 
financial institution accounts of yours and any of your corporations from three 
years prior to date of separation and onwards in which you are a title holder or a 
beneficial owner, whether solely, jointly or otherwise. 

b. Credit. All credit card, loan account, and mortgage statements and transactions 
records from three years prior to date of separation and onwards for any accounts 
in which you are a title holder or a beneficial own~r, whether solely or jointly 

5. Corporations & Trusts. Income Tax returns and attachments, NOAs, tax slips, and tax 
source documents for each corporation and trust in which you have or had an interest for 
three years prior to separation and onwards, and all notices of assessment and/or 
reassessment for the same years. Also the following for each entity: 

i. Complete financial statements for three years prior to separation and 
onwards, with an ongoing disclosure requirement to provide ensuing 
year,s documents as soon as available up until trial. 

1 
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Schedule "A " to Notice of Motion 
Zuccaro v. Zuccaro 

11. All statements for any financial institution accounts from three years prior 
to date of separation and onwards. 

111. Copy of the corporation's minute book. 
iv. Valuation of the businesses and trusts and your interest therein 

6. Financial Statement. Full and complete financial disclosure by you and an accurate 
accounting of all income and property by an updated sworn financial statement in which 
your had an interest, direct or indirect, as of the date of marriage, the date of separation, 
and the current date; and an accurate documentary accounting (i.e. source documents, 
including without limitation valuations) of all income, property and debt identified in 
your financial statement, including without limitation the following: 

a. copies of all documents related to your contributions to the matrimonial home, 
and/or your spouse since separation; 

b. copies of your life insurance policies including substantiation of the face value 
amount and any cash surrender value amounts; 

c. an accounting with respect to all property the party you ·removed from the 
matrimonial home after separation; 

d. appraisals or valuations of any real estate (owned by your or your corporations) or 
other assets by certified experts together with experts' reports; 

e. documentary proof of all date of marriage, date of separation and current date 
values for all assets and debts in your fmancial statement or that should be 
included in your financial statement; 

7. Copies of any and all credit card and/or loan applications completed and/or submitted by 
you, solely or otherwise, from one year prior to separation and onwards 

8. Copies of a current and unredacted Equifax report 

9. Documentary proof, value, and a tracing of funds with respect to excluded property in 
which you claim under Part 7 of your Financial Statement. 

10. Copies of all pages of current Passport. 

11. Any further disclosure that is necessary or advisable pending review of disclosure 
received or to be received from you in this matter. 

2 
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SEAL 

ONTARIO 
Superior Court of Justice 

(Name of Court) 

at 50 Eagle Street West, Newmarket, Ontario, L3Y 6Bl 
(Coult office address) 

Applicant(s) 

Court File Number 
FC-19-0058934-0000 

Form 25: Order (General) 
[!] Temporary 

D Final 
(Full legal name & address for service: street, number, Lawyer's name & address: street, number, municipality, 
municipality, postal code telephone & fax numbers & e-mail postal code, telephone & fax numbers & e-mail address (if 
address (if any). any). 

Maria Zuccaro R. Avery Zeidman 
c/o Lawyer A very Zeidman Professional Corporation 

Barristers & Solicitors 
565 Edgeley Blvd. 
Concord, Ontario L4K 4G4 
Tel: 905-669-7577 ext. 222 

The Honourable Fax: 905-669-5525 i 
J ust1ce A. Himel Rescondent{s) 

Judge (Print or type name) Full legal name & address for service: street, number, 

--~ugust 5, 2020 
municipality, postal code telephone & fax numbers & e-mail 

···-··-·-- address (if any). 
Date of order Frank Zuccaro 

c/o lawyer 

Co-Resgondents {c/o law)'.cr} 

863704 Ontario Limited 

Metropolitan Ice Cream Inc. 

Oraccuz Holding Ltd. 

Added Resgondents {c/o Mr. Zeidman) 

Giuseppe Zuccaro 

Vito Antonio Zuccaro 

IFilomena Zuccaro 

The oourt heaFd a motioA made by (Rame efpeFBeR erpeFSeRs} 

The following persons were in court (names of parties and lawyers in court) 

NIA 

Lawyer's name & address: street, number, municipality, 
postal code, telephone & fax numbers & e-mail address (if 
any). 

Frank A. Mendicino 
Capo Sgro LLP 
Barrister(s) and Solicitor(s) 
7050 Weston Road, Suite 400 
Woodbridge, Ontario L4L 8G7 
Tel: 905-850-7000 
Fax: 905-850-7050 

R. A very Zeidman 
A very Zeidman Professional Corporation 
Barristers & Solicitors 
565 Edgeley Blvd. 
Concord, Ontario L4K 4G4 
Tel: 905-669-7577 ext. 222 
Fax: 905-669-5525 
avcrvcetzcidmanlnw.com 

The court received evidence and heard submissions on behalf of the Applicant and Respondent. 

ON CONSENT, THIS COURT ORDERS THAT: 

I. On a without prejudice basis, the Respondent Husband shall pay all carrying expenses related to the parties' 
property at 11547 County Road 10, Clearview, Ontario (the "Cottage Property"), including without 
limitation utilities, property taxes, mortgage payments (if any), and insurance. 

FLR 25 (September 1, 2005) www.DIVORCEmato.com 
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Form 25: Order (general) (page 2) Court File Number FC-19-0058934-0000 

2. The Respondent Husband shall deliver through counsel proof of all payments for the Cottage Property 
made as required hereunder forthwith upon making such payments. 

3. On a without prejudice basis, by July 29, 2020, the Respondent Husband shall make all payments on the 
Cottage Property necessary to bring carrying expense accounts up-to-date and current, including without 
limitation utilities, property taxes, mortgage payments (if any), and insurance. 

4. Costs of the June 29, 2020 urgent Motion are reserved and shall be dealt with upon the parties or this 
Honourable Court addressing costs of the March 11, 2020 Motion. 

5. This order bears post-judgement interest at a rate of 3.0% per annum effective from the date of this Order. 
Where there is a default in payment, the payment in default shall bear post-judgement interest only from 
the date of default. 

Put a line through any blank space left on this page. 

August5,2020 
Date of signature Signature of judge or clerk of the court 
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Frank Zuccaro, 863704 Ontario Limited Metropolitan Ice Cream Inc. and Oraccruz Holdings Ltd. 

Summary of Amounts Ordered to be paid to Maria Zuccaro 

1) On March 11, 2020 an order was granted requiring, among other things, Frank Zuccaro to: (i) pay spousal support to Maria Zuccaro in the amount of $3,000 per month 

beginning on March 15, 2020 and on the 15th of each month thereafter; (ii) equally bear the matrimonial home carrying costs of the mortgage, property taxes and home insurance; and 

(iii) an interim disbursement payment of $50,000; which each of the foregoing payment amounts bearing post· judgement interest at the rate of 3% per annum. 

2} On Augusts. 2020, an order was granted requiring Frank Zuccaro to commence paying all carrying costs related to the Cottage Property which also ordered post judgement interst 

at a rate of 3% per annum. 

3) Legal counsel of Maria Zuccaro reported to the court that Mr. Zuccaro was in breach of the March and August Orders as at September 24 , 2020 as detailed above. 

4} On November 16, 2020, an order was granted requiring Frank Zuccaro to pay Maria Zuccaro the sum of $24,000 costs in relation to the court appearances of March 11, 

2020, June 29, 2020 and October 8, 2020, bearing post-judgement interest at a rate of 2% per annum. 

Interest from 

lat1:r1:st to S!i!R1. 2M2Q to 
Naturn of Payment ~ Outstaadjng Amounts Sept. 24/20 ~ May 24/21 

Spousal Support for August and September 2020 1 6,000.00 12.08 6,012.08 119.58 

Unpaid mortgage payments on the Matrimonial Home since prior to March 2020 1 8,346.41 135.14 8,481.55 168.70 

Unpaid property tax payments (since prior to March 2020 to September 2020) 1 3,251.11 52.64 3,303.75 65.71 

Interim Disbursement 1 50,000.00 809.59 S0,809.59 1,010.62 

Cottage property payments 2 2,404.15 38.93 2,443.08 48.59 

Costs Award of November 16, 2020 24,000.00 24,000.00 207.78 

Total Unpaid Spousal Payments with accrued interest to May 24, 2021 1, 3 $ 94,001.67 $ 1,048.38 $ 95,050.05 $ 1,620.98 

Imai 

6,131.66 

8,650.25 

3,369.46 

51,820.21 

2,491.67 

24,207.78 

$ 96,671.03 
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In the matter of the receivership of 
863704 Ontario Limited 
of the City of Toronto 

in the Province of Ontario 

For the Period of November 17, 2020 to May 6, 2021 

RECEIPTS 
1. Receipts 

Loan from Hilmount Capital 

2. Miscellaneous 

HST collected 
HST recovered 
Rental Income 

TOTAL RECEIPTS 

DISBURSEMENTS 

3. HST on Ascend License Fee 
Ascend Licensing Fee 

4. Receiver's fees and costs 
HST charged on Receiver's remuneration 

5 HST paid on disbursements exclusive of fees 
HST on administrative disbursment 

6 Miscellaneous: 

Mileage 
Transfer to Other Trust Account 
Environmental Site Assessment 
Bank charges 
Appraisal fees 
Courier and Postage 
Change of locks 
Utilities 
Redirection of mail 
Repairs & maintenance 
Financing costs 
Automobile Expenses 
HST on legal fees 
Insurance - Direct Loss & Liability 

260,028.25 

19,698.24 
4,461.02 

151,524.79 

143.00 
1,100.00 

139,622.05 
16,481.22 

725.73 
3,864.77 

242.84 
17.50 

3,250.00 
216.44 

12,732.50 
96.09 

541.80 
948.81 

2,650.94 
17,897.00 
3,250.00 

76.00 
4, 111.01 

11,350.11 

260,028.25 

175,684.05 

435,712.30 

1,243.00 

156,103.27 

4,590.50 
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Insurance - Vehicles 
Interest for November 25 to 30, 2020 
Interest Paid 
Legal Disbursements 
Origination Fee 
Planning, Development, Overview 
Professional Fees: Legal Counsel 
Property Tax 
Repayment of Mortgage 
Search Charges 
Wire fee 

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 

TOTAL RECEIPTS OVER DISBURSEMENTS 

198.00 
161.84 

55,532.49 
736.10 

5,200.00 
525.00 

30,895.00 
45,812.95 
12,894.31 

710.10 
90.00 210,136.83 

372,073.60 

63,638.70 

80



APPENDIX "K" 

81



TAB A 
82



Court File No. CV-21-00661928 

BETWEEN: 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOT~ COURT OF .JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

DODICK LANDAU INC. 

;md 

Applicant 

FRANK ZUCCARO. 863704 ONTARIO LIMITED, METROPOLITAN ICE CREAM INC. 
AND OR/\CCUZ HOLDING I.TD. 

Respondents 

APPLICATION UNDl~H SUBSECTION 249 nnd 250(1) Oli' THE BANKRUPTCY AND 
INSOLVENCJ' ACT, R.S.C. 1985, c .. B-3, AS AMENilED AND RULES 14.05(2) AND (3)(g) 

AND 41 OF THE HULES OF CIVIL PH.OCEDURE, U.R.O. 1990 

AFFIDAVIT OF RAHN DODICK 
I. lbhn Dodiclc. of the City ofToronto, in the Province of Ontario, HEREBY AFFIRM: 

I. I am the president of Dodick Landau Inc .. the Receiver and Applicant in the within 

proceedings and. as such have knowledge oflhc matters to which I hcrci11aflcr depose. 

.., 
Pursuant lo an Order of lhc Honournblc Mr. Jus1icc P.A. f)(l\lglus clalcd November 17 • 

2020, (the ·'Receivership Order'") Dodick Landau Inc. was appointed as Receiver (the .. lkccivd') 

of the assets, unclcrrnkings and property of the Respondents. 

3. The details of the Receiver's Activitics arc set out in the Receiver's First Rl·port to the 

Court. 

-00CL
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. 

4. For the period October 28, 2020 to May 5, 2021 the Receiver’s accounts amount to

$139,622.05 in fees, plus disbursements of $8,031.63 and $19,194,.98 of HST for a total amount of 

$166,748.65. A copy of the accounts rendered in these proceedings by the Receiver in respect of 

such period, together with a summary of the personnel, hours and hourly rates of the Receiver during 

the same period are attached as Exhibit “A” to this my Affidavit. 

5. To the best of my knowledge, the rates charged by the Receiver throughout the course of

these proceedings are comparable to the rates charged by other accounting firms in the greater 

Toronto area for the provision of similar services. 

6. I verily believe that the Receiver’s accounts are fair and reasonable in the circumstances.

7. I make this Affidavit in support of a motion for an Order approving the Receiver’s fees and

disbursements and for no other or improper purpose. 

SWORN REMOTELY by Rahn Dodick 
stated as being in the City of Toronto in the 
Province of Ontario, before me in the City of 
Toronto in the Province of Ontario on this 
18th day of May 2021, in accordance with O. 
Reg 431/20, Administering Oath or 
Declaration Remotely 

Commissioner for Taking Affidavits RAHN DODICK 
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THIS IS EXHIBIT "A" REFERRED TO IN THE 

AFFIDAVIT OF RAHN DODI CK, SWORN BEFORE ME, 

THIS 18111 DAYOF~AY~s2021. 
• ·-' · 1 .... .r. / ·~' ___ ,.. . : 

/ I ' ; ( 

I - /. _:_ -.. 
I A 1-' .{_ --: ~ ~ . ·-~. 
c,...' .,-:, -;e:;:;; .:::::-~-- ..... ----------- ~------:rt---~·-";;-~~--~~~·-~----------,--

A co¥4Mrss19~~~ING AFFIDAVITS .. 
I /' /.!'/ 

l ,•' .... ... ··· 
' .... 
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~-"-'~~~ ~~"' "'l 
., ... 11 . 1111B1Wif0,;~ , e~e. !Pa 

~ 
r·~ .... "'!'. ~·-J 

~-umr~~a~ 

Rahn Dodick Proposal Trustee $395.00 

Naomi Lieberman Senior Manager $295.00 

Josh Pearson Estate Administrator $ 195.00 

Brenda McKnight Estate Admin istrator $195.00 

~-~~~ ,J.li'~ I ·~l!i!ft ~ 

-~~~i!.02~ 

Total Hours for Rahn Dodick: 150.21 

Total Professional Fees for Rahn Dodick: $59,332.95 

Total Hours for Naomi Lieberman: 133.69 

Total Fees for Naomi Lieberman: $39,438.55 

Total Hours for Josh Pearson: 102.14 

Total Fees for Josh Pearson: $ 19,9 17.30 
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Total Hours for Brenda McKnight: 106.85 

Total Fees for Brenda McKnight: $20,835.75 

Total Hours for Talya Psek: 0.5 

Total Fees for Talya Psek: $97.50 

Total Hours: 493.39 

Average Hourly Rate: $282.98 

Total Professional Fees $139,622.05 

Disbursements $8,031.63 

Subtotal $147,553.68 

HST $19,194.98 

TOTAL $166, 7 48.65 

87



DODICK LANDAU INC. 
Aoolicanr and 

FRANK ZUCCARO. et al. 
Resoondents 

Court File No. CV-21-006619::?8 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMiVlERCIAL LIST) 
APPLICATION UNDER SUBSECTION 249 and 250(1) OF THE 
8.4!VlfRUPTCJ' A1VD INSOll"E;VCJ' ACT. R.S.C. 1985, c. 8-J. AS 

AMENDED AND RULES l·'-05(2)/\ND (Jl(g) AND 41 OF THF. 
RULES OF CIVIL PROCEDURE. R.R.O. 1990 

Proceeding commenced at Toronto 

AFFIDAVIT OF RAHN DODICK 

-------------···········-·--········------·-

GARFINKLE BIDERMAN LLP 
Barristers & Solicitors 
I Adelaide Street East, Suite 80 I 
Toronto. Ontario, MSC' 2V9 

\Vendy Greenspoon-Soer LSUC#: 34698L 
Tel: 416-869-1234 
Fax:416-869-0547 

Lawyers for the Applicant, 
DODICK LANDAU INC. 

f<ilt :"\urnbe1·: 12574-0111 

-00CL
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DODlCK 
LANDAU 
Dodick Landau Inc. 
4646 Dufferin St., Suite 6 
Toronto, ON 
M3H5$4 
Phone:416-645-0542 
www.dodick.ca 

Invoice# 10047 
Receivership - Court Appointment 

Issued Date: 12/03/2020 

863704 Ontario Limited, Metropolitan Ice Cream Inc .• Oraccuz Holding Ltd. and Frank Zuccaro 
c/o Dodick Landau Inc. 
4646 Dufferin SI., Suite 6 
Toronto, ON, M3H 554 

Enclosed please find our statement of account for services rendered in our capacity as Receiver. The following is a 
summary of time by staff member. 

Client Reference Number: 863-171120-AZ 

Professional Fees 
.. 

Date·. Description Nsmo Hourly Hours Total 
R11to 

10/28/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Metropolitan Ice Cream: Call with RD $395.00 1.50 $592.50 
Avery Zeidman. Review information received from Mr. Zeidman. 
Prepare email to Mr. Zeidman. 

11/02/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Zuccaro Matter: Reviewed draft RD $395.00 0.80 $316.00 
appointment order. Email exchange wilh Wendy G. re: conflicts. 

11/02/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Zuccaro: Review material RD $395.00 2.23 $880.85 
provided by applicant's legal counsel. Respond to applicant with 
comments and questions. Email exchange with legal counsel. 

11/03/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Zuccaro: Review email from RD $395.00 2.00 $790.00 
applicant and attachments and respond. 

11/04/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Zuccaro: Review two versions of RD $395.00 1.20 $474.00 
amended appointment order and provide comments lo Mr. 
Zeidman. Review past orders. Email to legal counsel. 

11/04/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Zuccaro: Calls with prospective RD $395.00 0.80 $316.00 
lender to the Receiver. Provide info to lender. Email to applicant's 
legal counsel. 

Page 1of11 
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1110512020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Zuccaro: Review applicant legal RD $395.00 1.00 $395.00 
counsel's email. Review Receiver's legal counsel's email and call 
with her. Respond to applicant' legal counsel's email. 

1110612020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Zuccaro: Call with Mr. Zeidman. RD $395.00 0.30 $118.50 

1110912020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Zuccaro: Review amendments RO $395.00 0.30 $118.50 
made by legal counsel. Email exchanges wilh legal counsel. 

1111012020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Zuccaro: Review final served RD $395.00 0.36 $142.20 
receivership motion material incl. affidavit. 

11112/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Zuccaro: Email to lender re: what RD $395.00 0.19 $75.05 
would be required to lend. 

1111212020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Zuccaro: Email exchange with RD $395.00 0.19 $75.05 
legal counsel. 

1111712020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Zuccaro: Planning receivership. RD $395.00 2.15 $849.25 
Calls with Hillmount capital, Naomi Lieberman and Josh Pearson. 
Email exchanges with applicant and receiver's counsel. Review 
insurance requirements. 

1111712020 Receivership - Court Appointed: preliminary call with RD re NL $295.00 0.92 $271.40 
Receivership background and work plan preparation 

1111812020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Discuss receivership with Brenda RD $395.00 2.15 $849.25 
M. Email exchange with her. Redirection of mail. Answer 
questions posed by Hillmount Capital. Calls and email exchanges 
with Yitz L at Hillmount. Call and emails with Receiver's legal 
counsel. 

11118/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Authorize new bank accounts for RD $395.00 0.65 $256.75 
each of the names in the receivership. 

1111812020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchanges with naomi L. RD $395.00 0.51 $201.45 
and josh P. re: visits to the properties. 

11118/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review Hil!mount Capital term RD $395.00 0.87 $343.65 
sheet and respond with comments and questions. 

1111812020 Receivership - Court Appointed: prep with Receivership, call w NL $295.00 1.17 $345.15 
RD 

1111812020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review draft letter to banks and RD $395.00 0.14 $55.30 
make amendments. 

1111812020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review title registrations on RD $395.00 0.56 $221.20 
parcel registers and sign off on title registrations. 

1111812020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with legal counsel re: term RD $395.00 0.27 $106.65 
sheet. Review her emailed comments. 

11/1812020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Meet with RD re receivership. BM $195.00 1.00 $195.00 
Prepare list of mail redirects. 

1111812020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review Zuccaro bank accounts. BM $195.00 2.80 $546.00 
Finalize mail redirect list. 
Prepare online. 
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11/1812020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Input PPSA informalion for BM $195.00 0.40 $78.00 
search. 
Do bankruptcy search. 
Save to drive. 
Report to RD. 

11/18/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Compose letter to Banks re BM $195.00 0.90 $175.50 
deposit accounts. 
Call banks for contact information. 

11119/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: site visit at Densley location, NL $295.00 4.60 $1,357.00 
discussion with tenants, review of Insurance considerations 

11/19/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Site visit al 76 Densley JP $195.00 4.00 $780.00 
change locks 
Visit tenants 
Speak with cops and deal with alarm 
9:30-1:30 

11/1912020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Attend at Densley location. Tour RD $395.00 2.80 $1,106.00 
facility. Meet the tenants. Take pictures of property. Meeting with 
Naomi. L. and Josh P. 

11/1912020 Receivership - Court Appointed: calls with tenants. calls with Josh RD $395.00 1.70 $671.50 
P. re: police visit. call with alarm monitoring company. call and 
email excahnges with naomi L. and Brenda M. 

11/19/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: review amendments to the term RD $395.00 0.70 $276.50 
sheet, email exchanges with final amendments and execute 

11/19/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Phone calls with Rahn, Naomi JP $195.00 0.92 $179.40 
and Alarm company 

11/19/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Letter to Bank of Nova Scotia BM $195.00 0.70 $136.50 
PPSA - no results 

11/20/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Site visit to king rd JP $195.00 1.67 $325.65 

11/20/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Home Depot buy lock JP $195.00 1.25 $243.75 
Replace lock at Densley 
Pictures, video and look through at Densley 

11/2012020 Receivership - Court Appointed: phone with Jonathan JP $195.00 0.34 $66.30 
Create folders and download/upload Densley photos 
Update Rahn/Naomi email 

11/2012020 Receivership - Court Appointed: site visit and review of emails NL $295.00 2.83 $834.85 

11/2012020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Various email exchanges with RD $395.00 2.30 $908.50 
regards to obtaining the Receive(s financing. Email exchanges 
with Hillmount and legal counsel. Circulate documents. Sign 
Receiver certificate and review postponements of CPLs. 

11/20/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Visit the King property. Discuss RD $395.00 1.30 $513.50 
with Naomi L., Josh P. and legal counsel next steps re: property. 

1112012020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Naomi L. re: current RD $395.00 0.30 $118.50 
insurance. 
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11/20/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with bank. RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 

11/20/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: call w insurance provider and NL $295.00 0.24 $70.80 
drafting email regarding same 

11/20/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Prepare email re Zuccaro to RSC BM $195.00 0.40 $78.00 
Collections. 
Request assistance. 

11/20/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call Banks for confirmations. BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 

11/20/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Receive email re insurance. BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
Save to drive. 

11/20/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Receive correspondence from BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
RBC Collections. 
Account frozen. 
Report to RD. 

11/20/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call T. Krilis at TD re Zuccaro BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
leave voicemail 

11/20/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email Anna Macedo at TD, BM $195.00 0.40 $78.00 
request assistance with Bank letters re Zuccaro. 
Scan and send various documents. 

11/20/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Re Pad - email RD. BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 

11/23/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review and amend fellers to RD $395.00 0.51 $201.45 
banks. 

11/23/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review email from Avery Z. RD $395.00 0.77 $304.15 
Respond and include questions regarding Metropolitan's 
operations. review bank statements on hand re: past transactions. 

11/2312020 Receivership - Court Appointed: drbfting email to insurance NL $295.00 0.83 $244.85 
provider 

11/2312020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review CPL postponement RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 
document. 

11/23/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review email from insurer and RD $395.00 0.05 $19.75 
discuss with Naomi I. 

11/2312020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review insurance policies and RD $395.00 0.53 $209.35 
email to Naomi L. with queries. 

11/2312020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Meet with Jonathan of Danbury JP $195.00 1.17 $228.15 
at Densley 9:30am 

1112312020 Receivership- Court Appointed: Email exchanges with Josh P. re: RD $395.00 0.34 $134.30 
visit to Clearview farm. 

11/2312020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call Brend M. re: redirection of RD $395.00 0.15 $59.25 
mail. 

11/2312020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Leiter to BNS demands RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 
department. 

11/2312020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Prepare letter re Zuccaro banks, BM $195.00 0.80 $156.00 

Page 4of11 

92



various. 

11/23/2020 Receivership • Court Appointed: On hold with Canada Post. BM $195.00 0.90 $175.50 
Talk wilh representative re mall redirect. 
Get information on filing online. 
Receive information on filing and authenticating. 

11/23/2020 Receivership • Court Appointed: Finalize letter re Zuccaro. BM $195.00 0.80 $156.00 
Resend to RD. 

11/23/2020 Receivership • Court Appoinled: Record TD correspondence re BM $195.00 0.40 $78.00 
seize accounts. Save to drive. (Zuccaro) 

Scan • send Scoliabank to RD. 

11/2312020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Prepare BMO and CIBC letter. BM $195.00 0.60 $117.00 
Look up addresses for service. 

11/2312020 Receivership- Court Appointed: BMO letter, send to addressed BM $195.00 0.40 $78.00 
party, re-send to another as requested. 
CIBC letter, send to third party administrator. 
Compose email. 

1112412020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Visit the farm, take pictures and JP $195.00 3.17 $618.15 
drop off paperwork. 
242kms round trip 

11/24/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review responses from RD $395.00 0.80 $316.00 
applicant's legal counsel. Email to legal and staff requesting 
drafting of letters, taking of possession steps, and other. 

1112412020 Receivership - Court Appointed: follow up re appraisals, call w NL $295.00 3.10 $914.50 
tenant, working on structure for a cash now, call w Josh re farm 
site visit 

11/2412020 Receivership • Court Appointed: Upload photos and email JP $195.00 0.41 $79.95 
updates and paperwork to Rahn and Naomi 

11/2412020 Receivership • Court Appointed: Email exchanges with Wendy G. RD $395.00 1.91 $754.45 
Review various emails from Josh P., Brenda M. and Naomi L. 
Planning call with Naomi L. Review and BL letter to legal counsel 
for Frank Z. Execute direction re: funding and PAD agreement 
and forward to lender and legal counsel wilh explanation. 

11/2412020 Receivership • Court Appointed: Call with Naomi JP $195.00 0.21 $40.95 

11/24/2020 Receivership • Court Appointed: Work on mail forwarding. BM $195.00 1.00 $195.00 
Send RD email re issues trying to set up. 

11/24/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Mail redirect form = prep for post BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
office visit. 

11/24/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: PPSA on Frank Zuccaro BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 

1112412020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Prepare letter to Accountant. BM $195.00 0.40 $78.00 

1112412020 Receivership • Court Appointed: Specific PPSA Search Frank BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
Zuccaro 
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11/25/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Discuss file with Brenda M. RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 

11/25/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Attend at post office re: RD $395.00 0.50 $197.50 
redirection of mail. 

11/25/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Attend Court hearing to extend RD $395.00 0.31 $122.45 
stay. 

11/25/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchange and call with RD $395.00 0.15 $59.25 
Naomi L. re: appraisals. 

11/25/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: follow up re appraisals NL $295.00 1.13 $333.35 

11/25/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Wendy G. re: FRO and RD $395.00 0.30 $118.50 
other estate matters. 

11/25/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review and execute letter to RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 
accountant. 

11/25/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Discuss accounting with Brenda RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 
M. 

11/25/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: email exchange with bank RD $395.00 0.05 $19.75 

11/25/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review trust ledger re funding RD $395.00 0.34 $134.30 
received. Approve funds receipt for accounting. 

11/25/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review Court orders re: payment RD $395.00 0.71 $280.45 
of past expenses. Consider responsibility of Receiver re: arrears. 
Email to Wendy G. 

11/25/2020 Receivership - Court Appolnled: Set up banking files re 4 BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
receivership files. 

11/25/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Set up Ascend files - - order BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
Ascend licenses. 

11/25/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Leiter to Nick Deluca, BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
Accountant. 
Scan/ save to drive. 

11/26/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Meet Adam from platinum at JP $195.00 1.44 $280.80 
Densley 

11/26/2020 Receivership- Court Appointed: Call with Josh P. re: records. RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 

11126/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email to Naomi L. re: insurance. RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 

11/26/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: review of insurance, appraisal NL $295.00 3.62 $1,067.90 
follow ups, call w tenants 

11/26/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Naomi L. re: insurance RD $395.00 0.46 $181.70 
policies, coverages and appraisals. 

11/26/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Look for realtor's for listing RD $395.00 0.30 $118.50 
proposals. 

11/26/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review liquidation proposal. RD $395.00 0.38 $150.10 
Review emails re: insurance policy adjustments. Review emails 
re: appraisals. 
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11/26/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Send King City info to developer RD $395.00 0.45 $177.75 
for opinion of future use and value. Review purview report. 

11126/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review offer to appraise from RD $395.00 0.70 $276.50 
Cornwall. Email to applicant's legal counsel re: consent and 
request info needed. Email exchanges with Naomi L. re: scope of 
appraisal of King. Review whether King Is in greenbelt. 

11/26/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with tenant re: payment of RO $395.00 0.57 $225.15 
rent and Issues relating lo lhe Densley building. 

11/26/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Upload video and chat with JP $195.00 0.19 $37.05 
Naomi (earlier) 

11/26/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: coordinating appraisals and NL $295.00 2.06 $607.70 
insurance 

11/26/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Look up address for Sunlife, BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
Kitchener. 
Prepare letter, ask for info on product and values. 

11/26/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Letter to CRA re My Business BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
account. 
Scan, save, send to RD. 

1112612020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Enter 2 disbursements. BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 

11/26/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: record 1 disbursement, 1 F. BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
Zuccro, 1 Metropolitan, 1 Orracus. 

11126/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Get licenses through, work on BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
transfers and payments. All files set up with dates, all files now 
transferred. 

11/26/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Set up bank accounts, Frank BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
Zuccaro, Metropolitan, Orracuz, 863704. 

11/26/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Receive Ascend license, save to BM $195.00 0.80 $156.00 
drive, work on license key issue, send email to Promerlc. 

11/27/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review and amend letter to Sun RD $395.00 0.19 $75.05 
Life. 

11/27/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review Court orders. Review RD $395.00 1.92 $758.40 
comments from Wendy G. and various emails Draft email to 
Avery Z. 

11/27/2020 Receivership ·Court Appointed: Email exchanges with Avery Z. RD $395.00 0.11 $43.45 
re: Densley appraisal. 

11/27/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Pick up Cheques from Mauro, JP $195.00 1.00 $195.00 
visit Venezuelan restaurant and drop orf cheques to Rahn 

11/27/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Noami L. re: sale of RD $395.00 0.81 $319.95 
Metropolitan assets and other receivership matters. 

11/27/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Sun Life letter - do revisions to BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
letter and attachments. 

11/27/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Finalize Sun Life letter, prepare BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
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rormailing. 

11/27/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Receive letter from NOL BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
Professional Corporation. 
Scan, save to drive, letter together with all financial statement 
attachments. 

11/30/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review email wilh applicant's RD $395.00 0.17 $67.15 
legal counsel. Email Receiver's legal counsel. 

11/30/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Densley insurance and PAD. RD $395.00 0.15 $59.25 

11/30/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: call w appraiser, urban planner, NL $295.00 2.51 $740.45 
phase I environmental 

11/30/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchanges with Wendy G. RD $395.00 0.41 $161.95 
Amend and send email to Avery Z. with receivership update. 

11/30/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review Densley invoices for RD $395.00 0.25 $98.75 
plumbing and cleaning work completed in OcUNov. Email to Josh 
P. re: records. 

11/30/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Return email to accountant RD $395.00 0.93 $367.35 
requesting additional information. Email exchanges with Avery Z. 
re: assets of Frank Z. Review financial statements and tax 
returns. Calls with Naomi L. Review various emails. 

11/30/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review emails re insurance BM $195.00 0.40 $78.00 
preparations. Prepare PAD forms for pre authorized payments. 

12/0112020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review various emails. Email RD $395.00 0.59 $233.05 
exchanges with Avery Z., Naomi L. and Brenda M. 

12/01/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: review of emails. call w corvette NL $295.00 2.98 $879.10 
insurer, coordinating phase 1 environmental, corresponding with 
Densley and Farm prospective appraisers 

12/01/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review and complete RD $395.00 1.60 $632.00 
environmental assessment engagement documents. pay fee and 
exchange emails with S2S. Discuss this and various matters wilh 
Naomi L. Collect rent from 2 of 3 tenants. 

12/0112020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review Aviva insurance policy. RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 
Ask Avery Z. for discharge of second mortgagee. Email Brenda 
M. re: searches of named insured. 

12/0112020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review District Ventures lease. RD $395.00 1.26 $505.60 
Reconcile amount paid to amount in lease. Email CFO at district 
ventures. Review terms in lease regarding responsibility for sewer 
back up to determine whether tenant has a right of set off against 
the Nov rent. Email Josh P. to visit repair site and gather 
information. 

12/0112020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Phone with Naomi JP $195.00 0.34 $66.30 
checking emails and confirming inspection meeting for Densley 

12/02/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: various: including insurance NL $295.00 2.61 $769.95 
matters, calls to listing agents , follow up re metropolitan assets 
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12/0212020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Mr. Mendicino. Email 
exchanges with Mr. Mendicino and Mr. Zeidman. Review new 
parcel registers. 

RD $395.00 0.92 $363.40 

1210212020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review and respond to emails. RD $395.00 0.09 $35.55 

12/0212020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review pictures of farm property. RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 

12/0212020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Naomi L. re: appraisals. RD $395.00 0.60 $237 .00 
Review Cornwall appraisal and sign. 

12/0212020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review Metropolitan teaser. RD $395.00 0.40 $158.00 
Email instructions to Naomi re: sales process. 

12/02/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review plalinum liquidation RD $395.00 0.30 $118.50 
proposal. 

Disbursements 

Dato Doscrlptlon 

1111812020 Mail Redirection: Mail redirections 
4 x $260.05 plus hst 

11/1812020 Search Charges: PPSA Search 

11/2412020 Search Charges: PPSA- Frank Zuccaro 

11124/2020 Search Charges: Specific PPSA Search with birthdate 
Frank Zuccaro 

· N1mo Titlo 

Naomi Lieberman 

Josh Pearson 

Rahn Oodick LIT, CPA, President 

Brenda McKnight Para Professional 

Services Subtotal 

Raio Quantity 

$1,040.20 1.00 

$19.30 1.00 

$19.30 1.00 

$19.30 1.00 

Expenses Subtotal 

Hou re Hourly Rate 

28.6 $295.00 

16.11 $195.00 

49.77 $395.00 

20.3 $195.00 

Subtotal 

Harmonized Sales Tax (13.0%) 

Total 
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$35,196.10 

Total 

$1,040.20 

$19.30 

$19.30 

$19.30 

$1,098.10 

Total 

$8,437.00 

$3, 141.45 

$19,659.15 

$3,958.50 

$36,294.20 

$4,718.25 

$41,012.45 
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Statement of Account Summary: 

Current Invoice 

lnvolee Numbor Duo On Amount Duo 

10047 1211112020 $41,012.45 

Please make all amounts payable to: Oodick Landau Inc. 

Harmonized Sales Tax No.: 847378932 RT 0001 
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Payment• Racolved 

$0.00 

Outstanding Balance 

Total Amount Outstanding 

Bal1nco Duo 

$41,012.45 

$41,012.45 

$41,012.45 
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Remittance Advice 

Chocking lnforrriatlori · . 

Send Cheques to: Dodick Landa Inc. 
4646 Dufferln St., Suite 6 
Toronto, ON, M3H 5S4 

Attention: Ms. Brenda McKnight (brenda.mcknight@dodick.ca) 

WI.re Transf~' ln!ci'~~o'n · 

Bank Name/Address: Beneficiary Bank: 

Intermediary Bank: 

Bank ASA/Routing #: 026 009 593 

Name/Account #: Beneficiary Name: 
Beneficiary Account: 
Beneficiary Transit: 
Bank Code: . 

SWIFT: TDOMCATTTOR 

TD Canada Trust 
2300 Steeles Ave W, Suite 200, Vaughan, Ontario, Canada 

Bank of America, New York, NY (U.S. Wires) 

Dodick Landau Inc. 
5272423 
14822 
004 

Please include the invoice number 1004 7 as an additional reference so we may accurately identify and apply your 
payment. 

Please provide adequate payment to cover the wire fees assessed by your financial institution. 
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DODlCK 
LANDAU 
Dodlck Landau Inc. 
4646 Oufferin SI., Suite 6 
Toronto, ON 
M3H 5S4 
Phone: 416-645-0542 
www.dodick.ca 

Invoice # 10058 
Issued Dale: 01/08/2021 

863704 Ontario Limited, Metropolitan Ice Cream Inc., Oraccuz Holding Lid. and Frank Zuccaro 
c/o Dodick Landa Inc. 
acting as Court Appointed Receiver 
4646 Dufferin SI., Suite 6 
Toronto, ON, M3H 554 

Enclosed please find our statement of account for services rendered in our capacity as Receiver. The following is a 
summary of time by staff member. 

Client Reference Number: MET-111720-AZ 

Professional Fees 

Date .· · D.Scrtptton Namo Hourly Hours Tollll 
. Rate 

1210312020 Receivership - Court Appointed: calling potentially interested parties NL $295.00 0.11 $32.45 

12104/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: finalizing and circulating teaser to NL $295.00 0.65 $191.75 
interested parties 

12104/2020 Receivership- Court Appointed: Holding for Network Solutions, 
require contact person for legal notice. 

Receive contact information, sent letter to legal for Network 
Solutions. 

BM $195.00 0.80 $156.00 

1210712020 Receivership- Court Appointed: Metropolitan: Gather due diligence RD $395.00 0.50 $197.50 
documents and save to due diligence folder on server for 
prospective purchasers to review. 

12107/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: drafting ad for insolvency insider re NL $295.00 1.09 $321.55 
asset sale, liaising with interested parties 

1210712020 Receivership- Court Appointed: Review emails to various 
interesled parties and discuss with Naomi L. 
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12/07/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Search for corporate lawyer's RD $395.00 0.27 $106.65 
contact info for letter. Email to Wendy G. re: doing tradename and 
mar1< searches. 

12/08/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review emails from Brenda M. and RD $395.00 0.06 $23.70 
respond. 

12/08/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Locate domain name for BM $195.00 0.40 $78.00 
Metropolitan Ice Cream. 
Contact Bethena Dasher @ web.com with information required. 

12/08/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Receive email, forward to RD. BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 

12/08/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Receive response re Bell - save to BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
drive, email to RO. 

12/09/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: following up with interested parties NL $295.00 0.14 $41.30 

12/09/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Print letter J. Furman BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
print attachments. 
Mailing of 1 O letters. 

12/09/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Finalize letter to J. Furman BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 

12/14/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: review of emails in connection with NL $295.00 3.17 $935.15 
ad placed promoting the assets for sale 

12/14/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Calls with Naomi L. re: prospective RD $395.00 1.45 $572.75 
purchasers. Call with a prospective purchaser. Email to Avery Z. re: 
access to manager of business. Email exchanges with Stella M. of 
Fire Power and other parties re: purchase of business. 

12/15/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with prospective purchaser. RO $395.00 0.15 $59.25 

12/15/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: circulating information to interested NL $295.00 0.45 $132.75 
parties 

12/15/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Prepare mail, creditors packages BM $195.00 0.40 $78.00 
re Metropolitan Ice Cream. 

12/1612020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with prospective purchaser. RD $395.00 0.30 $118.50 

12/16/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: follow up with interested parties NL $295.00 1.28 $377.60 

12/1712020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Showing contents of warehouse lo JP $195.00 2.05 $399.75 
ice cream auctioneer. 

12/17/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: responding to calls from liquidators NL $295.00 1.35 $398.25 
and other emails from Interested parties 

12/17/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Talk to Jack Furman re BM $195.00 0.40 $78.00 
Metropolitan. 
Receive email from Mr. Furman. 
Scan and save. 

12/1712020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Prepare cover letter for BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
miscellaneous mailings. 
Send 5 mailings. 

12/18/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: responding to emails from NL $295.00 0.25 $73.75 
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interested parties 

12/2112020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Meet with Joe, liquidator, tour ice JP $195.00 1.23 $239.85 
cream equipment 

12/2212020 Receivership - Court Appointed: responding to inquiries from NL $295.00 0.34 $100.30 
interested parties 

12/2212020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Receive rent cheques, set BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
reminders, put in safe. 

1212312020 Receivership - Court Appointed: site meeting with Joshua and JP $195.00 1.75 $341.25 
emails with Rahn and Naomi 

12/24/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: responding to interested parties NL $295.00 0.76 $224.20 

12/24/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review various email exchanges. RD $395.00 0.04 $15.80 

12129/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: follow up with interested parties NL $295.00 0.58 $171.10 

12/30/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: review of emails and responding to NL $295.00 0.56 $165.20 
inquiries 

01/0412021 Receivership - Court Appointed: review of emails from Interested NL $295.00 1.02 $300.90 
parties 

01/05/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Put together a list of liquidators for JP $195.00 1.51 $294.45 
Naomi 
Review leases for Rahn and try to figure out ulilities. 

01/0612021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Meet with G for Gelato, look for JP $195.00 4.01 $781.95 
recipes, meet with TCL assets, take pictures for Tony, figure out 
utilities for Mauro and Venezuelan place. 

01/0712021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Naomi about food at JP $195.00 0.25 $48.75 
Densley and emails. 

Services Subtotal $7,396.55 

Disbursements 
.. 

Dato Do.crlptlon 

12/09/2020 Postage: 10 letters x $1.89 
plus HST 

Namo Tiiie . 

Naomi Lieberman 

Josh Pearson 

Rahn Oodick LIT, CPA, President 

Brenda McKnight Para Professional 
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Rato Quantity Total 

$18.90 1.00 $18.90 

Expenses Subtotal $18.90 

Hours Hourly Rate Total 

11.75 $295.00 $3,466.25 

10.8 $195.00 $2,106.00 

2.94 $395.00 $1,161.30 

3.4 $195.00 $663.00 
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Subtotal $7,415.45 

Enclosed please find our statement of account for services rendered in our capacity as Receiver. The following is a 
summary of time by staff member. 

Client Reference Number: 863·171120.AZ 

Professional Fees 

01118 Doacrlptrori Namo Hourty H.iiure · ·rotaJ 
Raio 

12/01/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Search - PDP Importing limited BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 

12/01/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Send insurance PAD form lo BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
Aviva re Zuccaro insurance. Email to BMO for additional 
Information as per RD. 

12/02/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Phone calls with Naomi about JP $195.00 0.84 $163.80 
appointments 
Calls with Mauro and Rahn about Frank coming to premisises 
Emails with Rahn, Naomi and Tammy about site visits and 
inspections for next this week and next 

12/02/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Calls with Josh P. re Frank Z. RD $395.00 0.80 $316.00 
planning to enter Densley property to remove assets. Emails to 
Frank Z. legal counsel. Call with tenant, Mauro R. re Frank Z. 
attempt to enter property. 

12/0212020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Receive post dated cheques. BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
Log in Ascend, put in safe. 

12/0212020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Record, 2 deposits, 1 cheque BM $195.00 0.40 $78.00 
as per requisitions. 

12/02/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Prepare cheque for Promeric re BM $195.00 0.40 $78.00 
Ascend licenses. 
Prepare accruals for Orracuz, Metropolitan and Frank Zuccaro. 

12/02/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Record mail redirection. BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 

12103/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review King property deleted RD $395.00 0.41 $161.95 
parcel register. Draft email to insurer to remove old mortgagor as 
loss payee on Aviva policy. 

12/03/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: responding lo queries from NL $295.00 2.37 $699.15 
appraisers, listing agents, review of letter from planner retained to 
determine any development prospects for King and the Farm 

12/0312020 Receivership· Court Appointed: Review planning briefs. RD $395.00 0.22 $86.90 

12/0312020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Visit Tammy, Luis and Mauro at JP $195.00 1.67 $325.65 
Densley, prepare for inspection on Monday. Emails and updates 
regarding next week's visits and question emails from Rahn and 
Naomi 
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12103/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review update from Josh P. re: RD $395.00 0.32 $126.40 
Densley. Call with Josh P. Respond to email with comments and 
questions. 

12/03/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review emails and email RD $395.00 0.18 $71.10 
exchanges with Naomi L. 

12103/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review engagement letter for RD $395.00 0.28 $110.60 
appraisal for King property. Discuss and email exchange with 
Naomi L. 

12103/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email proposal to district RD $395.00 0.93 $367.35 
ventures re: settling offsets against Nov/20 rent. Call with Wendy 
G. re: secured creditor. Email exchange with Josh P. re: Densley 
property. Email to Brenda M. re: letter to Equitable Bank. Review 
Metropolitan CA. Email sent to equitable bank. 

12103/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Look up property tax information BM $195.00 4.00 $780.00 
for letters regarding property lax to townships/cities. 
Look for tax bills. Use parcel registered for legal descriptions. Go 
to township/city website for email addresses, etc. Prepare letters 
to 2 townships and 2 cities. Prepare allachments. 

12103/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Send PAD to insurance re active BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
policy. 

12103/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Letter to insurance re Corvette. BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
Send to RD. 

12/03/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Save parcel registration for BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
863704 to drive. 
Revise insurance letter. 

12103/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Prepare letter to CRA to obtain BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
online access of accounts. 

12104/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: coordinating appraisals, NL $295.00 2.58 $761.10 
liquidating proposals, site visits 

12104/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchanges with Equitable RD $395.00 0.36 $142.20 
Bank rep. Review and amend letter to Equitable. Review other 
emails. 

12104/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review emails to prospective RD $395.00 0.03 $11.85 
purchasers of Metro. 

12/04/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review, sign and return the RD $395.00 0.29 $114.55 
Reliable appraiser engagement letter. 

12104/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Calf with Jackson Chau of RD $395.00 0.40 $158.00 
Equitable Bank re: mortgage. 

12104/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Naomi L. re: cash flow RD $395.00 0.36 $142.20 
forecast. 

12104/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review 8 letters drafted by RD $395.00 0.32 $126.40 
Brenda M., make comments and sign back. 

12104/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Provide bank activity and RD $395.00 0.30 $118.50 
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descriptions to Naomi L. 

12104/2020 Receivership- Court Appointed: Review numerous documents RD $395.00 0.81 $319.95 
provided by legal counsel for Frank Z. and save on server. 

12104/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review and sign misc. bank RD $395.00 0.09 $35.55 
letters. 

1210412020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Scan/send, all letters to RD for BM $195.00 0.40 $78.00 
review, signature. 

1210412020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Preparation of 9-10 letters to BM $195.00 1.50 $292.50 
banks surrounding debtor's home. 
Copy attachments. 
Send all to RD. 

1210412020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Prepare letter to Bell Canada BM $195.00 1.20 $234.00 
with attachments. 

Revise letter to Equitable Bank, prepare attachments. 

Prepare letter to J. Chau at Equitable Bank. 

12104/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Prepare letters to Northbridge BM $195.00 1.40 $273.00 
Financial and Equitable Bank. 
Prepare attachments. 

12/07/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Site visits at Densley with JP $195.00 2.93 $571.35 
inspectors and RE brokers 

1210712020 Receivership - Court Appointed: listing proposals, preparing NL $295.00 2.02 $595.90 
receivership cash flow 

12107/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review and sign letters to Bell, RO $395.00 0.35 $138.25 
Insurance broker, city of vaughan, city of toronto and others. 

1210712020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchanges with Equitable RD $395.00 0.07 $27.65 
bank. 

12107/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Revisions to letters, printing BM $195.00 3.50 $682.50 
letters and attachments, sending revisions to RD, scanning all 
documents, sending all emails. 

12108/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Meet with Lee and Ass at JP $195.00 1.13 $220.35 
Densley, upload photos and emails RE Densley 

12108/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchanges with S2S and RD $395.00 0.28 $110.60 
answer his questions re: his Phase 1 enviro assessment. 

12108/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchanges with S2S and RD $395.00 0.12 $47.40 
send work invoice and picture. Review emails from josh P. 

12108/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: responding to information NL $295.00 1.80 $531.00 
requests from appraisers and listing agents 

12108/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Phone with Naomi and Luis JP $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
regarding questions. Cheques and lease. Email update. 

12108/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review emails with appraiser RD $395.00 0.54 $213.30 
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and prospective listing agents. Call with Naomi l. re various 
matters relating to the sale of the properties. 

12108/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Prepare Letter to Jack Furman. BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 

12/0912020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review mail and discuss with RD $395.00 0.15 $59.25 
Brenda M. payment of bills. 

12/09/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: working with listing agents to NL $295.00 0.37 $109.15 
provide information for their proposal re Densley and King 

12109/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review various emails re: RD $395.00 0.09 $35.55 
appraisals, listing proposals and from legal counsel of Frank Z. 

12109/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Record 3 disbursements. BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 

12109/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Receive BMO response. Fwd to BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
RD, save to drive. 

12110/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Met with Jeff (RE) at Densley for JP $195.00 1.32 $257.40 
walkthrough 

12110/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchanges with tenant's RD $395.00 0.19 $75.05 
controller re: settlement on Nov. rent. 

12110/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: responding to tenant emails, NL $295.00 2.11 $622.45 
coordinating listing proposals for Densley and King 

12110/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with tenant at Densley. RD $395.00 0.15 $59.25 

12110/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Noami L. to discuss RO $395.00 0.38 $150.10 
items included in the sale and visiting King property. 

12/10/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email to Frank Mendicino RD $395.00 0.22 $86.90 
regarding access to the King and Collage properties. 

12111/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review calculation and source RD $395.00 0.36 $142.20 
documents re offset to Nov. rent and email tenant's controller. 
Review lease expansion and floor plan documents received from 
tenant's controller. 

12111/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: responding to numerous emails NL $295.00 1.38 $407.10 
re: parties interested in the purchase of assets and re: sale 
process for Densley. 

12111/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Naomi L. re: various RD $395.00 0.27 $106.65 
matters. inclu. insurance, receipts of listing proposals and sales 
process. 

12111/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Josh Pearson re: RD $395.00 0.08 $31.60 
Densley property. 

12/11/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Provide Naomi L. info for cash RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 
flow forecast. Review email exchanges. 

12111/2020 Receivership • Court Appointed: Review insurance policy and RD $395.00 0.34 $134.30 
email to Naomi L. 
Review revised Inspector engagement letter and email Andrea P. 

12114/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email to Avery Z. re: access to RD $395.00 0.39 $154.05 
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King property. Email to Josh P. and Naomi L. re: inspection. Calls 
with Naomi L. re: Densley property. 

12114/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review llsting proposal for King. RD $395.00 0.35 $138.25 
Email exchanges with Naomi L. Email exchange with Avery Z. 

12114/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Pick up and deliver rent cheques JP $195.00 0.93 $181.35 
from Luis at Densley 

12114/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: review of listing proposals and NL $295.00 0.27 $79.65 
related emails 

12114/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with S2S Environmental re: RD $395.00 0.39 $154.05 
results of phase 1. Update to Naomi L. 

12/14/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Respond lo various emails. NL $295.00 0.13 $38.35 

12/15/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Collect rent. Call with Josh P. RD $395.00 0.14 $55.30 

12115/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review updated insurance RD $395.00 0.06 $23.70 
policy. 

12/15/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review past environmental RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 
reports and email copies lo S2S Environmental. 

12/15/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: call w broker re listing proposal, NL $295.00 1.26 $371.70 
responding to emails 

12115/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email to Avery Z. re: King RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 
property. 

12/1512020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Wendy G. with regards RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 
to access to King. 

12/1512020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Equitable Bank RD $395.00 0.93 $367.35 
providing update re: sale of building. Requested statement of 
account, property tax funded to date, and loan documentation. 
Review letter to Frank Z. legal counsel re: access to the King 
property. Email staff re: change of the locks potentially this Friday. 

12/1512020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Naomi L. re: cash flow, RD $395.00 0.43 $169.85 
borrowings, mortgage payments, access to King property, 
appraisal of King property, and listing agents. 

12/15/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: 3 Disbursements, BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
send Naomi invoices. 

12/16/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review Equitable Bank mortgage RD $395.00 0.59 $233.05 
docs. Approve mortgage payments for Nov and Dec 2020. 

12116/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: review of emails re access lo NL $295.00 0.55 $162.25 
King, listing agent calls 

12116/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Sign cheques. Discuss matters RD $395.00 0.08 $31.60 
with Brenda M. Email Naomi L. 

12/16/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review email response from RD $395.00 0.38 $150.10 
applicant. Provide response to applicant's request to delay selling 
King. Email applicant's legal counsel. Review email from 
Receiver's legal counsel. 
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12/16/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Naomi l. re: Densley RD $395.00 0.21 $82.95 
listing proposals and King visit. 

12/1612020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Deposit 2 cheques. BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 

12/1712020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchanges with Avery Z. RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 

12/1712020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Tony Z. re: various RD $395.00 1.42 $560.90 
matters. Call with Wendy G. Calls with Naomi L. Review and sign 
letter. Message from Tony Z. legal counsel. Review various 
emails. Call with Naomi L. re; appraisal. 

12/1712020 Receivership - Court Appointed: coordinating site visit for King NL $295.00 0.22 $64.90 

1211812020 Receivership - Court Appointed: call w RD re King Property, site NL $295.00 5.35 $1,578.25 
visit, calls w listing agents re listing proposals 

12/1812020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Attend Cushman Wakefield RD $395.00 1.30 $513.50 
presentation. Discuss with naomi L. 

1211812020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Attend CBRE presentation. RD $395.00 1.40 $553.00 
Discuss with naomi L. 

12118/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Naomi L. re: appraisal RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 
visit to King property. 

12/21/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Meet with Luis regarding more JP $195.00 1.00 $195.00 
space wanted 

12/21/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: responding lo question from NL $295.00 0.10 $29.50 
counsel 

1212212020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Update Rahn, Naomi about JP $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
Densley and meeting with Luis 

12/22/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchanges with Josh P. RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 
and Naomi L. 

12/22/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: review and summary of listing NL $295.00 3.24 $955.80 
proposals, responding to emails re insurance 

1212212020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review various expenses. RD $395.00 0.36 $142.20 
Provide instructions to Brenda. 

12/22/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchange with Tony Z. and RD $395.00 0.54 $213.30 
his employment legal counsel. Email exchange with Wendy G. re: 
same and review response to Tony Z. legal counsel. Review 
Densly appraisal. 

1212212020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Discuss with Brenda M. PAD to RD $395.00 0.14 $55.30 
insurer and why it was returned. Checked bank lo ensure correct 
bank account number was used. 

12/2212020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Talk to RD re 863 returned PAP BM $195.00 1.20 $234.00 
for Insurance. 
Sent email to Bank. Telephone call with Anna at TD. Send email 
to RDA Insurance re PAP. Advise RD on status. 

12122/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Scan all mail redirection BM $195.00 0.40 $78.00 
documents for files. 
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1212212020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Prepare cheque re insurance. BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 

1212412020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Naomi re: various RD $395.00 0.14 $55.30 
matters. 

12124/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review and approve payment of RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 
bills. 

12124/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review Densley appraisal in RD $395.00 2.71 $1,070.45 
detail. Review the listing summary comparison and make 
additions to it. Call with Naomi L. to discuss listing broker options 
and pricing options. 

12124/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: discussion re listing proposals NL $295.00 0.56 $165.20 

12129/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: review or appraisal, responding NL $295.00 1.19 $351.05 
to inquiries re King 

12/29/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Naomi L. re: appraisal RD $395.00 0.34 $134.30 
as compared to listing proposals and next steps. 

12129/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review listing proposals. RD $395.00 1.48 $584.60 
Prepare comparison summary to appraisal. Calls with Naomi L. 

12/30/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: review of appraisal NL $295.00 0.10 $29.50 

12131/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Draft detailed lengthy email RD $395.00 1.45 $572.75 
update to Avery Z. re: sale of Densley and key considerations. 
Email to Naomi re: info to gather re: sale process due diligence. 
Review other related emails. 

1213112020 Receivership - Court Appointed: follow up re rent for Densley, NL $295.00 0.60 $177.00 
review of related emails 

01/0412021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Tony Z. re: various RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 
matters. 

01/04/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email to Brenda M. re: letter to RD $395.00 0.07 $27.65 
be drafted. 

01/04/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review various correspondence. RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 
Email exchange with Naomi L. re: enviro assessment. 

01/04/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: review of emails re NL $295.00 1.29 $380.55 
environmental, listing, follow up re rent 

01/04/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Naomi re: various RD $395.00 0.28 $110.60 
matters. 

01/04/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Discuss with Naomi L. status of RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 
sale of King property. 

01/04/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review and deposit rents. RD $395.00 0.26 $102.70 

01/05/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: responding to emails from NL $295.00 1.28 $377.60 
interested parties 

01/0512021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review emails by Noami L. RD $395.00 0.67 $264.65 
Email exchanges with Josh P. re: uutity and TMI charges to 
tenants. 
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01/06/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: responding to emails from NL $295.00 0.88 
interested parties, reviewing questions rec'd in connection with 
the appraised value 

01/06/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Josh P. re: utility RD $395.00 0.18 
charges to tenants. 

01/06/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Discuss sales process with RD $395.00 0.20 
Brenda M. and utility charges. 

01/06/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review comments to listing RD $395.00 1.28 
proposals with Naomi L. Respond in detail to comments. Search 
method of calculating capital gain. 

01/07/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchanges re: appraisal of RD $395.00 0.10 
farm property. 

01/0712021 Receivership - Court Appointed: follow up emails w interested NL $295.00 1.57 
parties re NOA, due diligence material, viewing the equipment 

01/0712021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Naomi L. re: sale of RD $395.00 0.15 
Metropolitan equipment. 

01/07/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Naomi L. re: status of RD $395.00 0.16 
building inspection report and appraiser comments. 

01/07/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review response to questions by RD $395.00 0.14 
appraiser and forward to applicant. 

Services Subtotal 

Disbursements 

Date Dosc:rlpUon 

12/0112020 Search Charges: Search PDP Importing Limited 

12/01/2020 Search Charges: Corporate search PDP Importing Limited 

12/16/2020 Courier: Mall to Equitable Bank 

12/23/2020 Search Charges 

12/23/2020 Mail Redirection: four locations 

.. Name. Tltlo 

Naomi Lieberman 

Josh Pearson 

RahnDodick LIT, CPA, President 

Brenda McKnight Para Professional 
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$19.30 1.00 

$28.34 1.00 

$10.67 1.00 

$142.92 1.00 

$1, 175.44 1.00 

Expenses Subtotal 

Hou re HourlyRato 

31.22 $295.00 

10.52 $195.00 

30.21 $395.00 

18.4 $195.00 

Subtotal 

$259.60 

$71.10 

$79.00 

$505.60 

$39.50 

$463.15 

$59.25 

$63.20 

$55.30 

$26,782.25 

Total 

$19.30 

$28.34 

$10.67 

$142.92 

$1,175.44 

$1,376.67 

.Toia• 

$9,209.90 

$2,051.40 

$11,932.95 

$3,588.00 

$28,158.92 
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Statement of Account Summary: 

Current Invoice 

Invoice Numbor Duo On Amount Due 

10058 02/07/2021 $40,199.04 

Please make all amounts payable to: Dodick Landau Inc. 

Harmonized Sales Tax No.: 847378932 RT 0001 
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Subtotal 

Harmonized Sales Tax (13.0%) 

Total 

Payments Rocelved 

$0.00 

Outstanding Balance 

Total Amount Outstanding 

$35,574.37 

$4,624.67 

$40,199.04 

Balanco Du11 

$40,199.04 

$40,199.04 

$40,199.04 
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Remittance Advice 

.checklnil infcirinallon ·. • · . . ·- ' . . .. ~. - . 

Send Cheques to: Dodick Landa Inc. 
4646 Dufferin St., Suite 6 
Toronto, ON, M3H 5S4 

Attention: Ms. Brenda McKnight (brenda.mcknight@dodick.ca) 

Wlro Trantfor Information 

Bank Name/Address: Beneficiary Bank: 

Intermediary Bank: 

Bank ABA/Routlng #: 026 009 593 

Name/Account #: Beneficiary Name: 
Beneficiary Account: 
Beneficiary Transit: 
Bank Code: 

SWIFT: TDOMCATTTOR 

TD Canada Trust 
2300 Steeles Ave w. Suite 200, Vaughan, Ontario, Canada 

Bank of America, New York, NY (U.S. Wires) 

Dodick Landau Inc. 
5272423 
14822 
004 

Please include the invoice number 10058 as an additional reference so we may accurately identify and apply your 
payment. 

Please provide adequate payment to cover the wire fees assessed by your financial institution. 
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DODlCK 
LANDAU 
Dodlck Landau Inc. 
4646 Dufferin St., Suite 6 
Toronto, ON 
M3H 5S4 
Phone: 416-64S.0542 
www.dodick.ca 

Invoice # 10071 
Issued Date: 02/11/2021 

863704 Ontario Limited, Metropolitan Ice Cream Inc .• Oraccuz Holding lid. and Frank Zuccaro 
c/o Dodick Landau Inc., Court Appointed Receiver 
4646 Dufferin St., Suite 6 
Toronto, ON, M3H 5S4 

Enclosed please find our statement of account for services rendered in our capacity as Receiver. The following is a 
summary of time by staff member. 

Client Reference Number: 863-171120-AZ 

Professional Fees 

·· .i>ate Description Name Hourly Hours Total 
Rate 

01/04/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Send Sun life letter, redirect BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
returned mail. 

01/06/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Prepare cheque/cheque BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
requisition, Hydro One. 

01/06/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Prepare deposit with deposit BM $195.00 0.40 $78.00 
requisition 
Prepare cheque with cheque requisition. 

01/06/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Prepare courier F. Zuccaro. BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 

01/07/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Send Enbridge account to Avery BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
Zeidman 

01/07/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Sent package re receivership to BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
creditor. 
Log in Ascend. 

01/08/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review comments provided by RD $395.00 0.53 $209.35 
Avery Z. re: appraisal and specific use as a food building. 

01/08/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review building report. RD $395.00 0.74 $292.30 
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0110812021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email to building inspector RD $395.00 0.60 $237.00 
requesting back up calculation. Email exchanges and instructions to 
Josh P. re: building fire safety compliance and equipment appraisal. 

0110812021 Receivership - Court Appointed: review safety report. JP $195.00 1.79 $349.05 
start work on dealing with report issues. Speak with Rick and email 
for quote. 

01/0812021 Receivership - Court Appointed: review of building inspection report NL $295.00 0.91 $268.45 
for Densley and responding to interested parties re Metro 

01108/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Naomi L. re: various RD $395.00 0.35 $138.25 
matters including cash flow, borrowings, sales process, repairs, 
etc •• 

01/08/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review documents, prepare BM $195.00 0.40 $78.00 
cheque. 

01/08/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Send invoice lo A. Zeidman, scan/ BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
send email. 

01/11/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Coordinating Fire inspection and JP $195.00 0.47 $91.65 
repairs 

01/1112021 Receivership - Court Appointed: review of emails re listing, NL $295.00 1.03 $303.85 
Metropolitan 

01/11/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchanges with Avery Z. and RD $395.00 0.88 $347.60 
client re: valuation of property. 
Review quote for fire safety inspection. Email exchanges with Josh 
P. re: same. 

01/1112021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email instructions to Naomi L. re: RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 
listing broker. 

01/11/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Discuss real property sales RD $395.00 0.08 $31.60 
process with Naomi L. 

01/11/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Look for payment schedule re BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
densley property. 

01/1212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: responding to emails from NL $295.00 0.76 $224.20 
interested parties 

01/1212021 Receivership- Court Appointed: Email exchange with Josh P. re: RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 
fire safely inspection. 

01/12/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Sun Life correspondence, BM $195.00 0.40 $78.00 
re send to alternate address. 

01/1312021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Josh P. regarding RD $395.00 0.19 $75.05 
company records and assets. 

01/13/2021 Receivership· Court Appointed: Email exchanges with Josh P. re: RD $395.00 0.60 $237.00 
recipes and assets. Call with liquidator of Metro assets. 

01/13/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: call w Interested party re bid NL $295.00 0.82 $241.90 
submission 

01/1312021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Fax letter to Agueci Calabretta. BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
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01/13/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Record disbursement. BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 

01/1412021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review statements received in the RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 
mail and provide Brenda instructions. 

01/1412021 Receivership - Court Appointed: review of emails re listing agent NL $295.00 0.18 $53.10 

01/14/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Receive/review response from BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
HSBC. 
Scan, save to drive. 

01/15/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: review of emails from interested NL $295.00 1.30 $383.50 
parties, responding to questions, address deposit need to 
accompany offer 

01/1512021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Noami L. re: listing RD $395.00 2.01 $793.95 
agreement and sale of assets. 
Review email from Avery Z. Review related court orders. Draft 
detailed response. 
Send email to Josh P. and Brenda M re: disclosure document 
search in the order. 
Email building inspector re: forecast cost for roof repairs. 

01/15/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchange with Brenda M. re: RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 
Intact insurance. 

01/15/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Josh P. re: search of RO $395.00 0.26 $102.70 
records for disclosure documents. 

01/15/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Send email to RD re Zuccaro BM $195.00 0.40 $78.00 
Insurance. 

01/16/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review Avery Z. email and email RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 
WendyG. 

01/1612021 Receivership - Court Appointed: summary of offers received NL $295.00 0.68 $200.60 

01/1812021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call Mary Lynn Kentwell at RDS BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
Insurance. Leave message. 

01118/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Speak to Mary Lynn at RDA BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
Insurance. 
Make cc payment for insurance. 
Log to expenses. 

01/18/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review - RD email - list of BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
information. 

01/18/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Scan and save payment BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
confirmation re insurance. 

01/18/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: summarizing offers received for NL $295.00 0.92 $271.40 
assets of metropolitan 

01/18/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Insurance cancellation notice, scan BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
and save to drive. 

01/18/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Wendy G. Review RD $395.00 0.99 $391.05 
previous Court orders. Draft email responses to Avery Z. and Frank 
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M. 

01/18/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Discuss with Naomi L. Metropolitan RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 
sale. 

01/19/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: review of listing agreement w NL 5295.00 3.19 $941.05 
broker for Densley. working on CF forecast to determine next draw 
required 

01/19/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review and approve letter to RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 
CIBC. 

01/19/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review accounting firm invoices. RD $395.00 0.48 $189.60 
Email exchanges with Avery Z. re: various matters. 

01/19/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review Densley listing agreement. RD $395.00 0.96 $379.20 
Make amendments to agreement. Send summary of changes to 
Wendy G. for review. 

01/19/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call CIBC for name of Manager BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
and email address. 
Prepare letter to CIBC re safety deposit box. 
Prepare attach for RD to sign. 
Receive letter back from RD, prep and email to CIBC branch 
manager. 

01/19/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Send package to CIBC Visa re BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
receivership process, by mail. 

01/19/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Send Receivership documents to BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
RBC re 863 and F. Zuccaro. 

01/19/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Research Caisse Branch. Locate BM $195.00 1.10 $214.50 
Aurora location. Find addresses on internet. Call for contact 
information (lengthy). Leave message with branch voice mail. 
Prepare letter. Prepare attachments. 

01/19/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review with Naomi L. receivership RD $395.00 0.71 $280.45 
cash flow forecast. 
Email exchanges with Frank Mendicino re: QB passwords. Email to 
Josh P. re: info on computer. 

01/20/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: review of listing proposal and NL $295.00 0.08 $23.60 
comments from counsel 

01/20/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Prepare deposit requisition. BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 

01/20/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Went through all files at Densley JP $195.00 3.52 $686.40 
looking for CRA and accounting files. 

01/20/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Josh P. re: visit to RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 
Densley, records on computers, etc ... 

01/2012021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Respond to Avery Z. query re: RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 
corvette and vespa. 

01120/2021 Receivership- Court Appointed: Discuss with Brenda record search RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 
for Zuccaro records compliance purposes. 
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01/20/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Naomi L. re: Metropolitan RD $395.00 0.56 $221.20 
sale, sale of Densley property, and other matters. 

01/2012021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Respond to Avery Z. re: queries re: RD $395.00 0.19 $75.05 
corvette and vespa. 

0112012021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchanges with Josh P. re: RD $395.00 0.34 $134.30 
CRA payroll info requested, inspection report and collection of utility 
amounts from tenants. 

01/20/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchange with Wendy G. re: RD $395.00 0.13 $51.35 
listing agreement terms. 

01/2112021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review listing agreement, make RD $395.00 0.82 $323.90 
amendments, discuss with Naomi L. and draft email to CBRE. 

01121/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email response from Avery Z. re: RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 
sale or Metropolitan assets. Instructions to Naomi L. and Wendy G. 

01/21/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: call re Densley, Metropolitan NL $295.00 1.48 $436.60 

01/2212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review and sign receiver RD $395.00 0.51 $201.45 
borrowing advance statement. Complete receiver borrowing 
certificate and sign. Send to Hillmount Capital for processing the 
second Receiver draw on loan. 

01/2212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review all prior correspondence BM $195.00 1.20 $234.00 
for insurance. 
Make up spreadsheet as summary. Compose email to Mary Lynn at 
RDA for assistance with spreadsheet. Review correspondence on 
second Intact Insurance policy. 

01/22/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review payroll information RD $395.00 0.13 $51.35 
gathered by Josh P. for CRA. 

01/22/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with CBRE to review listing RD $395.00 1.52 $600.40 
agreement and next steps for listing the property for sale. Email 
exchanges with Jpsh P. Email building inspector. 

01/22/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: call w CBRE re listing agreement, NL $295.00 2.00 $590.00 
providing Information to broker, review of bill of sale for Metropolitan 
and commenting on same 

01/22/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Dealing with sewage backup at JP $195.00 1.75 $341.25 
Densley 

01/2212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review and respond to various RD $395.00 0.25 $98.75 
emails from Josh P. Email instructions to Naomi L. re: appraisal or 
King. Email response to CBRE. 

01/2212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review updated listing agreement. RD $395.00 0.38 $150.10 
Emails to legal counsel and CBRE. 

01/2212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review bill of sale and email RD $395.00 0.30 $118.50 
exchange with Naomi L and email to Wendy G. with comments. 

0112212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Scan 3 invoices for Frank Zuccaro. BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 

Send all to F. Mendicino as per RD. 
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01/22/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchanges re: information RD $395.00 0.18 $71.10 
needed by listing agent. 

01/2512021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchange with Josh P. RD $395.00 0.07 $27.65 

01/25/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Sign back listing agreement for RD $395.00 0.39 $154.05 
Densley. Email exchanges with Wendy G. 

01/25/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: finalizing !isling agreement, NL $295.00 0.57 $168.15 
Metropolitan sale considerations 

01/25/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review asset purchase RD $395.00 0.54 $213.30 
agreement. Email exchanges with Josh P. 

01/2512021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Emails and figuring out vehicle JP $195.00 0.42 $81.90 
values 

01/2512021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchanges with Tony Z. and RD $395.00 0.30 $118.50 
Josh P. 

01/2512021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Noami L. re: Metropolitan RD $395.00 0.17 $67.15 
asset sale. 

01/2612021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Paperwork re: second receiver RD $395.00 0.11 $43.45 
loan. 

01/26/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Sign listing agreement. RD $395.00 0.50 $197.50 
Email to broker. 
Email instructions to Josh P. re: pictures and access. 

01/26/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Go through files. locate mail BM $195.00 1.10 $214.50 
forwarding. financial information to store on drive. 
Scan. rename, store, file. 

01/26/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Locate required billing information. BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
Create invoice. 
Prepare invoice re hydro and gas for Densley property. 

01/26/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Making arrangements for CBRE, JP $195.00 1.17 $228.15 
showings and pictures. and rewrite asset list 

01/2612021 Receivership - Court Appointed: working on APA for Metropolitan, NL $295.00 1.81 $533.95 
working with listing agent for Densley, review of related emails 

01/2612021 Receivership- Court Appointed: Call with Josh P. re: timing/logistics RO $395.00 0.53 $209.35 
for showings, pictures for marketing material and fire inspection. 
Call with CBRE re: timing of showings. 

01/26/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Naomi L. re: changes to RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 
the Metropolitan agreement. 

01/26/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review documents retrieved from RD $395.00 1.32 $521.40 
Densley and mail re: document disclosure requirements in Court 
orders. Email to Wendy G. re: document disclosure process. 

01/26/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with building inspector re: roof RO $395.00 0.43 $169.85 
estimate in report. Email update to CBRE. Email exchanges 
between CBRE and DLI and inspector. 

01/26/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Scan documents into our drive. TP $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
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0112712021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Emails to Avery Z. and Frank RD $395.00 0.38 $150.10 
Mendicino re: document disclosures. 

0112712021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Disbursement lo Drew MacMartin BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
re King Road property. 

0112712021 Receivership - Court Appointed: fire inspection and food garbage JP $195.00 4.43 $863.85 
and Service Canada for Corvette and scooter paperwork 

0112712021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review final building inspection RD $395.00 0.44 $173.80 
report with amendments. Email CBRE. 

01/2712021 Receivership - Court Appointed: working on material for listing NL $295.00 0.60 $177.00 
agent. finalizing APA for metropolitan 

01/2712021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review city of toronto notice. RD $395.00 0.09 $35.55 
Review email exchanges between legal and CBRE re: schedule A. 

0112712021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Went to to get pictures of vehicle JP $195.00 0.78 $152.10 
ownerships for Naomi. 

0112712021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review various emails. RD $395.00 0.05 $19.75 

0112712021 Receivership - Court Appointed; Email to Avery Z. re appraisal for RD $395.00 0.06 $23.70 
King. 

0112812021 Receivership - Court Appointed: finalizing APA for purchaser of NL $295.00 0.80 $236.00 
Metro assets. responding to other emails 

01128/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Send Fax to Desjardins. BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
Retrieve confirmation. scan, save to drive. 

01/2812021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Pictures for sale of 76 Densley, JP $195.00 2.54 $495.30 
some garbage, emails. 

01/2812021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Post deposit BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 

01/2812021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Post loan advance and expenses BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
from Hillmount Capital. 

01/2812021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Provide cloud access to document RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 
disclosure folder. 

01/28/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Discussion with Brenda M. RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 

01/2812021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Dealing with City construction and JP $195.00 0.18 $35.10 
emails. 

01/29/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchanges with Equitable RD $395.00 0.16 $63.20 
Bank. 

01/29/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review, sign and send mis data RD $395.00 0.23 $90.85 
listing sheet to CBRE. 

01/29/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Met with City representative to take JP $195.00 1.63 $317.85 
pictures for construction commencing Feb. 8 

01/29/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review of emails re Densley and NL $295.00 0.20 $59.00 
King (re appraisal) 
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01/29/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review legal invoice. Prepare BM $195.00 0.15 $29.25 
cheque requisition. 
Prepare disbursement. Prepare cheque. 

02101/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: discussion re next steps w Josh re NL $295.00 0.52 $153.40 
fire lnspeclion 

02101/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Prepare mailing for Drew BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
MacMartin. 

02101/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Revise invoice, finalize and send to BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
Josh for distribution. 

02102/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Prepare January payment re BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
mortgage, interest and tax. 
Review December and Jan. 5th payments. 

02/02/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: review of queries from lisling agent NL $295.00 0.07 $20.65 

02/03/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Deposit requisition complelion. BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 

02103/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: update w agent re Densley NL $295.00 0.27 $79.65 
property listing 

0210412021 Receivership - Court Appointed: call w Josh and follow up with NL $295.00 0.33 $97.35 
CBRE re listing 

Services Subtotal $20,209.45 

Disbursements 

oaie Doacrlptlon 

09/0412020 Courier: Letters by courier to CIBC and TD Bank. 

01/06/2021 Courier: Courier to F. Zuccaro. 

01/10/2021 Search Charges 

01/10/2021 Locksmith: alarm for Densley storage unit 

01/18/2021 Insurance Paid: Insurance for F Zuccaro. 
Paid by credit card to obtain reinstatement. 

Namo 

Naomi Lieberman 

Josh Pearson 

Rahn Dodlck 

Brenda McKnight 

Talya Psek 

UT, CPA, President 

Para Professional 

Para Professional 

Page 8of9 

Raio Quantity Total 

$21.34 1.00 $21.34 

$25.00 1.00 $25.00 

$47.64 1.00 $47.64 

$145.00 1.00 $145.00 

$729.52 1.00 $729.52 

Expenses Subtotal $968.50 

Houra Hourly Rate Tola I 

18.52 $295.00 $5,463.40 

18.68 $195.00 $3,642.60 

22.26 $395.00 $8,792.70 

11.35 $195.00 $2,213.25 

0.5 $195.00 $97.50 
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Statement of Account Summary: 

Other Invoices 

· 1n1101r;e Number · DueOn Amount Duo· 

10084 04/01/2021 $16,695.63 

Current Invoice 

. Amount Due . . . ;.·· 

10071 02/19/2021 $23,931.08 

Please make all amounts payable to: Dodick Landau Inc. 

Harmonized Sales Tax No.: 847378932 RT 0001 
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Subtotal 

Harmonized Sales Tax (13.0o/o) 

Total 

Payment (02/11/2021) 

Balance Owing 

Payments Roc:olved 

$0.00 

Payment~ Rocel~ed · 

$23,931.08 

Outstanding Balance 

Total Amount Outstanding 

$21,177.95 

$2,753.13 

$23,931.08 

·$23,931.08 

$0.00 

$16,695.63 

•:. · . : .Balance Due 

$0.00 

$16,695.63 

$16,695.63 
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DODlCK 
LANDAU 
Dodlck Landau Inc. 
4646 Dufferin St., Suite 6 
Toronto, ON 
M3H 5$4 
Phone:416-645-0542 
www.dodick.ca 

Invoice # 10072 
Issued Date: 02111/2021 

863704 Ontario Limited, Metropolitan Ice Cream Inc., Oraccuz Holding Ltd. and Frank Zuccaro 
26 Milford Ave 
Toronto, Ontario 
M6M2V8 

Enclosed please find our statement of account for services rendered in our capacity as Proposal Trustee. The 
following is a summary of time by staff member. 

Client Reference Number: MET-111720-AZ 

Date.• DeacrlpUon Name Hourly Houra Total 
Rate 

01/0412021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Set up and print, Proof of Claim BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
and Proxy forms. 
Send to creditor. 

01/0412021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call Paul Lindzon, send email to BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
RD and NL. 

01/0512021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Send out miscellaneous BM $195.00 0.70 $136.50 
Receivership documents re Metropolitan. 

01/0712021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Send package re receivership to BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
2 creditors for Metropolitan. 

01/07/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Send 2 packages to creditors BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
with Receivership documents. Update Ascend. 

01/1212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Phone with Naomi and emails JP $195.00 2.53 $493.35 
booking appointments 
On site meeting with Mark from Ed's real scoop and Rick from 
Sicilian Ice cream 

01/1212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Letter to Agueci Calabrella (For BM $195.00 0.70 $136.50 
TD) re F. Zuccaro. 
Look up CIBC branch. 

01/1312021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Met with Parry of Nani's Gelato. JP $195.00 5.22 $1,017.90 
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Went through hidden skid to find computers and manuals. 
Went through computers to find finance data and recipes. 

01/14/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Show equipment to Cyril of JP $195.00 2.23 $434.85 
Primus and Perry of aquifer 

01/14/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Receive outstanding invoice, BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
send receivership package to G 1 Canada. 

01/15/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Meeting with Al from Soorty's to JP $195.00 1.75 $341.25 
show equipment 
Go back to get machine names for Cyril 

01/19/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review sales process of assets RD $395.00 0.73 $288.35 
in storage. Prepare detailed summary and send to applicant. 
Review various other emails. 

01/1912021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review CRA payroll statement RD $395.00 0.34 $134.30 
and email exchanges Josh P. to look for payroll information in 
records. Email to Mr. Mendicino re: QB password access. 

0111912021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Emails, calls. search for JP $195.00 0.84 $163.80 
accounting and T4, deal with roof 

01/20/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: cash flow lo determine NL $295.00 2.30 $678.50 
Receiver's borrowings 

01/20/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Scan and save Bell Equipment BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
Record for Metropolitan. 
Save to drive. 
Set up file and save in file. 

01/20/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Work on payroll numbers for JP $195.00 1.75 $341.25 
CRA and filling out the form 

01/21/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Scanning computer. fire JP $195.00 1.00 $195.00 
inspection planning and CRA form 

01/2212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: searching for files and dealing JP $195.00 1.22 $237.90 
with emails 

01/2212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Leiter to CRA regarding HST BM $195.00 0.40 $78.00 
re tu ms. 

01/25/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Comparing and updating asset JP $195.00 2.09 $407.55 
list 

02104/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Go through documents marked BM $195.00 0.60 $117.00 
as "unpaid bills". Note each liability in creditors list. 

02104/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Prepare and send out creditors BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
package. 
Add to creditors list. 
Take to mail. 

02104/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Go through mail received, add BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
creditors to creditor list. 

Page 2 of 3 

123



Namo Tlllo 

Naomi Lieberman 

Josh Pearson 

RahnDodick LIT, CPA, President 

Brenda McKnight Para Professional 

Statement of Account Summary: 

Other Invoices 

Invoice Number Due On Amount Due 

10084 04/01/2021 $16,695.63 

Current Invoice 

· lnvolco Number Duo on Amount Duo 

10072 02119/2021 $6,318.96 

Please make all amounts payable to: Dodick Landau Inc. 

Harmonized Sales Tax No.: 847378932 RT 0001 

Page 3 of3 

Houro Hourly Rate 

2.3 $295.00 

18.63 $195.00 

1.07 $395.00 

4.4 $195.00 

Subtotal 

Harmonized Sales Tax (13.0o/o) 

Total 

Payment (02111/2021) 

Balance Owing 

· Paymonls Received 

$0.00 

Payments Rocot:vad 

$6,318.96 

Outstanding Balance 

Total Amount Outstanding 

Total 

$678.50 

$3,632.85 

$422.65 

$858.00 

$5,592.00 

$726.96 

$6,318.96 

·$6,318.96 

$0.00 

81lanceDuo 

$16,695.63 

BalancoDuo 

$0.00 

$16,695.63 

$16,695.63 
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DODlCK 
LANDAU 
Dodlck Landau Inc. 
4646 Oufferin SI., Suite 6 
Toronto, ON 
M3H 5$4 
Phone: 41 s.645-0542 
www.dodick.ca 

Invoice # 10084 
Issued Date: 03/02/2021 

863704 Ontario Limited, Metropolitan Ice Cream Inc •• Oraccuz Holding Ltd. and Frank Zuccaro 
c/o Dodick Landau Inc. 
4646 Dufferin St., Suite 6 
Toronto, ON, M3H 5S4 

Enclosed please find our statement of account for services rendered In our capacity as Receiver. The following is a 
summary of time by staff member. 

Client Reference Number: 863-171120-AZ 

Professional Fees 

Date--. Do~pllon Name Hourly Houra Total 
. .' Rata 

02/06/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review CBRE marketing material RD $395.00 0.16 $63.20 
and weekly report. 

0210812021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchange with CBRE. RO $395.00 0.10 $39.50 

02/08/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Scan two documents for BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
forwarding to Frank Zuccaro. 
Send to F Mendicino. 
File. 

02/0812021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review HST account. File January BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
HST on RT0001 account. 

02/08/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Letter to CRA lo open an RT0002 BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
account. 

02/08/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchanges with Brenda M. RD $395.00 0.03 $11.85 
re: HST. 

02/08/2021 Receivership - Court AJipointed: Research re landlords and HST. BM $195.00 0.40 $78.00 
Speak to third party. Research website. 

02/0812021 Receivership - Court Appointed: discussion w RO re next steps NL $295.00 0.09 $26.55 
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02109/2021 Receivership· Court Appointed: call wilh Purchaser re APA for NL $295.00 0.44 $129.80 
Metropolitan, call w Environmental report preparer 

02/09/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Review S2S message and email RD $395.00 0.13 $51.35 
exchange with CBRE. 

02/1112021 Receivership • Court Appointed: review of emails and King street NL $295.00 0.25 $73.75 
appraisal 

02/1112021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Email update. Send instructions to RD $395.00 0.43 $169.85 
Brenda M. 
Intact Insurance payment issue. 

0211212021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Email exchanges. RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 

02/12/2021 Receivership· Court Appointed: Look up payment information for BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
Equitable Bank. 
Prepare cheque requisition, prepare cheque entry. 
Print cheque. 
Create labels for envelopes for this payment. 

02/1212021 Receivership • Court Appointed: review of emails, discussion re NL $295.00 0.35 $103.25 
Metropolitan, mortgage on Densley 

02112/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Scan Nivi invoice and save to BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
Disclosure Documents. Record as liability In estate of Frank 
Zuccaro. 

0211212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Send Enbridge bill to Larissa at BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
Zeidman Law. 
Send Hydro ONe bill to Frank Mendicino. 
File originals. 

0211212021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Review update from CBRE and RD $395.00 0.30 $118.50 
return questions. Update applicant. Exchange emails. 

02/1212021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Email exchange with equitable RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 
bank. Review and sign cheque for mortgage. 

02/14/2021 Receivership· Court Appointed: Rent deposits. RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 
Review redirected mail. 

0211612021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Research foreign banks. BM $195.00 1.50 $292.50 
Review letters for which a reply was not received. 
Re-print original document to assist with follow up. 

0211612021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Email exchanges with Josh P. re: RD $395.00 0.12 $47.40 
preparation of 2019 T4s. 

02/16/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: call re coordinating farm visit NL $295.00 0.92 $271.40 

02/17/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: follow up re Metropolitan, and NL $295.00 0.36 $106.20 
access to the farm 

02/17/2021 Receivership· Court Appointed: Phone calls and emails with Milena JP $195.00 0.75 $146.25 
and Rahn regarding T4s 

02117/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Emails and phone calls with Naomi JP $195.00 0.25 $48.75 
and Milena RE farm visit 
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02117/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Record disbursement BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 

02117/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Discuss various matters with RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 
Brenda M. 

02/17/2021 Receivership· Court Appointed: Return deposit lo offeror. Instruct RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 
Brenda M. re: letter to tenant re: rent. 

02117/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Discuss Intact insurance invoice BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
with RD. 

02/17/2021 Receivership· Court Appointed: Speak to RD re deposits to be BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
refunded. 

02/17/2021 Receivership· Court Appointed: See RD re banks in Toronto to BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
send letter to. 

02/18/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Email to RD re insurance payment. BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 

0211812021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Searched Densley ror files and met JP $195.00 1.68 $327.60 
with Milena to pass them on and get the key ror the Farm 

02/18/2021 Receivership· Court Appointed: Email exchange with Brenda M. re: RD $395.00 0.03 $11.85 
insurance. 

02/18/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Call the Insurance Broker re Intact BM $195.00 0.40 $78.00 
policy. Discuss payment monthly/in rull. Email to Trustee. 

02/18/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Review sales process documents BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
to determine deposits received. 

02/1812021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review summary of insurance. BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
Send RD insurance summary. 

02/16/2021 Receivership· Court Appointed: Talk to W. Reuger at CRA on BM $195.00 1.10 $214.50 
telephone re group of companies, returns required, etc. re 863704, 
Metropolitan, Orracuz, Frank Zuccaro. 
Send W. Reuger email with court order and request to open 
RT0002 account. 
Send email to RD re books and records. 

02/18/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Call with Brenda M. re: CRA RD $395.00 0.13 $51.35 
matters. 

0211812021 Receivership· Court Appointed: Email response to Josh P. RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 

02/18/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Review CRA accounts. Send in BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
email to all. 

02/18/2021 Receivership· Court Appointed: Receive payment confirmation re BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
insurance. Scan and save to drive. 

02/18/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Record deposil from requisition. BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 

02/18/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Record deposit from requisition. BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 

02/19/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Drive up to farm for appraisal. Had JP $195.00 4.37 $852.15 
to wait as appraiser was late 

02119/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Review information on drive for BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
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real property. Send RD email re King ST tenant contact information. 

02119/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review email re: prep of T4's. RD $395.00 0.09 $35.55 
Review email update from CBRE. 

02121/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Dropped off key and picked up T4s JP $195.00 1.00 $195.00 
from Milena 

0212212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Drop off T4s with Rahn and drop JP $195.00 1.00 $195.00 
paperwork at Densley 

02122/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Josh P. Approve rent RD $395.00 0.62 $244.90 
deposit. 
Review Russo statement of claim and related email string. Email 
Wendy G. with instructions. Review T4's prepared for 2019 and 
provide instructions to Brenda M. 

0212212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Letter to tenant at King residence BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
requiring cheques for rent. 

0212212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Letter to Italian Credit Union re BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
accounts and/or deposits on hand. 

0212212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Scan insurance documents from BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
Intact Insurance. 
Send scan to F. Mendicino as per RD. 

0212212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Record two invoices from Waste BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
Management for Metropolitan. Save to disclosure documents. 
Record two invoices for Frank Zuccaro. Scan. 
Save to disclosure documents. 

02122/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: call w Josh NL $295.00 0.08 $23.60 

0212212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Scan documents, update list of BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
creditors. 
Save to drive. 

0212212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Naomi L. re: various RD $395.00 0.24 $94.80 
matters. 

0212212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: discussion re o/s items NL $295.00 0.08 $23.60 

0212312021 Receivership - Court Appointed: update re Metropolitan sale NL $295.00 0.11 $32.45 

02123/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Respond to email from CBRE. RD $395.00 0.08 $31.60 

02123/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Look up relevant information. BM $195.00 0.60 $117.00 
Prepare RC342 forms for CRA re corporate returns exemption. 

0212312021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Look up relevant information. BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
Prepare RC342 forms for CRA re corporate returns exemption. 

0212312021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review letter from legal counsel RD S395.00 0.07 $27.65 
and responding letter from Baker. 

02123/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Re-send letters to those who have BM $195.00 0.70 $136.50 
not replied. 
Re-print, request response, scan, save. 
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02124/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Dealing with roof leaks at Densley JP $195.00 2.50 $487.50 

02124/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Josh P. re: roof repair. RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 

02124/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchanges with Josh P. RD $395.00 0.29 $114.55 
Email to Andrea Pember re: roof leak. 
Email exchange with Wendy G. 

02124/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Talk to RD re direction and letters .. BM $195.00 0.60 $117.00 
Revise and send letter by email to Italian Credit Union. Scan and 
save to drive. 
Letter to Tenant, finalize letter and prepare for delivery. 

02124/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Discuss tax implications with RD. BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
Receive instructions. 

02124/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Discuss with Brenda M. RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 
preparation of tax returns. 

0212412021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchange with Josh re: RD $395.00 0.11 $43.45 
delivery of letter to King. 

0212512021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Discuss roof repair with Josh P. RD $395.00 0.13 $51.35 
Review and sign 2019 T 4 summary and provide instructions to 
Brenda M. 
Review correspondence re: Russo claim. 

02125/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Receive Metropolitan T4's for BM $195.00 0.60 $117.00 
2019. 
Prepare for mailing. Send summary to RD for signature. Speak to 
W.Rueger at CRA. 
Scan, save to drive. 

02125/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: coordinating return of refunds re NL $295.00 0.13 $38.35 
Metro sales process 

02125/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Send NL email re sales process. BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
Receive response. Review documents re sales process. Prepare 
deposit requisitions and cheque requisitions. 

02/25/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Enter deposit from requisition. BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 

02126/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Meet roofer at Densley and drop JP $195.00 1.74 $339.30 
off papers at King basement 

02126/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Set up tax file. Assemble all BM $195.00 0.80 $156.00 
documents as possible. 

02/26/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Set up tax file. Assemble all BM $195.00 0.80 $156.00 
documents as possible. 

02/26/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call wilh Naomi L. RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 

02126/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Continue assembling information BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
for income tax returns. 

02126/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Scan and save two tax slips for F. BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
Zuccaro. Send to Mr. Mendicino. 
Redact SIN field and save copies to drive. 
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02/26/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Send property lax bill to Larissa at BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
Zeidman law re Saint Francis Ave property. 

02126/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: discussion w purchaser re . NL $295.00 0.29 $85.55 
transaction for Metropolitan and deadline extension request 

02/26/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review invoice from WSIB, note BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
already included in creditors list for Metropolitan. File. 

03/01/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review redirected mail. RD $395.00 0.05 $19.75 

03/01/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: discussion re sale of Densley NL $295.00 0.51 $150.45 

03/01/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Discuss sale of Densley. RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 

03/01/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email response to Frank Z. RD $395.00 0.14 $55.30 

03/01/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchange re: fire safety RD $395.00 0.04 $15.80 
review for Densley. 

03/01/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchange with CBRE. RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 

03/0212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review offers and email CBRE. RD $395.00 0.47 $185.65 
Discuss with Naomi L. 

03/02/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: review of offer matrix, call with NL $295.00 0.16 $47.20 
agent 

03/02/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Receive information from Agueci & BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
Calabretta as requested re TD Bank. Review. Save to drive. Send 
to RD. 

03/02/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: meeting w potential purchaser, call NL $295.00 2.22 $654.90 
w agents re sale of Densley, first round outcome 

03/02/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Meeting with prospective RD $395.00 1.10 $434.50 
purchaser of metro assets. 

03102/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with CBRE to review offers. RD $395.00 0.80 $316.00 

03/0212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email to legal counsel re: Densley RD $395.00 0.40 $158.00 
offers and Metropolitan asset sale. 

03/0212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review correspondence from TD RD $395.00 0.23 $90.85 
and provide instructions to Brenda M. 

03/02/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Record additional creditors thought BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
to be owing funds by Metropolitan. Add 7 creditors. 

03/0212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review detailed offers received for RD $395.00 1.30 $513.50 
Densley. 

Services Subtotal $10,894.15 

Disbursements 

Data oos,crlptlon Rate auanllty Tola I 

02/1112021 Insurance Paid: 863 Insurance paid by CC to avoid cancelalion of $729.52 1.00 $729.52 
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policy 

02/1212021 Automotive Repairs and Maintenance: cost for ownerships and $76.00 1.00 $76.00 
vehicle packages for corvette and vespa 

02117/2021 Bank Fees: wire fee re: return funds to offerer $17.50 1.00 $17.50 

02118/2021 Insurance Paid: Payment for insurance to end of policy for intact $3,048.12 1.00 $3,048.12 
insurance policy #744555339 
Paid by credit card 

0212412021 Postage: Send out reminder letters, 
5 x 1.92 plus HST 

Namo TIUo 

Naomi Lieberman 

Josh Pearson 

Rahn Dodick LIT, CPA, President 

Brenda McKnight Para Professional 

Statement of Account Summary: 

Current Invoice 

Invoice Number - Duo On Amount Duo 

10084 04/01/2021 $16,695.63 

Please make all amounts payable to: Dodick Landau Inc. 

Harmonized Sales Tax No.: 847378932 RT 0001 
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$9.60 1.00 $9.60 

Expenses Subtotal $3,880.74 

Hours Hourly Rllto Total 

5.99 

13.29 

9.19 

14.9 

$295.00 $1,767.05 

$195.00 $2,591.55 

$395.00 $3,630.05 

$195.00 $2,905.50 

Subtotal 

Harmonized Sales Tax (13.0o/o) 

Total 

Payments Rec~lvod 

$0.00 

Outstanding Balance 

Total Amount Outstanding 

$14,774.89 

$1,920.74 

$16,695.63 

BalancoDue 

$16,695.63 

$16,695.63 

$16,695.63 
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Remittance Advice 

Checklni !nfon,Mo~n _ ·· . ,, . - . ···'. 

Send Cheques to: Oodlck Landa Inc. 
4646 Dufferin St., Suite 6 
Toronto, ON, M3H 584 

Attention: Ms. Brenda McKnight (brenda.mcknight@dodick.ca) 

Wlro Transfer Information 

Bank Name/Address: Beneficiary Bank: 

Intermediary Bank: 

Bank ASA/Routing #: 026 009 593 

Name/Account #: Beneficiary Name: 
Beneficiary Account: 
Beneficiary Transit: 
Bank Code: 

SWIFT: TDOMCATTTOR 

TD Canada Trust 
2300 Steeles Ave W, Suite 200, Vaughan, Ontario, Canada 

Bank or America, New York, NY (U.S. Wires) 

Dodick Landau Inc. 
5272423 
14822 
004 

Please include the invoice number 10084 as an additional reference so we may accurately identify and apply your 
payment. 

Please provide adequate payment to cover the wire fees assessed by your financial institution. 
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DODlCK 
LANDAU 
Dodick Landau Inc. 
4646 Dufferln St., Suite 6 
Toronto, ON 
M3H5S4 
Phone: 416-645-0542 
www.dodick.ca 

Invoice# 10096 
Issued Date: 04/05/2021 

863704 Ontario Limited, Metropolitan Ice Cream Inc •• Oraccuz Holding Ltd. and Frank Zuccaro 
clo Dodick Landau Inc. 
4646 Dufferln St., Suite 6 
Toronto, ON, M3H 5S4 

Enclosed please find our statement of account for services rendered in our capacity as Receiver. The following is a 
summary of time by staff member. 

Client Reference Number: 863-171120-AZ 

Professional Fees 

.Dato Doac~iption • · 

03103/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: follow up re Metropolitan sale 
transaction 

Namo Hourtv Hours Total 
Rate 

NL $295.00 0.49 $144.55 

03/03/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Record disbursement. BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 

03/03/2021 Receivership· Court Appointed: Call with Naomi L. re: RD $395.00 0.33 $130.35 
correspondence with purchaser. Email exchange with Wendy G. 
Call with Wendy G. 

03/0312021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Record 407 invoice and note in BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
disclosure documents. 

03/03/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Receive mail from Hagerty BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
Insurance. Determine if payable. 

0310312021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Prepare cheque/deposit BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
requisitions. Record entries in re sales process and 
reimbursements. 

03/0312021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Naomi L. re: sale of RD $395.00 0.45 $177.75 
Densley and equipment. 
Email to CBRE re: Court hearing process. 
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03/04/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchange with CBRE and RD $395.00 0.18 $71.10 
review their sales process data. 

03/04/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Prepare for mailing, refund to C3 BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
Crescent Commercial Corp. 

03/04/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Prepare cheque for property BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
taxes, 
Send email to Avery and Larissa. 
Prepare mailing. 

03/0412021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Prepare cheque req and cheque BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
for Haggerty Insurance. 
Prepare mailing documents. 

03/04/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchanges with Josh P. RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 
and Andrea P. 

03/0412021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Collection of March 2021 rent. RD $395.00 0.28 $110.60 

03/05/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Respond to CBRE's questions RD $395.00 0.15 $59.25 
posed by prospective offeror. 

03/05/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Calls and email exchanges to/ RD $395.00 3.95 $1,560.25 
with Frank P. and CBRE team. 
Review offers received and call with CBRE. 
Email to legal counsel, review comments and send to CBRE. 
Review updated offer matrix. 
Review final APS and sign. 

03/05/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Download and try to open QB file BM $195.00 3.10 $604.50 
for accounting of Metropolitan. No PW. 
Review Agueci Calabretta correspondence. Create spreadsheet 
from correspondence re 2020 accounting. 
Look for additional information re 2019. 

03/05/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: look for information for 863704 BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
corporate taxes. 
Make notes re income and expenses. 

03/0512021 Receivership - Court Appointed: discussion re outcome of sales NL $295.00 1.01 $297.95 
process 

03/08/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchanges with third party RD $395.00 0.79 $312.05 
claimant. Instructions to Josh P. to transfer ownerships of vehicles 
lo Dll. Call with transferee and Josh P. 

03/08/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Emails and calls RE: Corvette, JP $195.00 0.34 $66.30 
food and roof with Rahn. (Rocco) 

03/08/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Visit Densley to get paperwork JP $195.00 3.20 $624.00 
for vehicles and go to Service Ontario to try to register them to 
Dll and follow up phone calls 

03/0812021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review and sign documents re: RD $395.00 0.28 $110.60 
sale of Densley. Email exchange with Allison G. 

03/0812021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review Zuccaro affidavit re: RO $395.00 0.14 $55.30 
Russo motion to lift stay. 
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03/09/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: call re personal property on the NL $295.00 0.19 $56.05 
premises 

03/09/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Prepare cheque req & cheque for BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
Viking Fire Protection Inc. 

03110/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Posting, BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
Rental income from Mauro Ritacca 
Rental income from District Ventures 

03/1012021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Discuss with Brenda Equitable RO $395.00 0.03 $11.85 
cheques. 

03/10/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Review and approve RD $395.00 0.06 $23.70 
disbursements. 

03/10/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Discuss with Brend M. tax RD $395.00 0.16 $63.20 
returns which need to be prepared. 

03/10/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: See RO re cheque Viking Fire, BM $195.00 0.40 $78.00 
Hagerty and City of Vaughan. Prepare all cheque for mailing. 

03/10/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: See RD re Agueci & Calabretta BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
letter. 
Get signature. Send via fax. 

03/10/2021 Receivership· Court Appointed: Talk to RD re cheques to BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
Equitable Bank. 

03/10/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Discuss income tax issues and BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
documents available for 863407 and Metropolitan. 

03/11/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Receive Proof of Claim re BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
Joseph and Vito Zuccaro. 
Send additional proof of claim form to lawyer Lluc Cerda. 
Request additional information re Proof of Claims filed. 

03/11/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Prepare two cheques for Densley BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
mortgage payment. Prepare labels for malling. 

03/11/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: responding to emails NL $295.00 0.24 $70.80 

03/1212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Brenda M. re: Equitable RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 
Bank. 
Call with Rocco 0. re: transfer of vehicle back to Receivership. 

03/1212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Sale of Densley • email RD $395.00 0.09 $35.55 
exchanges with legal counsel and CBRE. 

03/12/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchange with Wendy G. RD $395.00 0.22 $86.90 
re: court approval of sale of Densley. 

03/12/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Scan Acknowledgement & BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
Direction. 
Locate file on drive. 
Save. File. 

03/12/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Scan signed Receivers BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
Certificate. 
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Save to drive. 

03/12/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Scan documents, save to drive. BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 

03/15/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchanges with legal RD $395.00 0.38 $150.10 
counsel re: timing of attending in Court. 

03115/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Updale Hillmount re: sale of RD $395.00 0.18 $71.10 
Densley property. 

03/1512021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review NOA re: court hearing. RD $395.00 0.62 $244.90 
Email to Wendy G. with questions. Review appraisal of property. 

03/15/2021 Receivership· Court Appointed: Review BMO Gateway online for RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 
tax documents. 

03/16/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Review emails between counsel RD $395.00 0.22 $86.90 
re: consent to approval and vesting order. 

0311612021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchanges with legal RD $395.00 0.12 $47.40 
counsel and CBRE. 

03/1712021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Post-dated cheque - prepare BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
deposit requisition. 
Post to account.. 

03/17/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review and sign mortgage RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 
payments. 

03/17/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: next steps re closing of sale of NL $295.00 0.26 $76.70 
building and metropolitan assets 

0311712021 Receivership· Court Appointed: Discuss stale of sale of Densley RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 
and Metro assets with Naomi L. 

03/18/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email to Frank M. RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 

03/19/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Review email from Avery Z. and RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 
changes made to NOA. Respond to Wendy G. Call with Tony Z. 

03/2212021 Receivership· Court Appointed: Receive Proof of Claim forms. BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
Print claims and statement of claims. 
Assemble. 
Add Schedule A requirements to 
Proof of Claim for Metropolitan, print and assemble. 

03/2312021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Prepare cheque requisition. BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
Prepare disbursement 
Prepare labels and mailing documents. 

03/2312021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Call with Dave Oswald. RD $395.00 0.35 $138.25 
Search for cottage property tax informalion and email response to 
Milena Zuccaro. 
Review email from Wendy G. 

03/23/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Various email exchanges with RO $395.00 0.33 $130.35 
Brenda M. re: payment of property taxes, letter to RBC requesting 
information on accounl and review files on drive. 

0312312021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Look up previous payments to BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
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City of Vaughan. 
Prepare cheque requisition. Prepare cheque, print, assemble with 
backup documents. 

03/2312021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Review claims submitted by Luc BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
Cerda. 
Try to understand/calculate two Schedule As. Send email 
regarding requirements for Schedule A. Hold in follow up. 

03/2312021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Prepare letter to Bell Canada BM $195.00 0.40 $78.00 
requesting additional information on the accounts. 

03/23/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Prepare letter to RBC re F. BM $195.00 0.70 $136.50 
Zuccaro accounts. 
Call RBC, on hold, to obtain branch manager name and fax 
number. 
Finalize letter. 

03123/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review email exchanges. RD $395.00 0.06 $23.70 

03/23/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Prepare cheque requisition. BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
Prepare cheque for Hydro One re King. 

03124/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: See RD re signature on 3 BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
cheques. 

03/24/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: See RD re letler Bell Canada BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
and letter re RBC. 

03/25/2021 Receivership· Court Appointed: Prepare mail/labels, etc. for City BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
of Vaughan; 
Maple Roofing, copy and attach invoice; Hydro One; 

03125/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: review of email from Avery NL $295.00 0.06 $17.70 

03/25/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Attend at post office to authorize RD $395.00 0.70 $276.50 
redirection of mail from new address. 

03/2512021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Email response to Avery Z. re: RD $395.00 0.15 $59.25 
assets in the Receiver's possession. 

03/25/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Email to Naomi L. re: report to RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 
Court. 

0312512021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Scan letter to RBC re GIC & BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
Bank account re F Zuccaro. Prepare to send by mail. Scan and 
save to drive. Print for fax. 

03/26/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Receive legal bill. Complete BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
cheque requisition, prepare cheque. 

03/26/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Review email from Avery Z. RD $395.00 0.39 $154.05 
Email lo Wendy G. with comments. 

03/2612021 Receivership • Court Appointed: email re Receivership NL $295.00 1.47 $433.65 

03/26/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Forward info re: purchase RD $395.00 0.27 $106.65 
assignee to CBRE. Set up call with legal. Call with Naomi L. 

03/2612021 Receivership· Court Appointed: Correspondence with Toronto BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
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Hydro by email. 

03/26/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Correspondence with Toronto BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
Hydro. Scan, save to drive. 

03/26/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Wendy G. and Naomi L. RD $395.00 0.94 $371.30 
re: various legal matters regarding receivership, including steps to 
take possession of King property. 

03/26/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Respond to Brenda M. query re: RD $395.00 0.06 $23.70 
cheque to Frank Z. 

03/26/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Investigate transit number re BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
cheque cashed at BMO. Plus, check responses from BMO, 
determine no accounts in name of Zuccaro & parties. 

03/26/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Prepare letter to BMO, prepare BM $195.00 0.70 $136.50 
attachments re cheque cashed at branch. 

03/29/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Go through all banks that BM $195.00 1.20 $234.00 
received notice, make spreadsheet. 
Review all responses. 
Nole all responses on spreadsheets. 

03/29/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Review and sign back change of RD $395.00 0.15 $59.25 
name document. 

03/29/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review schedule prepared by RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 
Brenda M. and send to Wendy G. with explanation for response to 
AveryZ. 

03/29/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Send notice of appointment to F BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
Mendicino. 

Scan, send, file. 

03/30/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Detailed email lo Wendy G. re: RD $395.00 0.80 $316.00 
what the Receiver has done to date for letter and upcoming Court 
motion. 

03/30/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email to Rocco D. re: transfer of RD $395.00 0.28 $110.60 
vehicles. 

03/30/2021 Receivership- Court Appointed: Review file for tax returns and BM $195.00 1.40 $273.00 
HST filings, RT0001 and RT0002 accounts. Prepare HST returns 
for both accounts. Set up accounts on spreadsheet. 

03/30/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review file for tax returns and BM $195.00 0.90 $175.50 
HST filings, RT0001 and RT0002 accounts. Prepare HST returns 
for both accounts. Set up accounts on spreadsheet. 

03/30/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review CRA letter. File BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
2019-12-01 to 2019-12-31 HST return. Update spreadsheet. 

03/30/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: drafting email to Purchaser re NL $295.00 0.20 $59.00 
Metro and responding to email from Avery 

03/30/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with CBRE re: liming of RD $395.00 0.14 $55.30 
closing of sale of Densley. 
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03/31/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: drarting letter to Purchaser 

03/31/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Naomi L. re: sale of 
Metropolitan assets. 

NL $295.00 1.37 $404. 15 

RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 

03/31/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review, amend and issue letter RD $395.00 0.52 $205.40 
to Al Soorty. 

03131/2021 Receivership- Court Appointed: Log expense re mail redirection. BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 

03/31/2021 Receivership· Court Appointed: Review with Brenda M. missing RD $395.00 0.35 $138.25 
financial and tax returns. Review server. Provide instructions to 
Brenda M. 

03/3112021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review documents on drive for BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
Equitable Bank - send email to M. Akinlade re 2019 Mortgage 
Statement. 

04/01/2021 Receivership ·Court Appointed: Prepare cheque for Maple BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
Roofing. 

04/01/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: review of emails, draft letter to 
Avery 

04/01/2021 Receivership- Court Appointed: Review and provide comments 
on the draft letter to Avery z. from Wendy G. 

Review redirected mail and provide Brenda with instructions. 

Discuss with Naomi L. 

04/01/2021 Receivership· Court Appointed: Look up T4 mailing date. 
Send email to Milena re dates etc. sent to CRA. 

04/0112021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review Mortgage Annual 
Statements. 
Update mock financial statements to start gathering information 
for filing. 

Disbursements 

Dato : . : : DoacrlP,tlon 

03/1712021 Mileage: Drive up north to meet appraiser. (410 km x 50 cents) 

03127/2021 Food 

03/31/2021 Mail Redirection: 2 mail redirections, 
$264.75, $170.55 plus HST. 

NL $295.00 0.74 $218.30 

RD $395.00 1.51 $596.45 

BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 

BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 

Services Subtotal $12,687.00 

Rate Quantity Total·-· 

$205.00 1.00 $205.00 

$37.84 1.00 $37.84 

$435.30 1.00 $435.30 

Expenses Subtotal $678.14 

Namo Tiiie Hours Hourly Raio Total 

Naomi Lieberman 6.03 $295.00 $1,778.85 
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Josh Pearson 

Rahn Dodick LIT, CPA, President 

Brenda McKnight Para Professional 

Statement of Account Summary: 

Current Invoice 

lnvolco Number 

10096 

Due on 

04/0912021 

Amount Due 

$15,102.61 

Please make all amounls payable to: Dodick Landau Inc. 

Harmonized Sales Tax No.: 847378932 RT 0001 

Page 8 of9 

3.54 $195.00 

17.13 $395.00 

17.7 $195.00 

Subtotal 

Harmonized Sales Tax (13.0o/o) 

Total 

Payment• Received 

$0.00 

Outstanding Balance 

Total Amount Outstanding 

$690.30 

$6,766.35 

$3,451.50 

$13,365.14 

$1,737.47 

$15,102.61 

Balonco Duil 

$15,102.61 

$15,102.61 

$15,102.61 
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Remittance Advice 
, < '• • I· 

· Ch8j:ltlng ~fonn1tlon .. 

Send Cheques to: Oodick Landa Inc. 
4646 Dufferin St., Suite 6 
Toronto, ON, M3H 554 

Attention: Ms. Brenda McKnight (brenda.mcknight@dodick.ca) 

Bank Name/Address: Beneficiary Bank: 

Intermediary Bank: 

Bank ASA/Routing #: 026 009 593 

Name/Account #: Beneficiary Name: 
Beneficiary Account: 
Beneficiary Transit: 
Bank Code: 

SWIFT: TDOMCATTTOR 

TO Canada Trust 
2300 Steeles Ave W. Suite 200, Vaughan, Ontario, Canada 

Bank of America, New York, NY (U.S. Wires) 

Dodick Landau Inc. 
5272423 
14822 
004 

Please include the invoice number 10096 as an additional reference so we may accurately identify and apply your 
payment. 

Please provide adequate payment to cover the wire fees assessed by your financial institution. 
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DODlCK 
LANDAU 
Dodlck Landau Inc. 
4646 Dufferin St •• Suite 6 
Toronto, ON 
M3H 5S4 
Phone:41s.64S.0542 
www.dodick.ca 

Invoice # 10111 
Issued Date: 05106/2021 

863704 Ontario Limited, Metropolitan Ice Cream Inc., Oraccuz Holding Ltd. and Frank Zuccaro 
c/o Dodlck Landau Inc. 
4646 Dufferin St., Suite 6 
Toronto, ON 
M3H 2L8 

Enclosed please find our slatement of account for services rendered in our capacity as Receiver. The following is a 
summary of time by staff member. 

Client Reference Number: 863-171120-AZ 

Professional Fees 

Dalo Des.crlptlon Na mo Hourly Houra Total 
Raio 

10/28/2020 Receivership - Court Appointed: Searches (bankruplcy, PPSA BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
and Corporate) for Metro Ice Cream, 863704 Ontario Ltd .• 
Oraccuz Holdings. 

04/05/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with CBRE RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 

04/05/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review email from Avery Z. RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 
Email comments to Wendy G. 

04/06/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: metropolitan next sleps NL $295.00 0.36 $106.20 

04/06/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Naomi L. to discuss RD $395.00 0.40 $158.00 
metro assets and contents of report to court. 

Call with Wendy G. about having a call with Avery Z. 

04/06/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: APril rent RD $395.00 0.22 $86.90 

04/07/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchanges Wendy G. re: RD $395.00 0.46 $181.70 
call with applicant, transfer of vehicles and sale or metro assets. 

04/0712021 Receivership - Court Appointed: review of emails NL $295.00 0.31 $91.45 
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04/0712021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Naomi L. re: accepting RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 
Danbury offer. 

04/07/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Prepare deposit, BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
District Ventures, Mauro Ritacca. 
Prepare disbursement DLI, 
prepare mailing labels for upcoming cheques to be sent. 

04/0712021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Frank Zuccaro - prepare BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
deposit entries. 

04/07/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Issue 2 cheques, both for utility BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
payments. 
Prepare for mail. 

04/07/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email to Avery Z. re: BMO RD $395.00 0.07 $27.65 
cheque. 

04/07/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review Sun Life RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 
correspondence and discuss with Brenda M. 

04/08/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: discussion re Metropolitan's NL $295.00 0.60 $177.00 
assets 

04/08/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Naomi L. re: sale of RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 
metro assets. 

04/0812021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review letter received from BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
Ford. 
Scan, save in Disclosure Documents. 
File original. 

04/0812021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchange with Josh P. re: RD $395.00 0.16 $63.20 
transfer of the vehicles. 

04/09/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Scan documenls. Update BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
creditors list. 
Save to disclosure documents. 

04/0912021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review documents. BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
Call Sun Life contact. Leave voicemail. 

04/09/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: For Oraccuz Holdings Ltd. - BM $195.00 1.40 $273.00 
Prepare 3 corporate zero returns to bring current. 
Prepare certification. 

04/09/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchange with tenant RD $395.00 0.25 $98.75 
Review of farm property appraisal. 

04/12/2021 Receivership - Court Appoinled: Compose email to Sun Life BM $195.00 0.80 $156.00 
requesting independent party response lo requesl for 
information on policy. 

04/1212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: review of updated auction NL $295.00 18.67 $5.507.65 
proposal 

04/12/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Phone with Rocco, Rahn, JP $195.00 3.50 $682.50 
Naomi RE Car 
Meet Danbury al Densley and then Rahn in his office 
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04/12/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Discuss with Naomi L. and Josh RD $395.00 0.30 $116.50 
P. plan for liquidation of contents at Densley. 

Email to Al S. re: Metro assets. 

Email to Wendy G. re: court date. 

04/1212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Meeting with Josh P. RD $395.00 0.80 $316.00 
Call with Jon 0. 
Email to Wendy G. 

04/1312021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Meet Danbury at ~ensley to get JP $195.00 3.30 $643.50 
to work on auction 

04/13/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call and emails with CBRE. RD $395.00 0.35 $136.25 
Voice messages to Wendy G. Review email exchanges between 
Wendy G. and purchaser's legal counsel. 

04/13/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review redirected mail. Provide RD $395.00 0.22 $86.90 
instructions to Brenda M. 

04/14/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Josh P. Email RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 
exchanges with Josh P. 

04/14/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: prepare paperwork for Rocco JP $195.00 0.80 $156.00 
and Meet with him to transfer ownership on vehicles 

04/14/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: go in to Densley to check on JP $195.00 1.11 $216.45 
Danbury. 

04/1412021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Wendy G. RD $395.00 0.23 $90.65 

04/1412021 Receivership • Court Appointed: locate contact information by BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
telephone, call BMO re Frank Zuccaro cheque cashed. 

04/14/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call RBC, much time on hold, BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
for request of March 24/31, 2021. 
Get through to customer service who is sending an email to 
Dufferin Branch. 

04/1412021 Receivership - Court Appointed: call with Avery re various file NL $295.00 1.34 $395.30 
issues 

04/14/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Discuss cancellation notice BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
from Hagerty. 
Determine vehicle this relates lo. 
Receive instruction. 

04/14/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Track Enbridge and Hydro One BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
account. 
Show useage on chart. 

04/14/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Avery Z. to provide RD $395.00 1.10 $434.50 
update on receivership and clarifications with regards to the 
receiverships next steps. 

04/15/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Scan summary of Hydro One & BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
Enbridge bills. 
Send in email to RD. 
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04/15/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email to Avery z. RD $395.00 0.34 $134.30 
Email to Wendy G. 

04115/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call wilh Apex. Email Apex RD $395.00 0.69 $272.55 
instructions and exchange emails. 

04/15/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Scan and send 3 invoices to F. BM $195.00 0.70 $136.50 
Mendicino. 
Scan and save 3 invoices to Disclosure Documents. Check file 
to determine if creditor listed, set up one new account. Locate 
landlord name for Metropolitan, send utility bill to that location. 

04/16/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review documents received in RD $395.00 0.30 $118.50 
the redirected mail. Provide instructions to Brenda M. 

04/19/2021 Receivership • Court Appointed: Email to valuator. RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 

04/19/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Prepare letter to Datamax re BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
land lease and future payments. 

04/19/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchange with Jon O. RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 
and Josh P. 

04/19/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review previous court orders. RD $395.00 0.30 $118.50 

04/19/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email to Wendy G. re: RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 
obligations of the Receiver. 

04/19/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: discussion re next steps on NL $295.00 0.13 $38.35 
valuations and report to court 

04/19/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Letter to BMO re Frank Zuccaro BM $195.00 0.50 $97.50 
and Metropolitan Mastercard. Attach documents. 

04/19/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchange with Wendy G. RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 

04/20/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Update call with Josh P. RD $395.00 0.15 $59.25 

04/20/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Copy and scan various letters BM $195.00 0.80 $156.00 
for follow up. 
Contact RBC Collections re lack of response, 3 branches. 
Request assistance. 

04/20/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Scan required documents, sent BM $195.00 0.40 $78.00 
letter, documents, reminder letter to Techcom. 

04/20/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Scan required documents, sent BM $195.00 0.40 $78.00 
letter, documents, reminder letter to Canaccede. 

04/2112021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Complete deposit requisition. BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 

04/21/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: next steps re Court approval of NL $295.00 0.15 $44.25 
sale of Densley 

04/21/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchange with Wendy G. RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 

04/21/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Record advertising receipt re BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
Frank Zuccaro. 

04/21/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Discuss various matters with RD $395.00 0.30 $118.50 
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Brenda M. Review redirected mail. 

04/21/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Discuss letters re 863704, BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
receive signatures on letters. 

04/21/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Discuss Hagerty Insurance. BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
Report telephone conversation. Policy not cancelled. Must be 
transferred by April 2022. 

04/21/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Reverse cheque re property BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
tax, City of Vaughan. 

04/2212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with CBV re: valuation RD $395.00 0.17 $67.15 
work. 

04/2212021 Proposal - Division 1: Approve rent deposit. RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 

04/2212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review redirected mail. Email RD $395.00 0.50 $197.50 
Apex. 

04/2212021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Scan two letters, one to BMO, BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
one to Datamax Advertising, save copies to drive. Prepare 
mailing labels, prepare for mail. 

04/2212021 Receivership- Court Appointed: For Oraccuz Holdings Ltd. - BM $195.00 0.30 $58.50 
scan 3 years of prepared income tax returns. Save to drive. 
Prepare for mailing. 

04/22/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review Sun life documents. BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
Scan, save to drive. 
Review Sun Life website. 

04/23/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: drafting report to court NL $295.00 0.46 $135.70 

04/23/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Send 2 Invoices to Frank BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
Mendicino. 
Record in disclosure documents. 

04/23/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Josh P. RD $395.00 0.26 $102.70 
Email update to CBRE. 

04/23/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Naomi L. RD $395.00 0.19 $75.05 

04/23/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review letter to Court and RD $395.00 0.08 $31.60 
forward lo Naomi L. for report. 

04/26/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: drafting report to court, NL $295.00 2.16 $637.20 
finalizing appraisal 

04/26/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call wilh Naomi L. re: RD $395.00 0.12 $47.40 
appraisals. 

04/26/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchanges with Josh P. RD $395.00 0.10 $39.50 
Give Josh P. instructions. 

04/26/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Set up spreadsheet lo gather BM $195.00 1.20 $234.00 
information for Frank Zuccaro and 3 companies. All for business 
valuation. 
Start review of all documents. 
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04/26/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchanges with Josh P. RD $395.00 0.30 $118.50 
Review redirected mail. 
Call with Naomi L. 

04/27/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Meet Rocco to sign papers for JP $195.00 1.86 $362.70 
Corvette and scooter and drop papers off at Danbury 

04/27/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: drafting report to court NL $295.00 0.01 $2.95 

04127/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Attend at Densley. Meeting with RD $395.00 1.40 $553.00 
Josh P. re: contents and auction. 
Subsequent calls with Josh P. 

04/2712021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchanges with Brenda RD $395.00 0.18 $71.10 
M. re: RBC. 

04/27/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review invoice, prepare cheque BM $195.00 0.40 $78.00 
requisition, prepare cheque re Garfinkle Biderman LLP payment. 

04127/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review email from RD. BM $195.00 0.40 $78.00 
Send email to RBC ouUining requirements of Court order, 
requesting various documents together with account funds. 

0412712021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Work on inventory fisting for all BM $195.00 1.30 $253.50 
companies. 

04/27/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: draft report, King appraisal NL $295.00 3.16 $932.20 

04128/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Prepare deposit requisition. BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 

04/28/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Call with Naomi L. re: report to RD $395.00 0.42 $165.90 
Court. 
Review appraisals of King and Clearwater properties and email 
Noamil. 

04/28/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review redirected mail with RD $395.00 0.20 $79.00 
Brenda M including RBC claim. 

04/28/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Discuss mail redirections re BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
Frank Zuccaro. 

0412912021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review appraisals and provide RD $395.00 1.20 $474.00 
to Avery Z. with explanations. 
Sign back the Confidentiality and Non disclosure agreement. 
Provide written update to Avery Z. 

0412912021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review Equitable mortgage RD $395.00 0.44 $173.80 
documents. 
Answer Equitable's questions. 
Provide docuemnts to legal counsel. 

04/2912021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Prepare cheque for Garfinkle BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
Biderman LLP for mailing. 

04129/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Send invoice to F. Mendicino re BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
F. Zuccaro. 
Add RBC secured amount to 863 and F. Zuccaro list of 
creditors.r 
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04129/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Send additional invoices to F. BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
Mendicino. 
Scan several bills, send. 
File. 

04/30/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review email from RBC BM $195.00 0.10 $19.50 
Collections. 
Place in follow up file. 

04/30/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchanges with Al RD $395.00 0.40 $158.00 
Soorty. 

05/0312021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review documents and RD $395.00 0.38 $150.10 
respond lo Avery Z. 

Email to Wendy G. re: court hearing. 

05/0312021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Update information Inventory BM $195.00 0.80 $156.00 
listing. 

05/0312021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review occupancy reports for RD $395.00 0.14 $55.30 
King St. 
Email to Wendy G. 

05/03/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Go through inventory of BM $195.00 1.30 $253.50 
information on file. 
Revise listing. 
Prepare authorization for each of 4 files included in receivership. 
Print documents to be sent with the authorization requests. 

05/04/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Send Receiver certiricate RD $395.00 0.13 $51.35 
borrowing info lo legal counsel. 

05/04/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review and provide comments RD $395.00 1.27 $501.65 
on the Receiver's Court application. Email exchanges with 
WendyG. 

05/04/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: drafting report to court on sale NL $295.00 1.05 $309.75 
of Densley 

05/05/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Contact valuators. Review RD $395.00 0.39 $154.05 
valuator credentials. 

05/05/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Post deposit from HST. BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
Update spreadsheet. 

05/05/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review form of order and RD $395.00 0.23 $90.85 
provide comments to Wendy G. 

05/05/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Review new Desjardins BM $195.00 0.20 $39.00 
accounl. 
Refer to previous correspondence from Desjardins. 

05/0512021 Receivership - Court Appointed: report court re Densley sale NL $295.00 0.88 $259.60 

05/05/2021 Receivership - Court Appointed: Email exchanges with Wendy RD $395.00 0.40 $158.00 
G. re: court application. Email instructions to Brenda M. and 
Naomil. 
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Services Subtotal $20,864.55 

Disbursements 

Dale Deecrlptlon Raia Quantity Total 

04/28/2021 Postage: Oraccuz Holdings Inc. - postage for tax returns submitted. 

0412812021 Postage: Postage, two notices re Metropolitan 

$4.36 1.00 $4.36 

$6.22 1.00 $6.22 
2 x 3.11 plus hst 

Tltlo 

Naomi Lieberman 

Josh Pearson 

Rahn Dodick 

Brenda McKnight 

LIT, CPA, President 

Para Professional 

Statement of Account Summary: 

Current Invoice 

Invoice Numtiar Due On' Amount Due 

10111 05/14/2021 $23,588.90 

Please make all amounts payable to: Dodick Landau Inc. 

Harmonized Sales Tax No.: 847378932 RT 0001 
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Expenses Subtotal 

Hours Hourly Raia 

29.28 $295.00 

10.57 $195.00 

17.64 $395.00 

16.4 $195.00 

Subtotal 

Harmonized Sales Tax (13.0%) 

Total 

Paymitnta Rocolved 

$0.00 

Outstanding Balance 

Total Amount Outstanding 

$10.58 

Total 

$8,637.60 

$2,061.15 

$6,967.80 

$3,198.00 

$20,875.13 

$2,713.77 

$23,588.90 

Elalance Due 

$23,588.90 

$23,588.90 

$23,588.90 
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Remittance Advice 

Chacldng l,~formallon 

Send Cheques to: Dodick Landa Inc. 
4646 Dufferin St., Suite 6 
Toronto, ON, M3H 5S4 

Attention: Ms. Brenda McKnight (brenda.mcknight@dodick.ca) 

Wire Tn1ns'or ln.!on!'atlon 

Bank Name/Address: Beneficiary Bank: 

Intermediary Bank: 

Bank ABA/Routlng #: 026 009 593 

Name/Account#: Beneficiary Name: 
Beneficiary Account: 
Beneficiary Transit: 
Bank Code: 

SWIFT: TDOMCATTTOR 

TD Canada Trust 
2300 Steeles Ave W, Suite 200, Vaughan. Ontario, Canada 

Bank of America. New York, NY (U.S. Wires) 

Dodick Landau Inc. 
5272423 
14822 
004 

Please include the invoice number 10111 as an additional reference so we may accurately identify and apply your 
payment. 

Please provide adequate payment to cover the wire fees assessed by your financial institution. 
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BETWEEN: 

Court File No. CV-21-00661928 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

DODICK LANDAU INC. 

and 

Applicant 

FRANK ZUCCARO, 863704 ONTARIO LIMITED, METROPOLITAN ICE CREAM INC. 
AND ORACCUZ HOLDING LTD. 

Respondents 

APPLICATION UNDER SUBSECTION 249 and 250(1) OF THE BANKRUPTCY AND 
INSOLVENCY ACT, R.S.C. 1985, c. B-3, AS AMENDED AND RULES 14.05(2) AND 

(3)(g) AND 41 ()F THE RULES OF CIVIL PROCEDURE, R.R.O. 1990 

AFFIDAVIT OF ALEXANDER HORA 
(SWORN MAY 18, 2021) 

I, Alexander Hora, of the City of Toronto, in the Province of Ontario, MAKE OATH 

AND SAY: 

I. I am an associate in the law finn of Garfinkle Biderman LLP ( .. Garfinkle") counsel for 

Dodick Landau Inc., in its capacity as Court-appointed Receiver (the ••Receiver") of the 

Respondents in these proceedings (the .. Receivership Proceedings"). As such have knowledge 

of the matters to which I hereinafter depose, except where stated to be on information and belief, 

and where so stated, I verily believe to be true. 

2. This Affidavit is made in connection with the Receiver's motion for, inter alia, the 

approval of the fees and disbursements of Garfinkle Biderman for the period from November 

153



-2-

17, 2020 through April 26, 2021 (the "Period"). Attached hereto and marked as Exhibit "A" 

are the accounts with dockets attached thereto for the Period, in the total amount of $35, 7 42.11. 

3. The accounts attached as Exhibit "A" provide a fair and accurate description of the 

activities undertaken by Garfinkle Biderman. The hourly rates and time expended by the 

professionals at Garfinkle Biderman are provided for on the summary pages of each account. 

Wendy Greenspoon-Soer, the professional who acted for the Receiver during the fee approval 

Period was called to the bar in 1993. 

4. To the best of my knowledge the rates charged by Garfinkle in the course of these 

Receivership Proceedings are comparable to the rates charged by other law firms in the Toronto 

market for the provision of similar services. I believe the total hours, fees and disbursements 

incurred by Garfinkle on this matter are reasonable and appropriate in the circumstances. 

5. This Affidavit is sworn in support of a motion, inter alia, approvmg Garfinkle 

Biderman's fees and disbursements incurred in respect of the Receivership Proceedings for the 

Period. Garfinkle Biderman requests that the Court approve its accounts for that Period for fees 

in the amount of $30,895.00, disbursements of $736.10 and taxes of $4, I 11.0 I for a total of 

$35, 742. I I for services rendered and recorded. 

SWORN BEFORE ME at the City of 
Toronto, in the Province,.of~tario on 

May I~ ,2021~ ..... ~ 

ALEXANDER HORA 
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THIS IS EXHIBIT .. A .. TO THE 

AFFIDAVIT OF 

ALEXANDER HORA, 
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DODICK LANDAU INC. 
4646 Duft'erin Street 
Suite 6 
Toronto, Ontario, M3H 584 

Attention: Ralm Dodick 

In Account With 

Out File 1 12574-001 

December 16, 2020 

RE: RECEIVERSHIP OF ZUCCARO PROPERTIES 

TO 0 UR FEE for all services rendered as per the attached print-out: 

OUR FEE HEREIN: 

H.S.T. x 13% 

DISBURSEMENTS: 

As per attached print-out 

H.S.T. x 13% 

Total Fees 
Total Disbursements 
Total H.S.T. 
Total Fees, Disbursements, H.S.T.: 

This is our Account Herein 

Garfinkle I Bldarman LLP 
Dynamic Funds Towor, Suite 801. 1 Adelaide Stroot East. TOlonto, ON MSC 2V9 

Tel I 416.869.1234 
Fax! 416.869.0547 www.garflnklo.com 

HST I R119425791 1.3 

$8,880.00 

$1,154.40 

$736.10 

$94.65 

$8,880.00 
$736.10 

$1,249.05 
$10,865.15 

Pursuant to tho Solic:itors Act. interest at 1110 rate of '!(, wiU be dlargod on ovorduo accounts 
Wllon romlnina p/011:111 sncloH Ille dupticaco copy of th/11 aecounr. 
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Garfinkle, Biderman LLP 
Date: Dec 16, 202i> Hilling Inrormntion Summnrv to Dec 16/20 rcgues1ed by WHG 

Bill#: 

Client 
12574 DODICK LANDAU INC. 

4646 DUFFERIN STREET 
SUITE6 
TORONTO ON MJH SS4 
Client Lawyer: W.H. Orccnspoon 

Email: rahn.dodick@dodick.ca 

TIME SUMMARY 
Bill Bill 

~ .!:imm ~ 

13 W.H. Orccnspoon 14.80 8880.00 
Tolal 1mbillcd lime 14.80 8880.00. 

HSTon 8,880.00 @ 13% 1,154.40 

Tolal unbilled lime 81. laxes 10034.40 

UNBILLED DISBURSEMENTS 
~ Dc.<;crintion 

2 Courier Owgc 
I 8 Trans. Levy Surcharge:. Taxable 
26 Tcrancl Searches ·Taxable 
SO Government F«S ·No Tax 
54 Scarchcs/PPSA/Filing fees-Taxable 
78 Postage/Email Charges 
84 Tcraview Registrations - Taxable 

To1al unbilled disbursements 

HSTon 728.10@ 13% 
Tolal disbursements end taxes 

Total Taxes 
HST 

Total to Biii 

Transaction Lev)' Surcharge Posted : 100.00 

BILLING HISTORY 

Last bill: 
Fees to date: 
Time billed: 
Variance: 

Disbsbilled: 

.00 
~ 

.00 

.00 

QUOTED AMOUNTS 

Fees quoted: .00 

December 16. 2020 9:35 am 

Average 
Ra1e 

File , Dale opened: November 18, 2020 
12574001 RECEIVERSHIP OF ZUCCARO PROPERTIES 

{120 Litigation· Levy) ! 

TAXABLE • Ontario ! 
Responsible: W.H. Orccnspoon 
Assigned: W.H. Orecnspoon 

Last En1crcd Entered 
Enta l:ISW!l Vnluc 

: 
Billing Instructions 

600.00 Dec 14120 14.80 8880.00 File: 12574001 Bill La\vyi:r: 13 WHG 

14.80 8880.00. 

Bi11Di11e: Bill No: 

Bill UP. to Dec 16 2020 

&nru!!ll Final Periodic Interim Wrircorr 

S2.36 T 
[j 0 0 0 

100.00 T 
ISS.2S T BillAinount s/D. <"it5. I~ 

8.00 "' 14.49 T Oisbuiscmcnts Bnled s 
25.00 T 

381.00 T 
Including Unpos1cd s 

736.10 Photocopies s . 
94.65 Telephone s 

830.7S 
01hcr s 

Fee Dilled s 
1,249.0S 

Oisbs .1axable Tax on Disbs S 
10,865.IS 

Taic on Fees s 
TotalTox s _ .. 

La\vy~r FccCrcdi1 s 
Lawyer FccCrcdil s 
La\vycr Fee Credit s 
l.;nvycr Fee Credit s 
Panncrship Fee Credit s 

--~--- ·--·-
Trunsfer rrom Trust 
10 paY, 11ccoun1 s 

Write Orr 
Unbilled Disbwscments s 
Unbilled lime s 
AcCounlS Receivable s 

c1osc;Fnc 0 
Account Approval 

Sonia Quiambao 
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Oct 16,2020 
Garfinkle, Biderman LLP 

Date: Billing Statement to Dec 16/20 requested bv WHG Page: 

Bill#: 

Clienl File , Dale opened: November 18, 2020 
12574 OODICK LANDAU INC. 12574001 RECEIVERSHIP OF ZUCCARO PROPERTIES 

4646 DUFFERIN STREET ( 120 Liligation • Levy) 
SUITE6 TAXABLE • On1ario 
TORONTO ON MJH 5S4 Responsible: W.H. Grecnspoon 
Client Lawyer: W.H. On:cnspoon Assigned: W.H. Grecnspoon 

Emnll: rahn.dodick@dodiclc.ca 
UNBILLED TIME Bill 

Bill Bill Enlcn:d Entcn:d Running 
~ ~ LmM! Hours ~ Hmm ~ &!i!il Total 
Nov 17/20 E-Mail and call from and to Rahn 13WHG 2.00 1,200.00 2.00 1,200.00 226178 1,200.00 
Nov 17n0 Miscellaneous: Consultation witb Rahn and review of 13WHG 1.00 600.00 1.00 600.00 226181 1,800.00 

Court documents and draft Orders 
Nov 17120 Miscellaneous emails with Rahn re: Receivers borrowings I 13WHG .so 300.00 .50 300.00 226182 2,100.00 

Consul I 
Nov 17120 E-Mail from Rnhn I Appoi111mcnt Order I call rrom and lo IJWHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 226183 2,160.00 

re: rcglslration 
Nov 18120 Telephone Call From Rahn 13 WHO .70 420.00 .70 420.00 224026 2,580.00 
Nov 18120 E·Mail Rohn re: certificate 13WHO .10 60.00 .10 60.00 224027 2,640.00 
Nov 18120 E-Mail from Rahn· partels 13WHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 224028 2,700.00 
Nov 18120 E-Mail from Rahm IJWl-10 .10 60.00 .10 60.00 224034 2,760.00 
Nov 18120 Prcpnrc registration documents and email Ralin 13 WHO 1.00 600.00 1.00 600.00 22'1042 3,360.00 
Nov 18120 Miscellaneous: Register Court orders (xl) IJWHO .30 180.00 .30 180.00 224043 3,540.00 
Nov 18120 Telephone Call To Rohn IJWHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 224045 3,600.00 
Nov 18/20 Lener To Rahn 111d Avery • send registrations 13\VHO .20 120.00 .20 120.00 224047 J,720.00 
Nov 18120 Miscellaneous: Review tcm1 sheet I Call Rahn and cm1til IJWHO .60 360.00 .60 360.00 2240SI 4,080.00 

Yitz 
Nov 18120 E-M11il from and 10 Yi1z 13WHO .10 60.00 .10 60.00 224053 4,140.00 
Nov 18120 Miscellaneous cnmils with Rahn re: financing 13\VHO .10 60.00 .10 60.00 2240S6 4,200.00 
Nov 18120 E-Mail from and 10 Yitz IJWHO .JO 60.00 .10 60.00 2240S7 4,260.00 
Nov 19120 Miscellaneous: Review revised Term Sheet 13 WHO .10 60.00 .10 60.CO 225017 4,320.00 
Nov 19120 Telephone Call From Rahn I Misc. emails I Call and email 13 \VHG .50 300.00 .so 300.00 225026 4,620.00 

to Mendccino 
Nov 19120 Telephone Call From Fmnk I Call Rahn 13 WHG .20 120.00 .20 120.00 225028 4,740.00 
Nov 19120 Miscellaneous emails re: finol Tern Sheet 13\VHQ .10 60.00 .10 60.00 225041 4,800.00 
Nov 19120 E-Mail rrom and lo Yitz I Search parcels lJWHO .30 180.00 .30 180.00 225047 4,980.00 
Nov 19120 E-Mail to Yitz 13\VHG .JO 60.00 .10 60.00 225048 S,040.00 
Nov 19/20 E-Mail from and to Rlllm 13WHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 225052 S,100.00 
Nov23120 E-Mail from Fried I Review revised postponement 13 WHG .20 120.00 .20 120.00 227037 S,220.00 
Nov23/20 E-Mail 10 Avery I Send Pos1poncmen1 documents 13\YHO .20 120.00 .20 120.00 227038 S,340.00 

Nov23/20 E-Mail from Rahn re: Metro Assets 13WHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 227039 5,400.00 

Nov:P/20 Miscellaneous re-notice n:gts. / Review Statute 13\YHO .30 180.00 .30 180.00 227073 S,580.00 
Nov24/20 E-Mail from Avery lJWHO .10 60.00 .10 60.00 228021 S,640.00 
Nov24/20 E-Mail front Avery re: postponements 13WHG .JO 60.00 .10 60.00 228025 S,700.00 
Nov24/20 E-Mail from Rahn 13WHG ,JO 60.00 .10 60.00 228032 S,760.00 
Nov24/20 Prepare Draft lencr 10 Mendocino re; books and records 13WHG .20 120.00 .20 120.00 228033 5,880.00 
Nov24/20 Leiter From Avery I Reglsier Postponements I Email Fried IJWHO .so 300.00 .so JOO.CO 228040 6,180.00 

Nov24/20 E-Mail rrom and 10 Rahn 13WHO .10 60.00 .10 60.00 228050 6,240.00 

Nov24/20 E-Mail from and lo Fried I Oireclion re: funds I Revise lJWHO .20 120.00 .20 120.00 228055 6,360.00 

Nov24/20 E·Mail rrom Rahn/ /To Mendccino 13WHO .10 60.00 .10 60.00 228063 6.420.00 

Nov24/20 E·Mail rrom Rahn re: runds dircclion IJWHG .10 60.00 .JO 60.00 228064 6,480.00 

Nov2S/20 E·Mail from Fried re; advance IJWHG .10 60.00 .JO 60.00 229188 6,540.00 

Nov2S/20 Telephone Call From Rahn 13WHG .so JOO.DO .so 300.00 229193 6,840.00 
Nov2S/20 E-Mail from Rahn/ Review orders I Email 10 Rahn 13WHG .60 360.00 .60 360.00 229205 7,200.00 

Nov27/20 E·Mail rrom Rahn 10 Avery 13WHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 2311S4 7,260.00 

Nov30120 E-Mail from and 10 Rahn / Revise email 10 Avery 13WHO 20 120.00 .20 120.00 232009 7,380.00 
NovJ0/20 E-Mail from Rahn IJWHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 232018 7,440.00 

Nov30/20 Telephone C11ll 10 Mcndccino 13WHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 232019 7,S00.00 
Nov30/20 E-Mail from Avery IJWHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 232024 7,S60.00 
DccOl/20 Miscclhmcous emails • Rohn and Avery re: assets 13WHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 234004 7,620.00 
DccOl/20 E-Mail Mendicino 13WHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 234009 7,680.00 

DccOl/20 Miscellaneous emnlls with Frank and Rahn IJWHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 234022 7,740.00 

December 16. 2020 9:JS am Sonia Quiambao 
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Garfinkle, Biderman LLP 
Date: Dec 16, 2020 Billing Statement to Dec 16120 reguested bv WHG 

Bill#: 

Client File : Daie opened: November 18, 2020 
12574 DODICK LANDAU INC. 

4646 DUFFERIN STREET 
SUITE6 

12574001 RECEIVERSHIP OF ZUCCARO PROPERTIES 
{120 Litigation - Levy)• 

TORONTO ON M3H SS4 
Client Lawyer: W.H. Orccnspoon 

Em11il: rahn.dodick@dodick.ca 
UNBILLED TIME 

.cs ~ 
Dcc02120 Miscellaneous emails I Rahn and Avery 
Dcc02120 Conference Call With Rahn and Frank 
Dcc02120 E-Mail from Rahn and Frank re: call 
Dcc02120 E-Mail rtom Avery 
Dec 02120 Miscellaneous emails -Avery and Rllhn re: mortgages 
Dce02120 Mlsccl111ncous emails from Rahn re: Zuccaro and Densley 

TAXABLE - On111rio 
Responsible: W.H. Oreenspoon 
Assigned: W.H. Orccnspoon 

Bill Bill 
~ tmm Value 
lJWHG .10 60.00 
13WHG .40 240.00 
l3WHG .10 60.00 
13WHG .10 60.00 
13WHO .10 60.00 
13WHG .10 60.00 

Dcc03/20 Miscellaneous emails: Rahn and Mcndcclno re: metro assets 13WHO .10 60.00 
Dcc03/20 Telephone Call From Rahn 13WHG .10 60.00 
Dcc04/20 Miscellaneous emails from Mcndecino 13WHO .10 60.00 
Dcc07/20 E-Mail rrom !Wm 13WHG .10 60.00 
Dcc08120 Miscellaneous searches I Email Rahn 13WHG .10 60.00 
DecOS/20 Miscellaneous emails 10 Rahn re trademark SC31Chcs 13WHG .10 60.00 
Occ08/20 Miscel111DCous emails from Ralm and Frank 13WHQ .10 60.00 
Dec 10/20 E-Mail from Rllhn 13WHG .10 60.00 
Dec 14120 E-Mail form Zeidman 13WHG .10 60.00 
Dec 14120 E-Mail from Rahn 13\VHG .10 60.00 

Total unbilled time 14.80 8,880.00 

HST on 8,880.00 @ 13% 1,154.40 

Totlll unbilled Time & Taxes 10,034.40 

TIME SUMMARY 

Bill Bill Entered 
~ Houm Bnl!1ll:il: ~ J:!rum 
W.H. Grccnspoon 14.80 @600.00 .. 8,880.00 14.80 

UNBILLED DISBURSEMENTS 

Oatj; QI lmma1i11n1Pavcc &em! Am!ll!!!l~ L\rutl! 

NovlS/20 18 Trans. Levy Surchar:e-Taxoblc 182004 100.00 13 WHO L182004 
Nov 19120 26 Tcranec Searches - TIUCllblc 244006 30.45 5244006 

Tcravicw 
Nov 19/20 78 Postage/Email Charges 244004 25.00 S244004 
Nov 19120 84 Teravicw Registrations - Ta."<ublc 244002 228.60 5244002 

E-Reg 
Nov20/20 26 Tcranel Searches - TOJ(ablc 245004 124.80 S24S004 

Tera view 
Nov25/20 2 Courier Charge 248030 52.36 5248030 

B· 11/24 Fr S6S Edgeley Blvd 
Nov2S/20 84 Tcravicw Rcgisltations - Taxable 248001 152.40 5248001 

E-Reg 
DccOS/20 SO Government Fees - No Tax 31107 8.00 A31107 

Cybcrbahn - inll200911336657 
OecOS/20 S4 SearchcslPPSA/Filing fces-Taxuble 31.107 14.49 A31107 

Cybcrbahn - inll20091133G6S7 

:Enleml Entered 
Hours Value 

.10 60.00 

.40 240.00 

.10 60.00 

.10 60.00 

.10 60.00 

.JO 60.00 

.IO 60.00 

.10 60.00 

.10 60.00 

.10 60.00 

.10 60.00 

.10 60.00 

.10 60.00 

.10 60.00 

.10 60.00 

.10 60.00 

14.80 8,880.00 

Enlcrcd 
~ 

8,880.00 

Audit 
234167 
234175 
234176 
234177 
235158 
23Sl6S 
236036 
2360SI 
237192 
238110 
239030 
239038 
239041 
241037 
243031 
243033 

Last 
.ED1D! 
Dec IS 2020 

Page: 

Bill 
Running 

Is!W 
7,800.00 
8,040.00 
8,100.00 
8,160.00 
8,220.00 
8,280.00 
8,340.00 
8,400.00 
8,460.00 
8,520.00 
8,580.00 
8,640.00 
8,700.00 
8,760.00 
8,820.00 
8,880.00 

December 16. 2020 9:35 am Sonia Quiambao 
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Date: Dec .• 6, 2oio 

Billll: 

Olcnt 
12574 DODICK LANDAU INC. 

4646 DUFFERJN STREET 
SUITE6 
TORONTOON M3H SS4 
Client La'vyer: W.1-1. Grccnspoon 

Email: rahn.dodlck@dodick.ca 

Total unbilled Disbursements 

HSTon 728.10 @ 13% 
Total unbilled disbursements & taxes 

December 16. 2020 9:35 am 

Garfinkle, Biderman LLP 
Billing Statement to Dec 16120 requested bv WH~ Page: 

File Date opened: November 18, 2020 
12574001 RECEIVERSHIP OF ZUCCARO PROPERTIES 

(120 Litigation - Levy) 
TAXABLE • Ontario 

Responsible: W.H. Grccnspoon 
Assigned: W.H. Grccnspoon 

736.10 

94.65 
830.75 

Sonia Quiambao 

3 
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· l,EI Garfinkle I Biderman :J BARRISTERS & SOLICITORS 

DODICK LANDAU INC. 
4646 Dufferin Street 
Suite 6 
Toronto, Ontario, M3H 584 

Attentio11: Ralm Dodick 

In Account With 

OurFile# 12574-001 

January 28, 2021 

RE: RECEIVERSHIP OF ZUCCARO PROPERTIES 

TO OUR FEE for all services rendered as per the attached print-out: 

OUR FEE HEREIN: 

H.S.T.x 13% 

DISBURSEMENTS: 

As per attached p~nt-out 

H.S.T.x 13% 

Total Fees 
Total Disbursements 
Total H.S.T. 
Total Fees, Disbursements, H.S.T.: 

This is our Account Herein 

Gerfinklo I Bldennan U.P 
Dynamic Fund$ Tower. Suile 801. 1 Adelaide Siu1et Enl. Torofllo. ON MSC 2V9 

Tel I 416.869.1234 
Fax I 416.869.0547 www.gorfinkle.com 

HST# R119425791 

$8,640.00 

$1,123.20 

$Nil 

$Nil 

$8,640.00 
$Nil 

$1,123.20 
$9,763.20 

8 
Pursuant 10 the So5citor5 Acl. in1erost at Ille ra1e of % wi11 be ch#rocd on overdue accounts 
Wiim remitting p/oas1111ndoH 1h11 duplicliro copy of t/U$ ac:count. 
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Date: Jid1 28, 2021 

smn: 

Client 
12574 DODICK LANDAU INC. 

4646 DUFFERIN STREET 
SUITE6 
TORONTO ON MJH SS4 
Client Lawyer: W.H. Grccnspoon 

Emllil: ralm.dodiek@dodiek.ea 

TIME SUMMARY 
Bill 

Hours 

Garfinkle, Biderman LLP 
Billing lnformallon Summary lo Jan 28121 rcgusstcd bv WHG 

Bill AVClllgc 
~ ~ 

File Date opened: November 18, 2020 
12574001 RECEIVERSHIP OF ZUCCARO PROPERTIES 

(120 Litigation • Levy) 
TAXABLE • Ontario 

Responsible: W.H. Grccnspoon 
Assigned: W.H. Orccnspoon 

Last Entered 
HDl!X !:!m!!1 

Entered 
Value 

Billing Instructions 

13 W.H. Grccnspoon 
Total unbilled time 

14.40 8640.00 600.00 Jan 27121 14.40 8640.00 File: 12574001 Bill lawyer: 13 WHG 
14.40 8640.00 • 

HST on 8,640.00 @ 13% 

Total unbilled time & taxes 

Total Taxes 
HST 

Total to Bill 

ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE 

Total Accounts Receivable 

1,123.20 

9763.20 

Tronsaclion Levy Surcharge Posted : I 00.00 

BILLING HISTORY 

Last bill: Dec 16/20 
Fees to date: 
Time billed: 
Variance: 

Disbs billed: 

8,880.00 
9480.00 

600.00-

736.10 

QUOl'ED AMOUNTS 

Fees quoted: .OD 

Janumv 28. 2021 10:48 am 

14.40 8640.00 • 

1,123.20 

9,763.20 

.00 

I 

Bill Date: Bill No: 

BiU Up IO Jan 28 2021 

Final Periodic Interim Write Off 

D D D D 

Bill Arnow11 s 
Disbursements Billed s 

Including Unposted s 
Photocopies s 
Telephone s 
Other s 

Fee Billed s 
Disbs taxable Tax co Disbs S 

Tax on Fees s 
Total Tex s 

---· 
Lawyer Fee Credit s 
L11\vyer Fee Credit s 
Lawyer Fee Credit $ 

Lawyer Fee Credit s 
Partnership Fee Credit s 

--
Tronsfer from Trust 
to poy account s 

Write Orr 
Unbilled Disbursements s 
Unbilled Time s 
Accounts Receivable s 

Close File D 
Account Approval 

Sonia Quiambao 
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Garfinkle, Biderman LLP 
Date: JB1128, 2021 Dilling Slatement ro Jan 28121 reguesled bv WHC Page: 

Bill#: 

Client File Dnte opened: November 18, 2020 
12S74 DODICK LANDAU INC. 12574001 RECEJVERSHIP OF ZUCCARO PROPERTIES 

4646 DUFFERIN STREET (120 Utlgation ·Levy) 
SUITE6 TAXABLE • On1ario 
TORONTO ON M3H SS4 Responsible: W.H. Grcenspoon 
Client Lawyer: W .H. Gn=cnspoon Assigned: W.H. Orcenspoon 

Email: rahn.dodick@dodick.ca 
UNBILl.F.D TIME Bill 

Bill Dill Entered Entered Running 
QI!!; ~ ~ H11111s .Ym lig,ya .Yllhm Al!lli1 Iillll. 
Dec 16120 E·Mnil from Naomi 13WHO .10 60.00 .10 60.00 245009 60.00 
Dec 16120 E-Mail from Avery I To Rahn 13WHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 245011 120.00 
Dec 16120 E-Mail from Avery lJWHO .10 60.00 .10 60.00 245013 180.00 
Dec 16120 Revise Document: Letter to Mendocino IJWHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 245019 240.00 
Dec 16120 E-Mail Avery 13WHO .10 60.00 .10 60.00 245020 300.00 
Dec 16120 E-Mnil lo and from Ralm re: inspection IJWHG .10 60.00 .JO 60.00 245021 360.00 
Dec 16120 MisccllMcous emails re Metro sale lJWHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 24S02S 420.00 
Dec 17n0 E-Mail to and from Avery IJWHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 246012 480.00 
Dec 17120 Telephone Coll To Rahn 13WHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 246037 S40.00 
Dec 17/20 E-Mail Mcndeeino IJWHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 246039 600.00 
Dec 17120 E-Mail from and to Rahn I Voiccmail from Cerda lJWHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 246040 660.00 
Dec 17/20 E-Mail from Mcndecino I To Rahn 13WHO .10 60.00 .10 60.00 246041 no.oo 
Dec 17120 Telephone Call To Cerda 13\VHO .10 60.00 .10 60.00 246042 780.00 
Dec 17120 E-Mail from Cerda I Review claims I Email Rahn 13WHO .30 180.00 .JO 180.00 246043 960.00 
Dcc21/20 E·Mall rrom Mcndccino I To Rahn 13WHG .10 60.00 .JO 60.00 248175 1,020.00 
0cc21no E-Mail front Naomi I To Frank 13WHG .JO 60.00 .10 60.00 248180 1,080.00 
Dcc22/20 E-Mail from Rahn 13WHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 24903J 1,140.00 
Dcc22120 E-Mail to Cctda 13WHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 249032 1,200.00 
Dcc22120 E-Mail from Rahn to Zuccaro 13 WHO .10 60.00 .JO 60.00 249033 1,260.00 
Dec22120 E-Mail from Rahn 13WHO .10 60.00 .10 60.00 249041 1,320.00 
Dcc24no E-Mail from Naomi I Tony re: Metro assets 13WHO .10 60.00 .10 60.00 251634 1,380.00 
Dcc30/20 E-Mail from Rahn I Review documents re: Densley listing 13WHO .20 120.00 .20 120.00 255013 l,S00.00 
Jan 06121 E-Mail from Avery 13WHO .to 60.00 .10 60.00 3031 l,S60.00 
Jan 06121 E-Mail from Rahn IJWHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 303S 1,620.00 
Jan 07121 E-Mail from Rahn IJWHG .to 60.00 .10 60.00 4039 1,680.00 
Jan 08121 E-Mail from Zcidmnn / Fmm Rahn re: Densley 13 WllO .JO G0.00 .10 60.00 4368 1,740.00 
Jan 08121 E·Mail from Rahn • review Report re; Densley tJ WHO .30 180.00 .30 180.00 4387 J,920.00 
Jan 11/21 Mlsc:cllaneous emails· Rahn 1111d Avery re: Densley 13 WJIO .to 60.00 .10 60.00 SOl4 1,980.00 
Jan 14/21 Miscellaneous emails: Rahn and Avery re: Densley listing 13WHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 8041 2,040.00 
Jan tS/21 E·Mall from Avery re: various issues 13WHO .10 60.00 .to 60.00 8456 2,100.00 
Jan IS/21 Miscellaneous emails Rahn and Avery 13WHO .10 60.00 .10 60.00 8469 2,160.00 
Jan 1812J Telephone Call From Rahn I Review Ct. Orders 13WHO .so 300.00 .so 300.00 9034 2,460.00 
Jan 18121 E-Mail from Rahn 10 Avery 13WHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 9039 2,520.00 
Jan 18121 E-Mail front Mcndccino 13WHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 9057 2,580.00 
Jan 19121 E-Mail from Mendccino I Review bills 13 WHO .10 60.00 .10 60.00 10014 2,640.00 
Jan 19121 Miscell11neous emails between Rahn and Avery t3WHO .10 60.00 .10 60.00 10016 2.700.00 
Jan 19/21 E-Mnil from Rahn I Review listing documents 13WHO .20 120.00 .20 120.00 J0017 2,820.00 
Jan 19/2J Miscellaneous emails between c:ounsel and Receiver re: 13WHG .20 120.00 .20 120.00 10018 2,940.00 

expenses 
Jan 19121 E-Mail from and 10 Rahn n:: Metro sale IJWHG .10 60.00 .JO 60.00 10019 3,000.00 
Jan 19121 E-Mail from Rahn I Rcivew MclfO documcnlS IJWHO .20 120.00 .20 120.00 J0022 3,120.00 
Jan 19121 Miscellaneous emails • Receiver and counsel re: Metro IJWHO .10 60.00 .10 60.00 10053 3,180.00 
Jan J9/21 Mceling: Rcivcw orlisting proposals I Email Rahn 13WHO .30 180.00 .30 180.00 10068 3,360.00 
Jan 20/21 Miscellaneous emails bc1wee11 Rahn and Frank re: assets 13\VHO .10 60.00 .10 60.00 1J026 J,420.00 
Jan 20/21 Miscellaneous emails • Rahn and Zeidman 13WHO .10 60.00 .JO 60.00 11047 l,480.00 
Jan 20121 E-Mail from Rahn re: listing agreement llWHO .10 60.00 .10 60.00 llOS8 3,540.00 
Jan 21121 Misecllnncous emails between counsel re: documcnl;uy J3WHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 J2009 3,600.00 

production 
Jan 21/2J E·Mail rrom Rahn 13WHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 12016 3,660.00 
Jan 21121 Revise Document: Listing Agreement and email Rahn 13WHG .30 180.00 .JO ISO.OD 12017 J,840.00 
Jan 21/21 Meeting: Emails with Rnhn and CBRE JJWHO .JO 60.00 .10 60.00 12022 3,900.00 
Jan 21/21 E-Mail from Naomi I Reivew sale documents 13WHO .JO 60.00 .10 60.00 12042 J,960.00 

Januarv 28. 2021 10:48 am Sonia Ouiambao 
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Garfinkle, Biderman LLP 
Dale: Ja'n 28, 2021 Billing Statement to Jan 28121 requested bv WHG Page: 2 

Bill fl: 

Client File Date opened: November 18, 2020 
12574 DODICK LANDAU INC. 12574001 RECEIVERSHIP OF ZUCCARO PROPERTIES 

4646 DUFFERIN STREET (120 Li1ig111ion - Levy) 
SUITE6 TAXABLE - Onlario 
TORONTO ON M3H SS4 Responsible: W.H. Orccnspoon 
Client Lawyer: W.H. Grccnspoon Assigned: W.H. Orccnspoon 

Email: rahn.dodick@dodick.ca 
UNBILLED TIME . Bill 

Bill Bill Entered Entered Running 
Dale ~ ~ llimr.i Value HOU[!! Valui: All.!l.i.I Il2ll!.!. 
Jan21nl Prepnn: Bill of Sale re: metro 13WHO .60 360.00 .60 360.00 12043 4,320.00 
Jan 22121 Prepare Agreement of Purchac and Sale 13WHG 1.00 600.00 1.00 600.00 13218 4,920.00 
Jan 22121 E-Mail from Rahn re: Draw request 13WHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 13244 4,980.00 
Jan 22121 E·M11il from and to Rahn re: CBRE 13WHG .JO 60.00 .IO 60.00 13246 5,040.00 
Jan22J21 Miscellaneous emails with CBRE and Receiver re: Densley 13WHO .so 300.00 .so 300.00 13248 5,340.00 

listing 
Jan 22121 Revise Document Bill of S.1lc I F.mail clients 13WHO .so 300.00 .so 300.00 13251 S,640.00 
Jan22/21 E-Mail from and to Rahn re: vesting order 13WHO .JO 60.00 .10 60.00 13254 5,700.00 
Jan 22121 Miscellaneous emails with Rahn and Naomi re: sale of 13WHG .so 300.00 .so 300.00 13255 6,000.00 

asscrs 
Jan 25121 E-Mail from and to Rahn 13WHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 14014 6,060.00 
Jan 2S/21 E-Mail from Rahn I Listing Agreement 13 WHO .10 60.00 .10 60.00 14018 6,120.00 
Jan 25121 1..cttcr From Rahn re; King Prom note - girlfriend 13 WHO .10 60.00 .10 60.00 14020 6,180.00 
Jan 2S/21 Miscellaneous emails with Rahn re: revisions and Metro IJWHO .20 120.00 .20 120.00 14029 6,300.00 

APS 
Jan 25121 Miscellaneous emails re: advance 13WHO .10 60.00 .JO 60.00 14037 6,360.00 
Jan 25121 Miscellaneous cm11ils re: Asset Lists lJWHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 14038 6,420.00 
Jan 26121 E-Mail from CBRE I Lisling Agreement IJWHO .10 60.00 .10 60.00 lSOJI 6,480.00 
Jon 26121 Miscellaneous emails re: Densley listing lJWHO .20 120.00 .20 120.00 15021 6,600.00 
Jan 26121 E-Mail from and to Naomi I Revise Agreements 13WHO .so 300.00 .so 300.00 15026 6,900.00 
Jan 26121 Miscclhmcous emails re: accounting records lJWHO .10 60.00 .10 60.00 15027 6,960.00 
Jan26121 Telephone Call From Naomi IJWHO .JO 60.00 .JO 60.00 15028 7,020.00 
Jan 26121 E-Mail from and to Rahn re: document disclosure IJWHO .20 120.00 .20 120.00 1S046 7,140.00 
Jan 26121 Prepare Schedule "A" for Densley 13WHG 1.00 600.00 1.00 600.00 15051 7,740.00 
Jan 26121 E-Mail to agents and Rahn 13WHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 15052 7,800.00 
Jan 27121 E-Mail from and to agent IJWHG .10 60.00 .JO 60.00 16017 7,860.00 
Jan 27121 Miscellaneous emails from Rahn and reallor re: Densley I 13WHG .30 180.00 .JO 180.00 16019 8,040.00 

Revise Schedule A and emails re: Doc. productions 
Jan 27121 E-Mail from and 10 Densley agenis 13WHG .10 60.00 .10 60.00 16021 8,100.00 
Jon 27121 E-Mail front and to Naomi I Revise sale or asset documenlS 13WHO .80 480.00 .80 480.00 16033 8,580.00 
Jan 27121 Reporting File 13WHO .10 60.00 .10 60.00 16050 8,640.00 

Total unbilled time 14.40 8,640.00 14.40 8,640.00 

HST on '8,640.00 @ 13% 1,123.20 

Total unbilled Time&. Taxes 9,763.20 

TIME SUMMARY 

Bill Bill Entered En1crcd Last 

~ .!:!sll!!l! ~ Yl!!.!!£ Hnurs Value ElllIX 
W.H. Orcenspoon 14.40 @600.00 8,640.00 14.40 8,640.00 Jan28 2021 

ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE 

Orig.Bill Billed Billed Dilled Unpaid Unpaid Received From/ 
Bill# lll!ls ~~ Allliwm ~ Toxes .Em Dlshs. ~ Pavrncnts ~ Audi! Descriotlon 

112665 Dec 16120 p 13 10,865.IS 736.10 !,249.0S 8,880.00 .00 .00 .00 6747007 
112665 Dec 22120 R 10,865.15- C284010 Dodick Landuu Inc 

Januarv28. 2021 10:48 am Sonia Quiambao 
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Dale: J11i128, 2021 

Bill#: 

Clicnl 
12S74 OODICK LANDAU INC. 

4646 DUFFERIN STREET 
SUITE6 
TORONTO ON MJH SS4 
Clicnl Lawyer: W.H. Orccnspoon 

Email: rahn.dodick@dodick.ca 
ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE 

Toials 10,865.JS 

Januarv 28. 2021 10:48 am 

Garfinkle, Biderman LLP 
Billing Statement to Jan 28/21 requcs1ed bv WHG Page: 

File Date opened: Novcmb~r 18, 2020 

Billed 
~ 

Billed 
ID§ 

12574001 RECEIVERSHIP OF ZUCCARO PROPERTIES 
(120 U1ig111ion ·Levy) 

TAXABLE • Onlnrio 
Responsible: W.1-1. Orcenspoon 
Assigned: W.H. Grccnspoon 

Billed 
Em 

Unpaid 
Disbs. 

Unpaid 
~ 

736.10 1,249.0S 8,880.00 .DO .00 10,865.IS· .00 

Received From! 
Description 

Sonia Quiambao 

3 
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,,fl Garfinkle I Biderman l:J BARRISTERS & SOLICITORS 

DODICK LANDAU INC. 
4646 Dufferin Street 
Suite 6 
Toronto, Ontario, M3H 5S4 

Atte11tiom Ra/111 Dodick 

In Account With 

Ourfilol# 12574-001 

March 25, 2021 

RE: RECEIVERSHIP OF ZUCCARO PROPERTIES 

TO OUR FEE for all services rendered as per the attached print-out: 

OUR FEE HEREIN: 

H.S.T. x 13% 

DISBURSEMENTS: 

As per attached print-out 

H.S.T. x 13% 

Total Fees 
Total Disbursements 
Total H.S.T. 
Total Fees, Disbursements, H.S.T.: 

This is our Account Herein 

GARFINKLE BIDERMAN LLP 

Garfinkle I BldDrmH LLP 
Dynamic Funds Tower, Suite 801. 1 Adelaide S1reo1 E8st, Toronto. ON M&C 2V9 

Tel 1418.869.1234 
Fax I 416.869.0647 www.garflnkle.com 

$6,437.50 

$836.88 

$Nil 

$Nil 

$6,437.50 
$Nil 

$836.88 
$7,274.38 

HST II R119426791 
Pu1suant to t!lo Solicitors AcL lnt111ost 01 1118 1aie of \ will bo chargod on ove1due accounts 
When remitting plllas11 encroso the duplica111 copy of this acco1111t. 
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Date: Miii' 25, 2021 

Bill#: 

Client 
12S74 DODICK LANDAU INC. 

4646 DUFFERIN STREET 
SUITE6 
TORONTO ON MJH 5S4 
Client Lawyer. W.H. Oreenspoon 

Email: rahn.dodlck@dodi~.ca 

TIME SUMMARY 
Bill 

&ID 

Garfinkle, Biderman LLP 
Dilling Information Summary to Mar 25/21 reque.1tcd by WHG 

Bill Average 
~ Biii!: 

File Dare opcncd: NoYcmber 18, 2020 
12574001 RECEIVERSHIP OF ZUCCARO PROPERTIF.S 

(120 Li1igation - Lc:vy) 
TAXABLE ·Ontario 

Responsible:: W Ji. Grcc:nspoon 
Assigned: W.H. Grccnspcon 

Entered 
Yllhl.t 

Billing Instructions 

13 W.H. Greenspoon 
Total unbfllcd time 

10.30 6437.50 625.00 Mar24/21 10.30 6437.50 File: 12574001 Bill La\llyer: 13 WHG 
10.30 6437.SO • 10.30 6437.50 • 

HST on 6,437.SO @ 13% 

Total unbilled time &. taxes 

Total Taxes 
HST 

Tollll to BUI 

ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE 

Total A~unts Receivable 

836.88 

7274.38 

Transaction Levy Surcharge Poslcd : 100.00 

BILLING HISTORY 

Last bill: Jan 2911.1 
Fees 10 date: 
Tune billed: 
Variance: 

Disbs billed: 

17,520.00 
1824000 

720.00-

736.10 

QUOTED AMOUNTS 

Fees quoted: .00 

March 25. 2021 2:42 Dm 

836.88 

7,174.38 

.00 

Bill Date: Bill No: 

Bill up to Mar 25 2021 

Final Periodic Interim Write OIT 

0 D D 0 

Bill Amount s 
Disbursements Billed s 

Including Unpostcd s 
Photocopies s 
Telephone s 
Other s 

f"CC Billed $ 

Disbs tnxable Tux on Disbs S 

Tax cm Fees s 
Total Tax s 

Lawyer Fee Credit s 
Lawyer Fee Credit $ 

lawyer FccCrcdit s 
Lawyer FccCn:dit $ 

Partnership Fee Credit s 

Transfer from Trust 
to pay DCCOWll s 

Write Off 
Unbilled Disbursements s 
Unbilled Time s 
Accounts Receivable s 

Close File 0 
Account Approval 

Wcndv Grccnsooon 
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Garfinkle, Biderman LLP 
Date: ¥:ir25,2021 Billing Statement to Mar 25/21 reguc..ttd by WIIG Page: 

Bill#: 

aienl File Diiie opeaed: November 18, 2020 
12574 DODICK LANDAU INC. 12574001 RECEIVERSHIP OF ZUCCARO PROPERTIES 

4646 DUFFERIN STREET (120 Litigation - Levy) 
SUITE6 TAXABLE • Ontario 
TORONI'O ON M3H 5S4 Responsible: W.H. Orccnspoon 
Client Lawyer. W.H. Grecnspoon Assigned: W.H. Orcenspoon 

Email: rahn.dodick@clodick.ca 
UNBILLED TIME Bill 

Bill Bill Entered Entered RuMing 
~ ~ I.mm Hmim ~ &11..11 ~ Alllli1 Il2lll 
FcbOS/21 E-Mail fiom Receiver I Listing materials re: Densley 13WHG .20 125.00 .20 125.00 24010 125.00 
Feb 11/21 E-Mail &om Rahn n:: bllllk responses J3WHG .JO 62.SO .10 62.SO 27025 J87.SO 
Feb 12121 E-Mail fonn Rahn /Densley update 13WHO .10 62.50 .10 62.50 30359 250.00 
Feb 19/21 E-Mm1 fiom Rahn re: CBRE update 13WHG .10 62.SO .JO 62.SO 3J065 3J2.50 
Feb22/21 E-Mail fiom Rahn I Review documents re: claim 13WHG .20 125.00 .20 125.00 320JS 431.SO 
Feb 22121 Letter To Baker JJWHG .20 125.00 .20 125.00 32034 562.SO 
Feb 23/2J Telephone Call From Balcer 13WHO .20 125.00 .20 125.00 33025 687.50 
Fcb23/21 E-Mail fiom and lo Rahn 13WHG .JO 62.SO .10 62.50 33035 750.00 
Feb24121 E-Mail fiom and to Rahn 13WHG .JO 62.50 .10 62.50 34018 812.50 
Fcb24/21 Telephone Call From Balcer 13WHG .10 62.50 .10 62.50 34019 815.00 
FeblS/21 Letter From Baker 13WHG .10 62.50 .10 62.SO 3S018 937.SO 
MarOl/21 E-Mml fiom Rahn 13WHG .10 62.50 .10 62.50 37041 1,000.00 
MarOl/21 B-Mail fiom Rahn re: Densley offers 13WHG .10 62.SO .10 62.SO 37052 1,062.50 
Mar02121 E-Mail fiom Rahn I From agents 13WHG .10 62.SO .10 62.50 38097 1,125.00 
Mar02/21 Letter From Baker I Review motion materials 13WHG .20 125.00 .20 125.00 38105 1,250.00 
Mar02/21 E-Mail fiom Rahn re-vesting Order 13WHG .10 62.50 .10 62.SO 38108 1,312.SO 
Mar02/ll B-Mail to Avciy 13WHG .10 62.SO .JO 62.SO 38110 1,375.00 
Mar02/21 E-Mail: Review asset sale doc:umcnts I Email Rahn 13WHG .20 125.00 .20 l2S.OO 38111 l,S00.00 
MarOJ/21 E-Mail &om Avery re: 148 motion IJWHG .10 62.50 .10 62.SO 39013 l,562.SO 
MarOJ/21 Telephone Call From Avery 13WHG .20 125.00 .20 125.00 39014 1,687.SO 
Mar03fll E-Mail fiom Avery rc: 14B procedure IJWHG .10 62.SO .10 62.50 39015 1,750.00 
M11r03/21 Miscclfancous emails fiom and to Rahn re: metro esset sale 13\VHG .20 125.00 .20 125.00 39017 1,875.00 
Mar03/21 E-Mail to Rahn 13WHG .10 62.SO .10 62.50 39022 1,937.SO 
Mar03/21 E-Mllil from Rahn 13WHG .10 62.SO .10 62.50 39025 2,000.00 
Mar03/21 Telephone Call To Rahn 13WHG .20. J25.00 .20 125.00 39026 2,125.00 
Mar03/21 E-Mail liom Avery l3WHG .10 62.SO .10 62.SO 39030 2,187.SO 
Mar05/21 E-Mail flOJD Rcceiva n:: Densley offers 13WHG .10 62.SO .JO 62.SO 41228 2,250.00 
MarOS/21 E-Mail fiom and to Rahn IJWHG .10 62.SO .10 62.SO 41229 2,312.SO 
MarOS/21 E-Mail fiom Rahn rc: multiple Densley offcn I Review 13WHG .30 187.SO .30 187.SO 41231 2,S00.00 
MarOS/21 Misc:dlancous: Review Shama offer I Email Rahn 13WHG .40 250.00 .40 250.00 41232 2,150.00 
Mar05/21 M"isccllancous emails with Rahn and agents IJWHG .20 llS.00 .20 125.00 41235 2,875.00 
MarOS/21 Miscellaneous emails with agents re: Densley ofTCT 13WHG .so 312.SO .so 312.50 41239 3,187.SO 
M11t08/2l E-Mail fiom Rahn re: Densley sale 13WHG .10 62.SO .JO 62.SO 42015 3,250.00 
MarOS/21 E·Mail fiom Avery I Response to 148 13WHG .20 125.00 .20 125.00 42022 3,375.00 
MarOB/21 E-Mm1 fiom Rahn and agent re: deposit 13WHG .10 62.SO .10 62.50 42054 3,437.SO 
Mar 10/21 Prepare MB motion for lcnvc and vcslign order materials l3WHG 1.00 625.00 l.00 625.00 43025 4,062.jO 
Mar 11121 E-Mail fiom and to Jasmi:ct re: closing 13WHG .10 62.SO .10 62.SO 44025 4,125.00 
Mar 11121 E-.'llfall &om and to Jasmect re: dosing 13WHG .10 62.SO .10 62.SO 44026 4,187.50 
Mar 12121 E-Mail From and to Rahn 13WHG .10 62.SO .10 62.50 47166 4,250.00 
Mar 12121 Telephone Call To Jas l3WHG .20 125.00 .20 12S.OO 47167 4,375.00 
MM 12121 Miscellaneous Emails with Rahn re Sale&. Motion 13WHG .20 125.00 .20 125.00 47219 4.S00.00 
Mar 12121 E-Mitl From agent - Conf Agnnt IJWHG .JO 62.SO .10 62.50 47222 4,562.SO 
Mar 12121 E-Mail To Rahn n:: Motion process IJWHG .10 62.50 .10 62.50 47223 4,625.00 
Mar 15/21 E-Mnil liom &: to Rahn l3WHG .10 62.SO .10 62.SO 47163 4,687.SO 
Mar IS/21 Miscellaneous emails with Rahn re Densley sale IJWHG 20 125.00 .20 125.00 47174 4,812.50 
MarlS/21 Prepare confidentiality Agreement I E-mail Rahn 13WHG .so 312.50 .so 312.SO 47230 S,125.00 
Mar lS/21 E-Mail fiom Rahn re NOA I Review Changes I to Rahn IJWHG .20 125.00 .20 125.00 47233 5,250.00 
Mar lS/21 E-Mail lo Mcndecho &: Zeidman 13WHG .20 125.00 .20 125.00 47234 S.31S.00 
Mar lS/21 E-Mail to Rahn re Densley motion IJWHG .10 62.50 .10 62.SO 47235 S,431.50 
Mar 16.121 E-Matl fiom +to Mcrdccinol IO Avery l3WHG .20 125.00 .20 125.00 47116 5,562.50 
Mar 16.121 E-Mail form+ to Zeidman 13WHG .10 62.SO .10 62.SO 47120 S,62S.OO 
Mar 16121 E-Mail from Raba 111 MA l3WHG .10 62.SO .10 62.SO 47121 S,681.SO 

Man:h 25. 2021 2:42 om Wcndv Grccnsooon 
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Garfinkle, Biderman LLP 
Date: ¥P.r·25, 2021 Bi!ljng Statement to Mar 25121 requested by WHG Page: 

Bill#: 

Client 
12574 DODICK LANDAU INC. 

4646 DUFFERIN STREET 
SUITE6 
TORONTO ON MJH SS4 
Client Lawyer: W .H. Grccnspoon 

Email: rahn.doditk@dodick.ca 
UNBILLF.D TIME 

IlillG 
Mar 16121 
Mar 181.21 
Mar 181.21 
Mar 18121 
Mar 18121 
Mar 19fll 
Mar20121 
Mar22/21 
Mar23/21 
Mar23/21 
Mar24121 

~ 
E-Mail fo1m +to Agent 
E-Mail liom Mendecino re removal 
Email to Mcndecino & Avery re NDA 
E-Mail liom Rahn re property 
E·Mail from Avery 
E-Mail liom Zeidman I Review revisions to NOA 
&Mail liom 7..cidman 
E-Mail to Avery and Frank 
E-Mail fiom Rahn re: mail 
E-Mail liom llOd to Avery- NOA 
E-Mail from Avery re: NOA 

Total unbilled time 

File Date opened: November 18, 2020 
12574001 RECEIVERSHIP OF ZUCCARO PROPERTIES 

(120 Litigation· Levy) 
TAXABLE • Ontario 

Responsible: W.H. Orcenspoon 
Assigned: W.H. Greenspoon 

Bill Bill Entered Entered 
1 . ..3.\'!Q'C! liwuJ ~ I:ll!uci YWs Awli1 
13WHG .10 62.50 .IO 62.SO 471SI 
13WHG .10 62.50 .10 62.SO 49047 
13WHG .10 62.SO .10 62.50 49048 
l3WHG .10 62.50 .10 62.50 49049 
13WHG .10 62.SO .10 62.50 49051 
13WHG .20 125.00 .20 125.00 50120 
13WHG .10 62.50 .10 62.SO 50138 
IJWHG .10 62.50 .10 62.50 51042 
13WHG .10 62.SO .10 62.50 52026 
13WHG .10 62.50 .10 62.50 52027 
13WHO .10 62.50 .10 62.50 53016 

10.30 6,431.50 10.30 6,437.50 

Bill 
Ru Ming 

'.Ulllll 
5.150,00 
5,812.50 
S,875.00 
S,937.50 
6,000.00 
6,125.00 
6,187.50 
6,250.00 
6,312.SO 
6,375.00 
6,431.50 

HST on 6,437.SO @ 13% 836.88 

Total unbilled Time & Taxes 7,274.38 

TIME SUMMARY 

Bill Bill Entered Entered Last 
~ ~ ~ ~ li!nul l!nlw; .e.ntix 
W.H. Grccnspoon 10.30 @625.00 = 6,437.SO 10.30 6,437.50 Mar252021 

ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE 

Orig.Bill Billed Billed Billed Unpaid Unpaid Received Froni/ 

W!.l!l ~ Qi bm Am2\lll1 l2i&m. Imli m llisbs. f.9..C! ~ ~ Au.di1 Description 

113243 Jan 29121 p 13 9,763.20 .00 l.123.20 8,640.00 .00 .00 .00 BSI017 
113243 Feb 22121 R 9,763.20- C 39005 Dodick Landau Inc. 
112665 Dec 16120 p 13 10,865.15 736.IO 1,249.0S 8,880.00 .00 .00 .00 8747007 
112665 Dec 22120 R 10,865.15- C284010 Dodick Landau Inc 

Totals 20,628.35 736.10 2,372.25 17,520.00 .00 .00 20,628.35· .00 

March 25. 2021 2:42 nm Wendv Orec:nsooon 

2 
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·1~1.:1 Garfinkle I Biderman :JL BARRISTERS & SOLICITORS 

DODICK LANDAU INC. 
4646 Dufferin Street 
Suite 6 
Toronto, Ontario, M3H 5$4 

Atte11ti011: Ra'111 Dt>dick 

In account with 

Our file #12574-001 

April 26, 2021 

RE: RECEIVERSHIP OF ZUCCARO PROPERTIES 

TO OUR FEE for all services rendered as per the attached print-out: 

OUR FEE HEREIN: 

H.S.T.x 13% 

DISBURSEMENTS: 

As per attached print-out 

H.S.T. x 13% 

Total Fees 
Total Disbursements 
Total H.S.T. 
Total Fees, Disbursements, H.S.T.: 

This is our Account Herein 

GARFINKLE BIDERMAN LLP 

\.VendyGreenspoon-Soer 

E.&O.E. 

Garfinkle Biderman LLP 
I Adeloidc Street East. Suite 801, Toronto, ON MSC 2V9 
Tel 1(416)869·1234 
Fax I (416) 869-0547 www.garfinlde.com 

HST# RI 19425791 

$6,937.50 

$901.88 

$Nil 

$Nil 

$6,937.50 
$Nil 

$901.88 
$7,839.38 

Pursuont to the Solicitors Act, interest at the rate of .8% will be chnrgcd on overdue 
accounts. 
When remitting please enclose the duplicate copy of this accounl 
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Da!C'~ Apr 26, 2021 Garfinkle, Biderman LLP 
Riiiing Jnformatinn Summ11rv lo Anr 26/21 reguc:slc:d b>' WHG 

Bill#: 

Clic:n1 
12574 DODICK LANDAU l~C. 

4646 DUFFERIN STREET 
SUITE6 
TORONTO ON M3H 5S4 
Client Lawyer. W.H. Gn:c:n~lJOOn 

Email: rahn.dodick@dodick.ca 

TIME SUMMARY 
Bill Average 

Value RJ!tt 

File Dale opened: No>'cmber 18, 2020 
12574001 RECEIVERSHIP OF ZUCCARO PROPERTIES 

(120 Litigalion. Levy) 
TAXABLE • Ontario 

Responsible: W.H. Grccnspoon 
Assigned: W.H. Grcc:nspoon 

1..a~1 Entered 
fu!!o' Hours 

En1ercd 
~ 

13 W.H. Grcc:nspoon 
Total unbilled lime 

11.IO 6937.50 62S.OO Apr23/21 
11.10 6937.so• 

11. I 0 6937.SO Billing Instructions 

HST on 6,937.SO @ 13% 

Total unbilled time & 1axes 

To1alTni1cs 
llST 

Total10Bill 

ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE 

901.88 

7839.38 

901.88 

7,839.38 

Tolal Ac:counL~ Receivable .00 

Transaction Levy Surcharge: Poslcd: 100.00 

BILLING HISTORY 

Last bill: Mar 26121 
Fees 10 dale: 
Timebillc:d: 
Variance: 

Oisbs billed: 

23,957.SO 
24.677.SO 

720.00-

736.IO 

QUOTED AMOUNTS 

l'ccs quoted: .00 

April 26, 2021 2:54 pm 

11.10 6937.SO • 

File: I 2S7400 I Bill Lawyer: 13WHG 

Bill l>:uc: Bill No: 

Bill up 10 Apr 26 2021 

Finni Periodic Interim Wrile Off 

D D D D 
Dill Amount s 
Disburscmc:nis Billed s 

Including Unpostc:d s 
Photocopies s 
Telephone: s 
Other s 

Fc:e Billed s 
Disbs raxable Tax on Disbs S 

Tax on Fees s 
To1al Tax s 

Lawyer Fee Credit s 
Lawyer Fee Credit s 
Lawyer Fee Credit s 
Lawyer Fee Credit s 

Panncrship Fee: Credit s 

Tram•fcr from Trus1 
10 pay account s 

Write Off 
Unbilled Disbursements s 
Unbillc:dTimc s 
Accoums Rc:ccivablc s 

Close File D 
Account Approvnl 

MonikaGugu 
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Oat<:: Apr26,2021 Garfinkle, Biderman LLP Page: 
Billing Stalemrnt to Aor 26121 requested by \VHG 

Bill#: 

Client File Date opened: November 18, 2020 
12574 DOOICK LANDAU INC. 12574001 RECEIVERSHIP OF ZUCCARO PROPERTIES 

4646 DUFFERIN STREET ( 120 Litigation - Levy) 
SUITE6 TAXABLE • Ontario 
TORONTO ON M3H 554 RC$J!Onsible: W.H. Grcc:nspoon 
Client uwyc:r: W.H. Green~")>OOn Assigned: W.H. Gn:cnspoon 

Email: rahn.dodick@dodick.ca 
UNBILLED TIME Bill 

Bill Bill Entc:rcd Entered Running 
Date Narrntjve ~ lli!!!G Value Hours Value &!!!ii I!l!!!.I 
Mar25121 E·Mail from Avery re: cottage rem IJWHG .JO 62.50 .10 62.50 53274 62.SO 
Mar2S/21 E·Mail from Rahn re: cottage rem IJWHG .IO 62.50 .10 62.50 53275 125.00 
Mar25/21 E·Mail from 31ld to DhaliWlll 13\VHG .10 62.50 .10 62.50 53292 187.SO 
Mar25/21 E-Mail to Medccino 13\VHG .10 62.50 .JO 62.SO 53293 250.00 
Mar25/21 E-M11il from Avery 13WHG .10 62.SO .10 62.50 53296 :m.so 
Mar2S/21 E-M11il to Avery I Assemble Denscley documcnL~ 13WHG .20 125.00 .20 125.00 53307 437.SO 
Mar 26121 Misccl11111cous email for and to Rahn I from Avi:ry n:: 13\VHG .20 125.00 .20 125.00 54004 562.SO 

properties 
Mar26121 E-Mail from Dhaliwal re: DSSignment 13\VHG .10 62.SO .10 62.50 54005 625.00 
Mar26121 E-Mail to client I From agenis re: nssigmm:nt 13WHG .JO 62.50 .10 62.50 54006 687.50 
Mar26/21 Meeting with Ruhn and Naomi re: mulliple issues 13\VHG 1.00 625.00 1.00 625.00 54007 1.312.SO 
Mar26121 Prcpl1rC notes of meeting IJWHG .20 125.00 .20 125.00 54008 1,437.50 
Mar26/21 E-Mail to Dhaliwal re: Court Order 13\VHG .10 62.50 .IO 62.50 54016 l,S00.00 
Mar 29121 E-Mail from agent I Revcw amendment 13\VHG .IO 62.50 .JO 62.50 55072 1,562.SO 
Mar 29121 E-Mail from agent I Review document 13\VHO .10 62.50 .10 62.50 55076 1,625.00 
Mar 29121 E-Mail from Rahn 13\VHG .10 62.SO .10 62.50 55077 1,687.50 
Mar 30121 E-Mail from Rahn 13\VHG .10 62.50 .10 62.50 56092 l,750.00 
Mar 30/21 Miscellaneous from R:ihn re: Avery I Response and email 13 WHO .20 J25.00 .20 125.00 56098 1,875.00 

from N:iomi 
Mar 30/2J Telephone Cnll 1'o Mendccino 13WHG .10 62.50 .10 62.SO 56099 1,937.50 
Mar30/21 Miscellaneous emails with Receiver re: pending sale 13\VHG .10 62.50 .JO 62.50 56100 2,000.00 
Mar 31121 E-Mail from Rahn re: Soony leucr IJWHG .10 62.50 .10 62.50 57028 2,062.50 
Mar31121 E-Mail from Avery I Order of Himel J. 13WHG .20 125.00 .20 125.00 57043 2,187.50 
Mar 3J/21 Prcp.1re NOA re: King nnd Collage I Email fmm nnd lo 13\VHG .30 187.SO .30 187.50 57044 2,375.00 

Naomi 
Mar 31121 Miscellaneous emails wi1h R11hn and prcp11rc draft lcncr to 13 WllG 1.00 625.00 1.00 625.00 57045 3,000.00 

Avery re: vnrious propcnics :ind dates 
AprOl/21 Revise Document: drJtl lener lo A very with updates I 13 WIJG .30 187.50 .30 187.SO 59018 3,187.50 

Email Receiver 
Apr 01/21 E-Mail from Rahn I Reivew revisions 13WHG .20 125.00 .20 125.00 59028 3,312.SO 
AprOl/21 E-M11il lo Avery 13WHG .10 62.50 .10 62.50 59029 3,375.00 
AprOS/21 E-Mail from and to Zeidman re: NOA 13WHO .10 62.50 .10 62.50 60008 3,437.SO 
Apr05/21 E-Mailfrom Zeidman with NOA revisions 13\VHO .10 62.50 .10 62.50 60009 3,S00.00 
AprOS/21 E-Mail from Avery 13WHG .10 62.50 .10 62.50 60028 3,562.SO 
Apr 05121 E-Mail from and to Rahn 13\VHG .10 62.50 .IO 62.SO 60031 J,<125.00 
Apr06l21 Telephone Call To Ruhn I Re: conference J3WHG .10 62.50 .Ill 62.50 61047 3,687.SO 
Apr 06121 E-Mail to Avery re: conference c;ill 13\VHG .10 62.SO .IO 62.50 61048 3,7511,()(J 
Apr07/21 E-Mail from and to Avery 13\VHG .10 62.50 .10 62.511 620J2 3,812.50 
Apr07/21 E-Mail from Rahn 13\VHG .10 62.SO .10 62.50 62016 3,875.00 
Apr07/21 E-Mail from Rahn re: HMO 13\VHG .10 62.50 .10 62.50 62038 3,937.50 
Apr 13121 Miscellaneous emails with Jasmeet and Ralut 13\VHG .20 125.00 .20 125.00 66045 4,062.50 
Apr 13121 E-Mail to Avery IJWHO .10 62.50 .JO 62.50 66050 4,125.00 
Apr 13121 Prepare vesting order and Receiver's Ccn. 13\VHG .so 312.50 .so 312.50 66051 4,437.50 
Apr 14121 Miscellaneous emails with Avery and Rahn re: sale J3WHG .20 125.00 .20 125.00 67007 4,562.50 
Apr 14121 Telephone Call To Jasmcet re: vesting Order motion 13 WllG .30 187.SO .30 187.50 67008 4,750.00 
Apr 14121 Telephone Call From Rahn re : Vesting Order motion 13 WHO .20 125.00 .20 125.00 67011 4,875.00 
Apr 14121 Misccll:mcou.~: Zoom meeting with Receiver and Avery IJWHO 1.10 687.50 1.10 687.50 67023 5.562.50 
Apr 14121 Telephone Call To Apex Propcny Management 13 WHG .10 62.50 .JO 62.50 67024 5,625.00 
Apr 14121 E-Mail to Receiver udn Apex 13 WHG .JO 62.50 .10 62.50 67025 5,687.SO 
Apr 14121 Prcpan: Draft letter to Hamey 13 WllG .30 187.50 .30 187.50 67030 5,875.00 
Apr 14121 E-Mail 10 Rahn re: comm. list permission 13\VHG .JO 62.50 .10 62.50 67031 5,937.SO 
Apr 15121 Miscellaneous emails - Rohn and Avery 13\VHG .10 62.SO .10 62.50 68016 6,000.00 
Apr 15121 E-Mail from Rahn to Apex 13 \VHG .10 62.50 .10 62.50 68019 6,062.50 
Apr 15121 E-Mail from Rahn re: King occupancy 13 WHG .10 62.SO .10 62.50 68023 6,12.S.OO 
Apr 15121 E-Mail from Receiver I Email to Comm. Coun 13\VHO .JO 62.50 .10 62.50 68039 6,187.50 
Apr 15121 E-Mail to Avery and Rahn re:Court App. 13 WHG .10 62.50 .10 62.50 68040 6,250.00 
Apr 19121 E-Mail from R:thn re: Avery's motion IJWHG .10 62.50 .JO 62.SO 70015 6,312.50 
Apr 19121 E-Mail from Commercial Court I To Receiver 13WHG .Ill 62.50 .10 62.50 70026 6,375.00 
Apr 19/21 E-Moil to Rahn re: Reponing IJWHO .10 62.50 .10 62.50 70027 6,437.50 
Apr 19121 E-Mail from and to Rahn re: repons 13WHG .10 62.50 .10 62.50 70032 6,500.00 
Apr21121 E-Mail from Comm. Coun IJWHO .IO 62.50 .10 62.50 72022 6,562.50 
Apr21121 E-Mail to Rahn re: motion for V.O. 13 WHO .JO 62.50 .10 62.SO 72023 6,625.00 
Apr21121 E-Mail 10 Jasmcet re: motion for V.O. 13 WHG .JO 62.50 .10 62.50 72024 6,687.50 
Apr 21/21 E-Mail to Avery re: molion for V.O. 13 WHO .JO 62.50 .JO 62.SO 72025 6,750.00 
Apr21/21 E-Mail from and IO Jasmect J3 \VHG . UI 62.50 .10 62.50 72026 6,812.50 
Apr 23121 E-Mail from Avery n:: Application 13\VHG .IO 62.50 .IO 62.50 74210 6,875.00 
Apr 23121 E-Mail from Rahn I Update to agents 13\VHO .10 62.50 .IO 62.SO 74213 (1,937 . .SO 

April 26, 2021 2:54 pm Mo11ik11G11gu 
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Garfinkle, Biderman LI..P Dal:;. Apr 26, 2021 
Bllllng Sta!rmrnt lo Apr 26121 rrgues!ed by WHG 

Bil!ll: 

Client 
12574 DODICK LANDAU INC. 

4646 DUFFERIN STREET 
SUITE6 
TORONTO ON M3H 584 
Clicm Lawyer: W.H. Gn:cnspoon 

Email: r.ihn.dodick@dodick.ca 
UNBILl.ED 1'1ME 

~ ~ 

Total unbilled time 

l'ilc Dale upe11cd: November I 8, 2020 
12574001 RECEIVERSHIP OF ZUCCARO PROPERTIES 

(I 20 Litigatiun • Levy) 
TAXABLE • Oniario 

f(c.~ponsiblc: W.H. Grccn.~poon 
Assigned: W.H. Gn.-cnspoon 

Bill Bill Entered Entered 
~ Hours Value Hours Value Audit 

I 1.10 6,937.SO I 1.10 6,937.SO 

Bill 
Running 

Total 

HST on 6,937.50 @ 13% 901.88 

Total unbilled Time & Taxes 7,839.38 

TIME SUMMARY 

Bill Bill Entered Entered Last 
1mmr Hour.1 B.!lli:ll:l.r Value llim!:! Yilh!s Entrv 
W.H. Gn:'-'11Spoon 11.10 @ 625.00 ,., 6,937.50 11.10 6,937.511 Apr24 2021 

ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE 

Orig.Bill Billed Billed Billed Unpaid Unpaid Received Prom/ 
llil!1l !2i!.l!: QI~ Aml.l.!!.!!! Qllil!!. Tnxc~ m ~ F1.-es ~ ~ Audit Descrin1im1 

I 14162 Mar 2<1/2 I r 13 7,274.38 .oo 836.88 6,437.SO .00 .00 .00 B17901 I 
114162 Apr06121 R 7,274.38- C 72004 Dodick Landau Inc 
113243 Jun 2912 I p 13 9,763.20 .00 1,123.20 8.640.00 .00 .00 .OU B 51017 
I IJ243 Feb22/21 R 9,763.20- C 39005 Dodick L:indau Inc. 
I 12665 Dec I 6120 p 13 10,865.IS 736.10 1,249.0S 8,880.00 .00 .00 .00 B747007 
112665 Dec 22120 R J0,865.15· C284010 Dodick Landau Inc 

Toials 27,902.73 736.10 3,209.13 23,957.SO .00 .00 27,902.73· .00 

April 26, 2021 2:54 pm MonikaGugu 
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Court File No.  CV-21-00661928 -00CL

ONTARIO 

SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

THE HONOURABLE 

JUSTICE 

) 

) 

) 

, THE 

DAY OF   MAY, 2021 

B E T W E E N: 

DODICK LANDAU INC. 

Applicant 

and 

FRANK ZUCCARO, 863704 ONTARIO LIMITED, METROPOLITAN ICE CREAM INC. 

AND ORACCUZ HOLDING LTD. 

Respondents 

APPLICATION UNDER SUBSECTION 249 and 250(1) OF THE BANKRUPTCY AND 

INSOLVENCY ACT, R.S.C. 1985, c. B-3, AS AMENDED AND RULES 14.05(2)AND (3)(g) 

AND 41 OF THE RULES OF CIVIL PROCEDURE, R.R.O. 1990  

APPROVAL AND VESTING ORDER 

THIS MOTION, made by Dodick Landau Inc. in its capacity as the Court-appointed 

receiver (the "Receiver") of the undertaking, property and assets of Frank Zuccaro, 863704 

Ontario Limited, Metropolitan Ice Cream Inc. and Oraccuz Holding Ltd. (the "Debtors") for an 

order approving the sale transaction (the "Transaction") contemplated by an Agreement of 

Purchase and Sale (the "Sale Agreement") between the Receiver and Ashiana Capital 

Corporation (the "Purchaser") dated March 5, 2021 and amended March 29, 2021 and appended 

to the Report of the Receiver dated May    , 2021 (the "Report"), and vesting in the Purchaser the 
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Debtor’s right, title and interest in and to the assets described in the Sale Agreement (the 

"Purchased Assets"), was heard this day at 330 University Avenue, Toronto, Ontario. 

ON READING the Report and on hearing the submissions of counsel for the Receiver, 

and on the consent of Maria Zuccaro, the Added Respondents to the Family Court Proceedings, 

Giuseppe Zuccaro, Vito Antonio Zuccaro and Filomena Zuccaro, no one appearing for the 

Respondents, although properly served as appears from the affidavit of Ilona Hrubrant sworn 

May      filed:  

1. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DECLARES that the Transaction is hereby approved, and

the execution of the Sale Agreement by the Receiver is hereby authorized and approved, with 

such minor amendments as the Receiver may deem necessary. The Receiver is hereby authorized 

and directed to take such additional steps and execute such additional documents as may be 

necessary or desirable for the completion of the Transaction and for the conveyance of the 

Purchased Assets to the Purchaser. 

2. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DECLARES that upon the delivery of a Receiver’s

certificate to the Purchaser substantially in the form attached as Schedule A hereto (the 

"Receiver's Certificate"), all of the Debtor's right, title and interest in and to the Purchased Assets 

described in the Sale Agreement [and listed on Schedule B hereto] shall vest absolutely in the 

Purchaser, free and clear of and from any and all security interests (whether contractual, 

statutory, or otherwise), hypothecs, mortgages, trusts or deemed trusts (whether contractual, 

statutory, or otherwise), liens, executions, levies, charges, or other financial or monetary claims, 

whether or not they have attached or been perfected, registered or filed and whether secured, 

unsecured or otherwise (collectively, the "Claims") including, without limiting the generality of 

the foregoing:  (i) any encumbrances or charges created by the Order of the Honourable Justice 

Douglas dated November17, 2020  (ii) all charges, security interests or claims evidenced by 

registrations pursuant to the Personal Property Security Act (Ontario) or any other personal 

property registry system; (iii) any claims of Maria Zuccaro, Giuseppe Zuccaro, Vito Antonio 

Zuccaro, and Filomena Zuccaro arising in proceedings in the Newmarket Superior Court of 

Justice in Court File No. FC-19-0058934-0000, including without limitation those based on an 

unequal distribution of matrimonial assets, disputed ownership interests and or claims based on 

principles of constructive trust or resulting trust; and (iv) those Claims listed on Schedule C 
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hereto (all of which are collectively referred to as the "Encumbrances", which term shall not 

include the permitted encumbrances, easements and restrictive covenants listed on Schedule D) 

and, for greater certainty, this Court orders that all of the Encumbrances affecting or relating to 

the Purchased Assets are hereby expunged and discharged as against the Purchased Assets. 

3. THIS COURT ORDERS that upon the registration in the Land Registry Office for the

Land Titles Division of Toronto No. 66 of an Application for Vesting Order in the form 

prescribed by the Land Titles Act and/or the Land Registration Reform Act], the Land Registrar is 

hereby directed to enter the Purchaser as the owner of the subject real property identified in 

Schedule B hereto (the “Real Property”) in fee simple, and is hereby directed to delete and 

expunge from title to the Real Property all of the Claims listed in Schedule C hereto. 

4. THIS COURT ORDERS that for the purposes of determining the nature and priority of

Claims, the net proceeds from the sale of the Purchased Assets shall stand in the place and stead 

of the Purchased Assets, and that from and after the delivery of the Receiver's Certificate all 

Claims and Encumbrances shall attach to the net proceeds from the sale of the Purchased Assets 

with the same priority as they had with respect to the Purchased Assets immediately prior to the 

sale, as if the Purchased Assets had not been sold and remained in the possession or control of 

the person having that possession or control immediately prior to the sale. 

5. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DIRECTS the Receiver to file with the Court a copy of

the Receiver's Certificate, forthwith after delivery thereof. 

6. THIS COURT ORDERS that, notwithstanding:

(a) the pendency of these proceedings; 

(b) any applications for a bankruptcy order now or hereafter issued pursuant to the 

Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act (Canada) in respect of the Debtor and any 

bankruptcy order issued pursuant to any such applications; and 

(c) any assignment in bankruptcy made in respect of the Debtor; 
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the vesting of the Purchased Assets in the Purchaser pursuant to this Order shall be binding on 

any trustee in bankruptcy that may be appointed in respect of the Debtor and shall not be void or 

voidable by creditors of the Debtor, nor shall it constitute nor be deemed to be a fraudulent 

preference, assignment, fraudulent conveyance, transfer at undervalue, or other reviewable 

transaction under the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act (Canada) or any other applicable federal or 

provincial legislation, nor shall it constitute oppressive or unfairly prejudicial conduct pursuant 

to any applicable federal or provincial legislation. 

7. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DECLARES that the Transaction is exempt from the

application of the Bulk Sales Act (Ontario). 

8. THIS COURT HEREBY REQUESTS the aid and recognition of any court, tribunal,

regulatory or administrative body having jurisdiction in Canada or in the United States to give 

effect to this Order and to assist the Receiver and its agents in carrying out the terms of this 

Order.  All courts, tribunals, regulatory and administrative bodies are hereby respectfully 

requested to make such orders and to provide such assistance to the Receiver, as an officer of this 

Court, as may be necessary or desirable to give effect to this Order or to assist the Receiver and 

its agents in carrying out the terms of this Order. 

____________________________________ 
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Schedule A – Form of Receiver’s Certificate 

Court File No. CV-21-00661928-00CL

ONTARIO 

SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

B E T W E E N: 

DODICK LANDAU INC. 

Applicant 

and 

FRANK ZUCCARO, 863704 ONTARIO LIMITED, METROPOLITAN ICE CREAM INC. 

AND ORACCUZ HOLDING LTD. 

Respondents 

APPLICATION UNDER SUBSECTION 249 and 250(1) OF THE BANKRUPTCY AND 

INSOLVENCY ACT, R.S.C. 1985, c. B-3, AS AMENDED AND RULES 14.05(2)AND (3)(g) 

AND 41 OF THE RULES OF CIVIL PROCEDURE, R.R.O. 1990  

RECEIVER’S CERTIFICATE 

RECITALS 

A. Pursuant to an Order of the Honourable Justice P.A. Douglas of the Ontario Superior 

Court of Justice (the "Court") dated November 17, 2020, Dodick Landau Inc. was appointed as 

the receiver (the "Receiver") of the undertaking, property and assets of Frank Zuccaro, 863704 

Ontario Limited, Metropolitan Ice Cream Inc. and Oraccuz Holding Ltd. (the “Debtor”).  

B. Pursuant to an Order of the Court dated May      , 2021, the Court approved the agreement 

of purchase and sale made as of March 5, 2021 and amended March 29, 2021 (the "Sale 

Agreement") between the Receiver and Ashiana Capital Corporation (the "Purchaser") and 

provided for the vesting in the Purchaser of the Debtor’s right, title and interest in and to the 

Purchased Assets, which vesting is to be effective with respect to the Purchased Assets upon the 

delivery by the Receiver to the Purchaser of a certificate confirming (i) the payment by the 

Purchaser of the Purchase Price for the Purchased Assets; (ii) that the conditions to Closing as set 
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out in the Sale Agreement have been satisfied or waived by the Receiver and the Purchaser; and 

(iii) the Transaction has been completed to the satisfaction of the Receiver. 

C. Unless otherwise indicated herein, terms with initial capitals have the meanings set out in 

the Sale Agreement. 

THE RECEIVER CERTIFIES the following: 

1. The Purchaser has paid and the Receiver has received the Purchase Price for the

Purchased Assets payable on the Closing Date pursuant to the Sale Agreement; 

2. The conditions to Closing as set out in the Sale Agreement have been satisfied or waived

by the Receiver and the Purchaser; and 

3. The Transaction has been completed to the satisfaction of the Receiver.

4. This Certificate was delivered by the Receiver at _________ [TIME] on _______

[DATE]. 

DODICK LANDAU INC., in its capacity as 

Receiver of the undertaking, property and 

assets of Frank Zuccaro, 863704 Ontario 

Limited, Metropolitan Ice Cream Inc. and 

Oraccuz Holding Ltd., and not in its personal 

capacity 

Per: 

Name: Rahn Dodick 

Title: President 
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Schedule B – Purchased Assets 

PIN         10338-0104 (LT) 

LT 4 PL 4325 North York; TORONTO (N YORK), CITY OF TORONTO 

And municipally known as 76 Densley Avenue, Toronto, Ontario 
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Schedule C – Claims to be deleted and expunged from title to Real Property 

INSTRUMENT DATE INSTRUMENT TYPE IN FAVOUR OF 

AT5036925 2018/12/18 CHARGE EQUITABLE BANK 

AT5036926 2018/12/18 ASSIGNMENT OF RENTS  EQUITABLE BANK 

AT5149081 2019/05/3` NOTICE OF LEASE DISTRICT VENTURES 

       KITCHEN 

AT5500851 2020/08/21 APL (GENERAL)-CPL MARIA ZUCCARO 

AT5575277 2020/11/18 APL COURT ORDER DODICK LANDAU INC. 

AT5579428 2020/11/24 POSTPONEMENT DODICK LANDAU INC. 

189



DOCSTOR: 1201927\14 

Schedule D – Permitted Encumbrances, Easements and Restrictive Covenants 

related to the Real Property  

(unaffected by the Vesting Order) 
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Respondents 
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APPLICATION UNDER SUBSECTION 249 and 250(1) 

OF THE BANKRUPTCY AND INSOLVENCY ACT, R.S.C. 
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(3)(g) AND 41 OF THE RULES OF CIVIL PROCEDURE, 

R.R.O. 1990  
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APPROVAL AND VESTING ORDER
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Barristers & Solicitors 
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File Number: 12574-001 
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Court File No.      CV-21-00661928-00CL
ONTARIO 

SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

THE HONOURABLE 

JUSTICE 

) 

) 

) 

, THE 

DAY OF        , 2021 

B E T W E E N: 

DODICK LANDAU INC. 

Applicant 

-And- 

FRANK ZUCCARO, 863704 ONTARIO LIMITED, METROPOLITAN ICE CREAM INC. 

AND ORACCUZ HOLDING LTD. 

Respondents 

APPLICATION UNDER SUBSECTION 249 and 250(1) OF THE BANKRUPTCY AND 

INSOLVENCY ACT, R.S.C. 1985, c. B-3, AS AMENDED AND RULES 14.05(2) AND (3)(g) 

AND 41 OF THE RULES OF CIVIL PROCEDURE, R.R.O. 1990 

ORDER 
(APPROVING THE RECEIVER’S ACTIVITIES AND FEES 

and APPROVING DISTRIBUTIONS) 

THIS MOTION, made by Dodick Landau Inc. in its capacity as the Court-appointed 

Receiver (the "Receiver") without security, of the assets, undertakings and property of Frank 

Zuccaro, 863704 Ontario Limited, Metropolitan Ice Cream Inc. and Oraccuz Holding Ltd. (the 

"Debtor") for an order, inter alia, approving the Receiver’s activities as defined in the First Report 

of the Receiver dated May    , 2021 (the "Receiver’s First Report") and for an Order approving the 

fees of the Receiver and its counsel, and approving the distributions proposed in the Receiver’s First 

Report and for an Order sealing the Confidential Appendices to the Receiver’s First Report was 

heard this day by video conference due to the Covid-19 crisis. 
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ON READING the Receiver’s First Report, the Fee Affidavit of Rahn Dodick, sworn May     

____, 2021, the Fee Affidavit of Alexander Hora sworn May ___, 2021 and on hearing the 

submissions of counsel for the Receiver, and all other parties listed on the Counsel Slip, no one else 

appearing for any other person, although all parties appearing on the Service List in this proceeding 

were duly served as it appears from the Affidavit of Service of Ilona Hrubant sworn on ________, 

2021:  

1. THIS COURT ORDERS that service of the Notice of Motion and the Motion Record

including the Receiver’s First Report is hereby validated so that this Motion is properly returnable 

today and hereby dispenses with further service thereof. All capitalized terms used herein and not 

otherwise defined are as defined in the Receiver’s Second Report.  

APPROVAL OF ACTIVITIES & FEES 

2. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DECLARES that the Receiver’s First Report and all of the

activities of the Receiver described therein are hereby ratified and approved. 

3. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DECLARES that the fees and disbursements of the Receiver

and its counsel, as set out in the fee affidavits of Rahn Dodick, sworn May ___, 2021 and of 

Alexander Hora, sworn May    , 2021, are hereby approved, and the Receiver is authorized and 

directed to pay all such fees which remain unpaid at this time.  

DISTRIBUTION 

4. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver be and hereby is authorized to distribute to

Equitable Bank the sum of $1,691,685.77, together with such additional amounts as may be owing 

as at the date of distribution.  

5. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver be and hereby is authorized to distribute to

Hillmount Capital Inc. the sum of $265,624.80 together with such additional amounts as may be 

owing as at the date of distribution. 
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6. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver be and is hereby authorized to distribute the sum

of $70,001.67 to Maria Zuccaro together with interest accrued thereon to the date of distribution. 

7. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver be and is hereby authorized to distribute the sum

of $24,000.00 to Maria Zuccaro together with interest accrued thereon to the date of distribution. 

8. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver is hereby authorized to distribute Ongoing

Spousal Payments to Maria Zuccaro for the period beginning September 24, 2020 until such time as 

a further order is made directing the Receiver to distribute the remaining Densley Sale Proceeds or 

until there are insufficient funds in the Receivership to continue to make such payments. 

GENERAL 

9. THIS COURT ORDERS that Confidential Appendices 1-__, inclusive, to the Receiver’s

First Report shall be, and are, hereby sealed, kept confidential and shall not form part of the public 

record pending further Order of this Court. 

10. THIS COURT HEREBY REQUESTS the aid and recognition of any court, tribunal,

regulatory or administrative body having jurisdiction in Canada to give effect to this Order and to 

assist the Receiver and its agents in carrying out the terms of this Order. All courts, tribunals, 

regulatory and administrative bodies are hereby respectfully requested to make such orders and to 

provide such assistance to the Receiver, as an officer of this Court, as may be necessary or desirable 

to give effect to this Order or to assist the Receiver and its agents in carrying out the terms of this 

Order.  

11. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver be at liberty and is hereby authorized and

empowered to apply to any court, tribunal, regulatory or administrative body, wherever located, for 

the recognition of this Order and for assistance in carrying out the terms of this Order, and that the 

Receiver is authorized and empowered to act as a representative in respect of the within proceedings 

for the purpose of having these proceedings recognized in a jurisdiction outside Canada.  

12. THIS COURT ORDERS that this Order is effective from the date that it is made and is

enforceable without any need for entry and filing. 
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13. THIS COURT ORDERS that the E-Service Guide of the Commercial List (the “Guide”) is

approved and adopted by reference herein and, in this proceeding, the service of documents made in 

accordance with the Guide (which can be found on the Commercial List website at: 

www.ontariocourts.ca/scj/practice/practice-directions/toronto/eservice-commercial/) shall be valid 

and effective service.  

196



1 

DODICK LANDAU INC. 

Applicant 
and 

FRANK ZUCCARO. et al. 

Respondents 
Court File No. CV-21-00661928-00CL

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 
APPLICATION UNDER SUBSECTION 249 and 250(1) 

OF THE BANKRUPTCY AND INSOLVENCY ACT, R.S.C. 

1985, c. B-3, AS AMENDED AND RULES 14.05(2)AND 

(3)(g) AND 41 OF THE RULES OF CIVIL PROCEDURE, 

R.R.O. 1990  

Proceeding commenced at Toronto 

ORDER 

(APPROVING THE RECEIVER’S 

ACTIVITIES AND FEES and APPROVING 

DISTRIBUTIONS) 

GARFINKLE BIDERMAN LLP 

Barristers & Solicitors 

1 Adelaide Street East, Suite 801 

Toronto, Ontario 

M5C 2V9 

Wendy Greenspoon-Soer   LSO#: 34698L 

Tel: 416-869-1234 

Fax: 416-869-0547 

Email: wgreenspoon@garfinkle.com 

Lawyers for the Applicant, 

DODICK LANDAU INC. 

File Number: 12574-001 

197



 
 

DODICK LANDAU INC. 
Applicant and FRANK ZUCCARO. et al. 

Respondents Court File No. CV-21-00661928-00CL 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 
APPLICATION UNDER SUBSECTION 249 and 250(1) OF THE 
BANKRUPTCY AND INSOLVENCY ACT, R.S.C. 1985, c. B-3, AS 
AMENDED AND RULES 14.05(2)AND (3)(g) AND 41 OF THE 

RULES OF CIVIL PROCEDURE, R.R.O. 1990  

Proceeding commenced at Toronto 

MOTION RECORD 
APPROVAL AND VESTING ORDER, APPROVE 
RECEIVER’S ACTIVITES AND FEES, APPROVE 

DISTRIBUTION) 
(MOTION RETURNABLE ____, 2021) 

GARFINKLE BIDERMAN LLP 
Barristers & Solicitors 
1 Adelaide Street East, Suite 801 
Toronto, Ontario, M5C 2V9 

Wendy Greenspoon-Soer   LSUC#: 34698L 
Tel: 416-869-1234 
Fax: 416-869-0547 

Lawyers for the Applicant, 
DODICK LANDAU INC. 

File Number: 12574-001 

198


	Schedule A
	Index
	Tab 1 - Notice of Motion
	Tab 2 - 1st Report to Court
	Appendix A -Receivership Order
	Appendix B - Densley APS
	Appendix C - October 2020 Order
	Appendix D - CBRE's Marketing brochure
	Appendix E - draft payout statement
	Appendix F -draft payout statement
	Appendix G - March 2020 Order
	Appendix H - August 2020 Order
	Appendix I - summary of outstanding spousal payments
	Appendix J - Reciever's interim statement of reciepts and Disbursements
	Appendix K/Tab A- Affidavit of Rahn Dodick
	Exhibit A- 
	Appendix L/Tab B-Affidavit of Alexander Hora
	Exhibit A-
	Tab 3- Draft Vesting Order
	Tab 4 - Draft Approval Order
	Affidavits - Rahn Dodick-2 for insertion-signed.pdf
	1. I am the president of Dodick Landau Inc., the Receiver and Applicant in the within proceedings and, as such have knowledge of the matters to which I hereinafter depose.
	2. Pursuant to an Order of the Honourable Mr. Justice P.A. Douglas dated November 17, 2020, (the “Receivership Order”) Dodick Landau Inc. was appointed as Receiver (the “Receiver”) of the assets, undertakings and property of the Respondents.
	3. The details of the Receiver’s Activities are set out in the Receiver’s First Report to the Court.
	4. For the period October 28, 2020 to May 5, 2021 the Receiver’s accounts amount to $139,622.05 in fees, plus disbursements of $8,031.63 and $19,194,.98 of HST for a total amount of $166,748.65. A copy of the accounts rendered in these proceedings by ...
	5. To the best of my knowledge, the rates charged by the Receiver throughout the course of these proceedings are comparable to the rates charged by other accounting firms in the greater Toronto area for the provision of similar services.
	6. I verily believe that the Receiver’s accounts are fair and reasonable in the circumstances.
	7. I make this Affidavit in support of a motion for an Order approving the Receiver’s fees and disbursements and for no other or improper purpose.




